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Jeff May

From: Keith Self Judge

Sent:  Monday, June 29, 2009 5:38 PM
To: Stacey Kemp

Cc: Jeff May

Subject: RE: \Users\stacey2\AppData\Local\Microsoft\Windows\Temporary Internet
Files\Content.Outlook\0226M77J\FIDLAR_COLLIN_CO_PFA_PROP_6_29_09 transfer money for
project

Stacey, | understand that this product was on your plan submitted earlier and that it will be purchased with funds
under your control for this designated purpose.

Approved.
As you said, please place on court agenda for ratification.
Sincerely,

Keith Self
County Judge
Collin County

From: Stacey Kemp

Sent: Mon 6/29/2009 5:19 PM

To: Keith Self Judge

Cc: Jeff May

Subject: FW: \Users\stacey2\AppData\Local\Microsoft\Windows\Temporary Internet
Files\Content.Outlook\0226M77J\FIDLAR_COLLIN_CO_PFA_PROP_6_29_09 transfer money for project

Judge Self,

See the attached proposal and corresponding emails from budget. | would like to request a pre-approval of a
budget amendment below to later be ratified by commissioner court. By creating the purchase order now the

county will save approximately $2000.00. Fidlar Technologies (Property Fraud Alert) has extended the offer

which expired on June 8™

I believe this is a good product and just was implemented in Tarrant County. This will be no cost to the
taxpayers as this money will come from document preservation funds 025. | have talked with all the players in
the group such as IT, purchasing & budget all on board with this project. | am asking now for your blessing. If
you approve please contact myself and Jeff in budget so we can expedite this. Thanks,

Stacey Kemp

Collin County Clerk

200 S. McDonald From: Stacey Kemp

Annex "A" Suite 120 Sent: Monday, June 29, 2009 5:00 PM
McKinney, Texas 75069 To: Stacey Kemp

072.548.4139 Subject: FW: \Users\stacey2

\AppData\Local\Microsoft\Windows\Temporary

7/1/2009
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skemp@collincountytexas.gov Internet
WWW.CO]hHCOUHtVtCX&S.g_Q_Y Files\Content.Outlook\0226M77J\FIDLAR_COLLIN_CO_

transfer money for project

Stacey Kemp
Collin County Clerk
200 S. McDonald From: Stacey Kemp
Annex "A" Suite 120 Sent: Monday, June 29, 2009 3:02 PM
McKinney, Texas 75069 '£°= -:/?fthlaY i

c: Michalyn Rains
9122'54%41“;19. Subject: C:\Users\stacey2
skempcollincountytexas.gov \AppData\Local\Microsoft\Windows\Temporary
www.collincountytexas.gov Internet

Files\Content.Outlook\0226M77J\FIDLAR _COLLIN_CO_PFA_PROP_6_29_09 transfer money for project

Jeff,

See the attached document for the property fraud software. | would like to request that $30,000.00 be
transferred from 025-0840-411-6401(consultants) to 025-0840-411-9040. Please let me know when you have
transferred the funds and received a project # from the auditor’s office. | would like to get this req in today. If
you need any additional information please let me know.

Thank you for all your help.

Sincerely,

Stacey Kemp
Collin County Clerk

214-548-4139

skemp@co.collin.tx.us

7/1/2009



