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From: Rendy Box

Sent:  Friday, August 14, 2009 3:06 PM
To: Carol Magers

Cc: Michalyn Rains

Subject: RE: pro lite +

Carot and Michalyn,

| did verify the price and it is $1200.00 plus shipping charge of $29.00.

Valery Rice was not in but | did speak to Jenny Coughenour.

Thanks, Ren

From: Carol Magers

Sent: Thursday, August 13, 2009 4:43 PM
To: Rendy Box

Cc: Michalyn Rains

Subject: FW: pro lite +

Rendy, can you please verify this pricing for Mic and let her know? Thanks,

Carnel Magers
Carol Magers

Buyer Manager

Collin County Purchasing
(972)548-4119
(972)548-4694 - fax
cmagers@co.collintx.us

Life isn't about walting for the storm to pass....
It's about learning to dance in the raint

From: Michalyn Rains

Sent; Thursday, August 13, 2009 4:36 PM
To: Carol Magers

Subject: FW: pro lite +

Can you have someone please verify this price? Thanks.

8/14/2009
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From: Lonnie Simmons

Sent: Thursday, August 13, 2009 4:32 PM

To: Michalyn Rains

Cc: Nicole Gillespie; Teresa Moore; Chuck Presley
Subject: FW: pro lite +

Michalyn,
| spoke with Nicole about transferring budget funds to purchase a radar unit. Attached is the information
on the radar unit. Per the e-mail from their rep., the unit is $1200.
We will be trying to transfer funds from Skip Tracing line item (001556506426422) of $1,000 and Printed
Materials line item (00155506426562) of $217.71 to Extraordinary patrol Supplies (001565506426219).
if you need other information, please let me know.
Thanks, | appreciate your help...
Lonnie
X3073
Constable Chuck Presley’s Office

From: Kristoffer Craft

Sent: Tuesday, August 11, 2009 3:12 PM
To: Lonnie Simmons

Subject: FW: pro lite +

From: Rice, Valery [mailto:vrice@kustomsignals.com]
Sent: Tuesday, August 11, 2009 11:20 AM

To: Kristoffer Craft

Subject: RE: pro lite +

HI Kris-

A CPO ( Certified Pre-Owned ) unit- ProLite + laser is $1200. You are receiving the brochure that should answer
any general questions that you make have and it has pictures, too.

I will call you to follow -up and make sure you have all the information you need.

Valery Rice

"A Desire to Serve with a Grateful Heart"
1-800-458-7866 Ext. 3051
vrice@kustomsignals.com

From: Kristoffer Craft [mailto:kcraft@co.collin.tx.us]
Sent: Tuesday, August 11, 2009 9:18 AM

To: Rice, Valery

Subject: pro lite +

Valery-

8/14/2009
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| got your msg the other day on the laser. That’s to bad he couldn't get it under $1000. | talked to my
supervisor and he asked me to get an itemized quote from you on the unit(pro lite +). We possibly could do a
budget amendment. | need it descriptive so we can submit it to the commissioners. If you could get that to me
asap, that would be great. I'm going to meet with wal-mart today, to see if they have any more community grant
money left over. Thanks you for all your work. | tried to leave a vim for you, but your inbox was full.

Deputy Craft
Collin County Constable Pct.3

972-881-3076

NOTICE: This message contains confidential information and is intended only for the individual named. If you are not the named addressee you should not
disseminate, distribute or copy this e-mail. Please notify the sender immediately by e-mail if you have received this e-maii by mistake and delete this e-mail from your
system, E-mail transmission cannot be guaranteed to be sccure or error-free as information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost, destroyed, arrive late or incomplete, or
contain viruses. The sender therefore does not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the contents of this message, which arise as a result of e-mail transmission.
If verification is required please request a hard-copy version.
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