
Bid #03447-09 SUPPLIES: JAIL AND PERSONAL INMATE
Lot: SECTION#1: BEDDING AND TOWELS

Item # Item Qty Unit Annual Usage Price Total Notes BRAND BID Prod CodePrice Total Notes BRAND BITHREAD C
03447-09-1-01 BLANKETS:BED 66 X 90 (Not awarding this line item) 1 each 800 Tabb 5.15$        5.15$       Tabb
03447-09-1-02 MATTRESS COVER:35"X73"X4" 1 each 144
03447-09-1-03 PILLOW CASES 1 dozen 60 6.80$        6.80$       Tabb T130
03447-09-1-04 SHEETS:FLAT 66"X 104" 1 dozen 48 27.10$      27.10$      Tabb T130

03447-09-1-05 MATTRESS:25" X 72 X4" 1 each 100 115.45$   115.45$   

Made to 
Order 

Mattresses Security First
03447-09-1-06 MATTRESS:35" X 73" X4" 1 each 50 130.64$   130.64$   Security First
03447-09-1-07 PILLOWS:17" X 25" 1 each 24 32.21$     32.21$     Security First
03447-09-1-08 TOWELS:BATH TURKISH WHITE 20" X 40" 1 dozen 3,600 6.69$        6.69$       Tabb
03447-09-1-09 TOWELS:BATH TURKISH LIGHT GRAY 20" X 40" 1 dozen 12 120.00$    120.00$    Tabb
03447-09-1-10 WASH CLOTHS: WHITE 12" x 12" 1 dozen 240 1.40$        1.40$       Tabb
03447-09-1-11 SUICIDE BLANKET:54" X 80" 1 each 15
03447-09-1-12 MATTRESS COVER: 25" x 72" x 4" 1 each 840
03447-09-1-13 BLANKET:BED 62'' x 80'' (Not awarding this line item) 1 each 5.35$        5.35$       Tabb
03447-09-1-14 BLANKET:BED 62'' x 80'' 1 case 108 64.20$      64.20$      Tabb
03447-09-1-15 BLANKET:BED 66" x 90" 1 case 800 61.80$      61.80$      Tabb
03447-09-1-16 MATTRESS COVER:25" x 72" x 4" 1 dozen 840
03447-09-1-17 MATTRESS COVER:35" x 73" x4" 1 dozen 1440

298.49$    

LOT DRAW Line 03447-09-1-10

Vinyl Products Mfg Inc Tabb Textile Co. Inc.



Bid #03447-09 SUPPLIES: JAIL AND PERSONAL INMATE
Lot: SECTION#1: BEDDING AND TOWELS

Amercare 
Products 

Inc.
Uniforms 
Manufacturing

Item # Item Prod CodePrice Total Notes Price Price Prod CodePrice Total Notes BRAND BIDTHREAD CPrice Total Notes BRAND BID THREAD COUNT
03447-09-1-01 BLANKETS:BED 66 X 90 6690-SFW 4.75$      4.75$      No Bid No Bid BLSFW 6.61$           6.61$      bob barker c 5.42$      5.42$      ICS Import
03447-09-1-02 MATTRESS COVER:35"X73"X4" 35734-PCS 6.79$      6.79$      5.66$      5.66$      ICS
03447-09-1-03 PILLOW CASES 4234-W130 7.50$      7.50$      pc4234 8.13$           8.13$      bob barker cT130 8.62$      8.62$      ICS Import T130
03447-09-1-04 SHEETS:FLAT 66"X 104" 66104-W13 34.00$    34.00$    sh66104 35.80$         35.80$    bob barker T130 34.60$    34.60$    ICS Import T130

03447-09-1-05 MATTRESS:25" X 72 X4" NO BID -$        -$        No bid on m 32.00$    32.00$    ICS
03447-09-1-06 MATTRESS:35" X 73" X4" -$        -$        No bid mat 39.00$    39.00$    ICS
03447-09-1-07 PILLOWS:17" X 25" 1725-PW 6.99$      6.99$      mv2026 5.57$           5.57$      20x26 bob barker 4.60$      4.60$      ICS
03447-09-1-08 TOWELS:BATH TURKISH WHITE 20" X 40" 2040-ITW 12.50$    12.50$    BT2040 10.14$         10.14$    5 lb weight bob barker c 7.60$      7.60$      ICS Import
03447-09-1-09 TOWELS:BATH TURKISH LIGHT GRAY 20" X 40" 2040-ITG 12.50$    12.50$    
03447-09-1-10 WASH CLOTHS: WHITE 12" x 12" 1212-16W 2.50$      2.50$      wc1212 1.34$           1.34$      .75 lbs/dozbob barker c 1.34$      1.34$      ICS Import
03447-09-1-11 SUICIDE BLANKET:54" X 80" NO BID -$        -$        SB5480 59.00$         59.00$    bob barker c 96.00$    96.00$    Humane Restraint
03447-09-1-12 MATTRESS COVER: 25" x 72" x 4" 25724-130 5.50$      5.50$      HMC25754 6.04$           6.04$      these are sbob barker c 4.48$      4.48$      Exception: BICS
03447-09-1-13 BLANKET:BED 62'' x 80'' 6280-W70 6.90$      6.90$      wb6280 6.18$           6.18$      bob barker c 6.20$      6.20$      ICS
03447-09-1-14 BLANKET:BED 62'' x 80'' 6280-W12P 82.80$    82.80$    wb6280 74.16$         74.16$    these are sbob barker c 6.20$      6.20$      24 per case ICS
03447-09-1-15 BLANKET:BED 66" x 90" 6690-SFW 59.88$    59.88$    egtb 64.44$         64.44$    bob barker 5.50$      5.50$      ICS Import
03447-09-1-16 MATTRESS COVER:25" x 72" x 4" 25724-MPC 66.00$    66.00$    53.78$    53.78$    ICS
03447-09-1-17 MATTRESS COVER:35" x 73" x4" 35734-MPC 81.00$    81.00$    67.80$    67.80$    Exception: bICS

389.61$                                                                 277.41$      378.80$    

ICSBob Barker Company Inc.American Textile Systems


