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Jon Kleinheksel

From: Jack Carr [jcarr@mckinneytexas.org]
Sent:  Wednesday, August 12, 2009 11:52 AM
To: Joe Jaynes; Jon Kleinheksel

Cc: Rick Chaffin

Subject: Paving of County Roads

The City Council has approved the appropriation of funds needed for our participation in the paving of CR 123,
CR 124, CR 161 and CR 163 as requested earlier this year.

According to the information you provided the City share of this work will be $281,485.05 and will be completed
under the terms of the previously approved Interlocal Agreement. :

Please send a formal proposal identifying the roadways along with a cover letter. | need that documentation to
initiate a purchase order.

In the meantime, please begin the work necessary to pave the roads as discussed.

JACK E. CARR, P.E.
DIRECTOR OF ENGINEERING
CITY OF McKINNEY

(972) 547-7421

FAX (972) 547-2604
jcarr@mckinneytexas.org

The material in this e-mail is intended only for the use of the individual to
whom it is addressed and may contain information that is confidential,
privileged, and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If you are not the
intended recipient, be advised that the unauthorized review, use, disclosure,
duplication, distribution, or the taking of any action in reliance on this
information is strictly prohibited. If you have received this e-mail in error,
please notify the sender by return email and destroy all electronic and paper
copies of the original message and any attachments immediately. Please note
that neither City of McKinney nor the sender accepts any responsibility for
viruses and it is your responsibility to scan attachments (if any). Thank You.
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