
Bid #07728-09 - Supplies: Janitorial Equipment
 

Creation Date  Jul 31, 2009 End Date Sep 10, 2009 2:00:00 PM CDT

Start Date Aug 24, 2009 10:06:07 AM CDT Awarded Date  Not Yet Awarded

 07728-09-1-01   Broom, NO WIRE, no straw

 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 0
Brand Name: 0
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 0
 

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: NO BID
Brand Name: NO BID
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): NO 
BID
 

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $5.99   1 / each $5.99   Y Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 4 cases
Brand Name: Unisan 932A
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 12
 

OLMSTED-KIRK EQUIPMENT SUPPLY, CO.  First Offer - $6.25   1 / each $6.25    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: UNS 932A
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: UNISAN
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 1
 

Ace Mart Restaurant Supply  First Offer - $9.76   1 / each $9.76    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 36865
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: Carlisle
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 12
`   

 07728-09-1-02   Broom, Push Complete 24 inches 

 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 0
Brand Name: 0
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 0
 

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $6.69   1 / each $6.69    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 6
Brand Name: ABCO ABH2003 & 1102 handle
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
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Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $7.70   1 / each $7.70    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: G4B-00000005
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: SEE DEVIATIONS
Brand Name: ODELL
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 1
 

Ace Mart Restaurant Supply  First Offer - $17.71   1 / each $17.71    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 41881-00/40285-
00
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: Carlisle
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
12
 

 07728-09-1-03   Dust Pan, Rubber Only, NO PLASTIC or METAL
 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 0
Brand Name: 0
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 0
 

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: NO BID
Brand Name: NO BID
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): NO 
BID
 

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $2.09   1 / each $2.09    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1 case
Brand Name: Continental 712
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 48
 

Ace Mart Restaurant Supply  First Offer - $3.29   1 / each $3.29    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 2005
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: Rubbermaid
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 12
 

OLMSTED-KIRK EQUIPMENT SUPPLY, CO.  First Offer - $3.70   1 / each $3.70    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: RUBBERMAID
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 1
 

 07728-09-1-04   Brush, Bowl Brush, NO METAL
 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
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Minimum Order Amount: 0
Brand Name: 0
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 0
 

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: NO BID
Brand Name: NO BID
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): NO 
BID
 

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $0.53   1 / each $0.53    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1 case
Brand Name: Tolco 280100
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 72
 

Ace Mart Restaurant Supply  First Offer - $0.79   1 / each $0.79    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 36238-02
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: Carlisle
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
100
 

 07728-09-1-05   Brush, Scrub Brush, All Purpose, NO METAL
 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 0
Brand Name: 0
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 0
 

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: NO BID
Brand Name: NO BID
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): NO 
BID
 

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $1.19   1 / each $1.19    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1 carton
Brand Name: ABCO 00027
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
12/carton
 

Ace Mart Restaurant Supply  First Offer - $2.22   1 / each $2.22    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 6482
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 12 each
Brand Name: Rubbermaid
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 12 
each
Must order in quantities of 12   
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 07728-09-1-06   Buffer Pads, Floor, 19 inch White
 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / case $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: NO BID
Brand Name: NO BID
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
NO BID
 

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $11.15   1 / case $11.15    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 50 cases
Brand Name: Americo 401819
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 5
Minimum Order Amount is for combined 
Americo Buffer Pad Orders   

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $17.79   1 / case $17.79    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: $85.00
Brand Name: ETC
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 5
 

Clean Care, Inc. First Offer - $24.45   1 / case $24.45   Y Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1 case
Brand Name: 3M
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 5
 

 07728-09-1-07   Buffer Pads, Floor, 19 Inch Black
 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / case $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: NO BID
Brand Name: NO BID
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
NO BID
 

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $11.09   1 / case $11.09    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 50 cases
Brand Name: Americo 400119
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 5
 

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $17.79   1 / case $17.79    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: $85.00
Brand Name: ETC
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 5
 

Clean Care, Inc. First Offer - $21.99   1 / case $21.99    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
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Minimum Order Amount: 1 case
Brand Name: 3M
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 5
 

 07728-09-1-08   Buffer Pad, Floor 19 Inch Red
 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / case $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: NO BID
Brand Name: NO BID
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
NO BID
 

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $11.09   1 / case $11.09    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 50 cases
Brand Name: Americo 404419
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 5
 

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $15.88   1 / case $15.88    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: $85.00
Brand Name: ETC
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 5
 

Clean Care, Inc. First Offer - $21.40   1 / case $21.40    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1 case
Brand Name: 3M
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 5
 

 07728-09-1-09   Buffer Pads, Floor, 19 Inch Blue
 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / case $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 0
Brand Name: 0
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 0
 

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / case $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: NO BID
Brand Name: NO BID
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
NO BID
 

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $11.09   1 / case $11.09    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 50 cases
Brand Name: Americo 400419
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 5
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Clean Care, Inc. First Offer - $20.20   1 / case $20.20    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1 case
Brand Name: 3M
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 5
 

 07728-09-1-10   Buffer Pads, Floor, 20 Inch White
 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $11.98   1 / case $11.98    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 50 cases
Brand Name: Americo 402020
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 5
 

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $14.63   1 / case $14.63    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: G4P-00000014
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: SEE DEVIATIONS
Brand Name: 3M
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
5/CASE
 

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $17.83   1 / case $17.83    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: $85.00
Brand Name: ETC
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 5
 

Clean Care, Inc. First Offer - $23.10   1 / case $23.10    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1 case
Brand Name: 3M
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 5
 

 07728-09-1-11   Mop Head, 32 oz, Screw Type, Blue NO METAL

 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / case $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 0
Brand Name: 0
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 0
 

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / case $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: NO BID
Brand Name: NO BID
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
NO BID
 

Clean Care, Inc. First Offer - $6.50   1 / case $6.50    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
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Minimum Order Amount: 1 case
Brand Name: O'Dell
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
each
Has metal threaded screw   

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $39.98   1 / case $39.98    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1 case
Brand Name: ABCO CM22024
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
12/case
 

 07728-09-1-12   Mop Handle, Screw In, 60 inches

 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

OLMSTED-KIRK EQUIPMENT SUPPLY, CO.  First Offer - $3.52   1 / each $3.52    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: O'DELL
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 1
 

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $3.89   1 / each $3.89    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1 case
Brand Name: ABCO 0120NB
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 12
 

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $3.99   1 / each $3.99    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: TOC-C11
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: SEE DEVIATIONS
Brand Name: ODELL
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 1
 

Ace Mart Restaurant Supply  First Offer - $4.22   1 / each $4.22    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: H316
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: Rubbermaid
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 12
 

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $5.02   1 / each $5.02    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 88-58
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: $85.00
Brand Name: ETC
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 6
Price of $5.02 is Each   

 07728-09-1-13   Mop Head, 24 oz, Cotton , NO METAL, Screw Attachment

 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / case $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: NO BID
Brand Name: NO BID
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
NO BID

Collin County

Sep 11, 2009 2:46:13 PM CDT p. 7



 

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $4.21   1 / case $4.21    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 88-224
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: $85.00
Brand Name: ETC
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
12
Price of $4.21 for Each   

Clean Care, Inc. First Offer - $6.00   1 / case $6.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1 case
Brand Name: O'Dell
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
each
Has metal threaded screw   

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $35.88   1 / case $35.88    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1 case
Brand Name: ABCO CM20024
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
12
Non-screw type   

 07728-09-1-14   Dust Mop Head 5 x 24
 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $3.99   1 / each $3.99    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1 case
Brand Name: Tuway CC245
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 12
 

OLMSTED-KIRK EQUIPMENT SUPPLY, CO.  First Offer - $6.26   1 / each $6.26    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: O'DELL
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 1
 

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $7.78   1 / each $7.78    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 88-5242
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: $85.00
Brand Name: ETC
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 12
Price of $7.78 is for Each   

Ace Mart Restaurant Supply  First Offer - $8.79   1 / each $8.79    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: K153
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: Rubbermaid
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 12
 

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $9.13   1 / each $9.13    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: G4M-00000028
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: SEE DEVIATIONS
Brand Name: ODELL
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Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 1
 

 07728-09-1-15   Dust Mop Handles with Frame 5 x 24
 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 0
Brand Name: 0
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 0
 

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $7.99   1 / each $7.99    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1 case
Brand Name: ABCO BH24524 * 01406NB
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
12
 

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $11.24   1 / each $11.24    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: SEE DEVIATIONS
Brand Name: ODELL
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 1
 

Ace Mart Restaurant Supply  First Offer - $14.19   1 / each $14.19    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: M116/M253
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: Rubbermaid
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
12
 

 07728-09-1-16   Dust Mop Head 5 x 36
 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $5.86   1 / each $5.86    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 88-5363
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: $85.00
Brand Name: ETC
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 6
Price of $5.58 Each   

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $5.98   1 / each $5.98    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1 case
Brand Name: Tuway CC36-5
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
12
 

OLMSTED-KIRK EQUIPMENT SUPPLY, CO.  First Offer - $7.53   1 / each $7.53    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: O'DELL
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 1
 

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $11.42   1 / each $11.42    Y
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Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: G4M-00000029
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: SEE DEVIATIONS
Brand Name: ODELL
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 1
 

 07728-09-1-17   Dust Mop Handle with Frame 5 x 36
 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 0
Brand Name: 0
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 0
 

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $7.89   1 / each $7.89    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1 case
Brand Name: ABCO BH24536 & 01406NB
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
12
 

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $11.64   1 / each $11.64    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: SEE DEVIATIONS
Brand Name: ODELL
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 1
 

 07728-09-1-18   Squeegee, Multi-surface, double-edged floor, 24 inches with Handle

 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 0
Brand Name: 0
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 0
 

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: NO BID
Brand Name: NO BID
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): NO 
BID
 

 07728-09-1-19   Squeegee, Floor, 24 inch Refill Blade

 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 0
Brand Name: 0
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 0
 

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: Supplier Product Code: 
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Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: NO BID
Brand Name: NO BID
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): NO 
BID
 

 07728-09-1-20   Squeegee, Window, 12 inches, Handle with Rubber Blade
 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 0
Brand Name: 0
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 0
 

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $2.59   1 / each $2.59    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1 case
Brand Name: ABCO BH15006
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
12
 

Ace Mart Restaurant Supply  First Offer - $4.36   1 / each $4.36    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 2472
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: Continental Mfg
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
12
 

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $11.32   1 / each $11.32    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: UNG-PR30
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: SEE DEVIATIONS
Brand Name: UNGER
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 1
 

 07728-09-1-21   Squeegee, Window, 12 inches Replacement Rubber

 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 0
Brand Name: 0
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 0
 

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: NO BID
Brand Name: NO BID
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): NO 
BID
 

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $2.59   1 / each $2.59    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1 case
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Brand Name: ABCO BH1500GR
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 12
 

 07728-09-1-22   Color Coded Plastic Squeegee, 18"
 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 0
Brand Name: 0
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 0
 

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: NO BID
Brand Name: NO BID
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
NO BID
 

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $9.79   1 / each $9.79    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 4 cases
Brand Name: Carlisle 41567
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
12
 

Ace Mart Restaurant Supply  First Offer - $13.70   1 / each $13.70    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 41567-14
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: Carlisle
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 6
 

 07728-09-1-23   Color Coded Plastic Squeegee, 24"
 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 0
Brand Name: 0
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 0
 

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: NO BID
Brand Name: NO BID
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
NO BID
 

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $11.98   1 / each $11.98    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 4 cases
Brand Name: Carlisle 41568
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
12
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Ace Mart Restaurant Supply  First Offer - $17.03   1 / each $17.03    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 41568-05
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: Carlisle
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 6
 

 07728-09-1-24   Trigger Sprayer to fit Quart Bottle
 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $0.43   1 / each $0.43    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: IMP-6900
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: SEE DEVIATIONS
Brand Name: IMPACT
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 1
 

Clean Care, Inc. First Offer - $0.45   1 / each $0.45    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: each
Brand Name: 
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
each
 

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $0.48   1 / each $0.48    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1 case
Brand Name: Tolco 10221
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
100
 

Ace Mart Restaurant Supply  First Offer - $0.77   1 / each $0.77    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 5906
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: Impact Products
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 12
 

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $1.07   1 / each $1.07    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 74-921
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: $85.00
Brand Name: Continental
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
200
Price of $1.07 is for Each   

 07728-09-1-25   Plastic Bottle, Quart Size, Clear

 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $0.43   1 / each $0.43    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1 case
Brand Name: Continental 932B
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
100
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Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $0.46   1 / each $0.46    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: IMP-5032WG
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: SEE DEVIATIONS
Brand Name: IMPACT
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 1
 

Ace Mart Restaurant Supply  First Offer - $0.49   1 / each $0.49    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 924B
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: Continental Mfg
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
12
24 ounce.   

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $0.663   1 / each $0.663    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 74-932
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: $85.00
Brand Name: Continental
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
200
 

Clean Care, Inc. First Offer - $0.68   1 / each $0.68    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: each
Brand Name: 
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
each
 

 07728-09-1-26   Threaded Handle for Pushbroom Heads 

 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 0
Brand Name: 0
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 0
 

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $1.98   1 / each $1.98    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 4 cases
Brand Name: ABCO 01102
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 12
Wood Handle   

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $2.67   1 / each $2.67    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: TOC-0360BW
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: SEE DEVIATIONS
Brand Name: ODELL
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 1
 

Ace Mart Restaurant Supply  First Offer - $4.63   1 / each $4.63    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 40285
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: Carlisle
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 12
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 07728-09-1-27   Threaded Fiberglass Handle, 60"

 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 0
Brand Name: 0
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 0
 

OLMSTED-KIRK EQUIPMENT SUPPLY, CO.  First Offer - $7.12   1 / each $7.12    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: UNS 636
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: UNISAN
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 1
 

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $8.49   1 / each $8.49    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 3 cases
Brand Name: Carlisle 40225
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 12
 

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $9.37   1 / each $9.37    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: IMP-84
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: SEE DEVIATIONS
Brand Name: IMPACT
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 1
 

Ace Mart Restaurant Supply  First Offer - $9.99   1 / each $9.99    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 40225-00
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: Carlisle
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 12
 

 07728-09-1-28   Threaded Wood Handle, 60"

 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $1.98   1 / each $1.98    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 3 cases
Brand Name: ABCO 01102
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 12
 

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $2.67   1 / each $2.67    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: TOC-0360BW
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: SEE DEVIATIONS
Brand Name: ODELL
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 1
 

OLMSTED-KIRK EQUIPMENT SUPPLY, CO.  First Offer - $3.60   1 / each $3.60    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: PROLINE
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 1
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Ace Mart Restaurant Supply  First Offer - $4.63   1 / each $4.63    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 40285
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: Carlisle
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 12
 

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $5.02   1 / each $5.02    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 88-58
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: $85.00
Brand Name: 0
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 0
Price of $5.02 id for Each   

 07728-09-1-29   Round Duster Head

 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 0
Brand Name: 0
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 0
 

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: NO BID
Brand Name: NO BID
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): NO 
BID
 

Ace Mart Restaurant Supply  First Offer - $3.06   1 / each $3.06    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 363404-14
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: Carlisle
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 12
 

 07728-09-1-30   Ostrich feather duster, 10"
 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 0
Brand Name: 0
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 0
 

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: NO BID
Brand Name: NO BID
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): NO 
BID
 

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $4.49   1 / each $4.49    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
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Minimum Order Amount: 1 case
Brand Name: Lambskin D22EC
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 12
 

Ace Mart Restaurant Supply  First Offer - $6.80   1 / each $6.80    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 45744-00
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: Carlisle
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 12
 

 07728-09-1-31   Duster, Extension
 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 0
Brand Name: 0
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 0
 

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: NO BID
Brand Name: NO BID
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): NO 
BID
 

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $4.59   1 / each $4.59    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1 case
Brand Name: Lambskin 350EX
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 6
 

Ace Mart Restaurant Supply  First Offer - $7.94   1 / each $7.94    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 45733
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: Carlisle
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 12
 

 07728-09-1-32   Duster, 100 Lambswool Duster with Extended Handle
 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 0
Brand Name: 0
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 0
 

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: NO BID
Brand Name: NO BID
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): NO 
BID
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Pyramid School Products First Offer - $4.75   1 / each $4.75    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1 case
Brand Name: Lambskin S82EPPD
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 12
 

OLMSTED-KIRK EQUIPMENT SUPPLY, CO.  First Offer - $6.29   1 / each $6.29    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 12
Brand Name: LAMBSKIN
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 12
 

 07728-09-1-33   Dispenser - Paper Towel
 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 0
Brand Name: 0
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 0
 

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: NO BID
Brand Name: NO BID
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
NO BID
 

Ace Mart Restaurant Supply  First Offer - $22.75   1 / each $22.75    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: R4000TBK
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: San Jamar
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 4
 

OLMSTED-KIRK EQUIPMENT SUPPLY, CO.  First Offer - $45.00   1 / each $45.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: KIMBERLY CLARK
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 1
 

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $53.95   1 / each $53.95    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: Kimberly Clark 09551
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
each
 

 07728-09-1-34   Toilet seat cover dispenser
 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 0
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Brand Name: 0
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 0
 

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / each $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: NO BID
Brand Name: NO BID
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
NO BID
 

Ace Mart Restaurant Supply  First Offer - $6.62   1 / each $6.62    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 1120
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: Impact Products
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 1
 

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $27.95   1 / each $27.95    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 2
Brand Name: Kyrstal KD200
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 2
 

OLMSTED-KIRK EQUIPMENT SUPPLY, CO.  First Offer - $32.00   1 / each $32.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 12
Brand Name: KRYSTAL
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
12
 

 07728-09-1-35   Urinal Screens
 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $0.69   1 / each $0.69    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 10 cases
Brand Name: Hospeco
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
12
 

Ace Mart Restaurant Supply  First Offer - $1.07   1 / each $1.07    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 12DS-RED
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: Fresh Products
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
12
 

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $1.65   1 / each $1.65    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: $85.00
Brand Name: Nilodor
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 6
Price of $1.65 is for each   

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $8.19   1 / each $8.19    Y

Agency Product Code: Supplier Product Code: G4C-VUS1
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Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: SEE DEVIATIONS
Brand Name: BIG D
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
12/BOX
 

OLMSTED-KIRK EQUIPMENT SUPPLY, CO.  First Offer - $13.25   1 / each $13.25    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: KRY 1001
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: KRYSTAL
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 1
 

 07728-09-1-36   Sani Screen with Cleaner Block
 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / case $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 0
Brand Name: 0
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 0
 

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / case $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: NO BID
Brand Name: NO BID
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
NO BID
 

Ace Mart Restaurant Supply  First Offer - $1.32   1 / case $1.32    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 165
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1 each
Brand Name: Continental Mfg
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
12
Price is for 1 each not 1 case.   

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $14.99   1 / case $14.99    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 10 cases
Brand Name: Hospeco 01905
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
12
 

 07728-09-1-37   Deodorizing Mist Dispensers
 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / case $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 0
Brand Name: 0
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 0
 

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / case $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: NO BID
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Brand Name: NO BID
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
NO BID
 

Ace Mart Restaurant Supply  First Offer - $20.96   1 / case $20.96    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 32-1131
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: Time Mist
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 1
 

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $22.99   1 / case $22.99    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1 case
Brand Name: Chase 3000
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 6
 

 07728-09-1-38   Toilet Tissue Dispenser

 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / case $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 0
Brand Name: 0
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 0
 

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / case $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: NO BID
Brand Name: NO BID
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
NO BID
 

Ace Mart Restaurant Supply  First Offer - $22.06   1 / case $22.06    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: R4000TBK
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: San Jamar
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 4
Price is for 1 each, not 1 case.   

OLMSTED-KIRK EQUIPMENT SUPPLY, CO.  First Offer - $45.00   1 / case $45.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 09551
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: KIMBERLY CLARK
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 1
 

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $53.95   1 / case $53.95    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: each
Brand Name: Kimberly Clark 09551
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
Each
 

 07728-09-1-39   Hand Sanitizer Dispenser
 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs
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Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / case $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 0
Brand Name: 0
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 0
 

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / case $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: NO BID
Brand Name: NO BID
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
NO BID
 

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $8.99   1 / case $8.99    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1 case
Brand Name: Purell NXT 2120-06
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 6
 

OLMSTED-KIRK EQUIPMENT SUPPLY, CO.  First Offer - $12.50   1 / case $12.50    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: GOJO
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 1
 

Ace Mart Restaurant Supply  First Offer - $16.61   1 / case $16.61    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 9621
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: Gojo
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 1
Price is for 1 each, not 1 case.   

 07728-09-1-40   Paper Towel Dispenser
 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / case $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 0
Brand Name: 0
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
0
 

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / case $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: NO BID
Brand Name: NO BID
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
NO BID
 

Ace Mart Restaurant Supply  First Offer - $50.18   1 / case $50.18    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: T1290TBK
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: San Jamar
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
1
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Price is for 1 each, not 1 case.   

OLMSTED-KIRK EQUIPMENT SUPPLY, CO.  First Offer - $115.00   1 / case $115.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 9706
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: KIMBERLY CLARK
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
1
 

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $139.95   1 / case $139.95    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: each
Brand Name: Kimberly clark KCCO 9706
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
Each
 

 07728-09-1-41   Hand Soap Dispenser
 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / case $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 0
Brand Name: 0
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 0
 

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / case $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: NO BID
Brand Name: NO BID
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): NO 
BID
 

Ace Mart Restaurant Supply  First Offer - $16.61   1 / case $16.61    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 9033
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: Gojo
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 1
Price is for 1 each, not 1 case   

OLMSTED-KIRK EQUIPMENT SUPPLY, CO.  First Offer - $18.00   1 / case $18.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 92194
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: KIMBERLY CLARK
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 1
 

 07728-09-1-42   Vinyl Gloves
 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / case $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 0
Brand Name: 0
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 0
 

Ace Mart Restaurant Supply  First Offer - $3.30   1 / case $3.30    Y

Agency Product Code: Supplier Product Code: VEM102
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Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: Rofson
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 1
Price is for 1 pack of 100. Not 1 case.   

Interboro Packaging Corp  First Offer - $18.40   1 / case $18.40   Y Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: As per sample #42
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: $200.00
Brand Name: Maxxim, Med Pride, Emerald
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
400*
Sm=Maxxim-Sm-VG 
Med=Med Pride-Med-VPFG. We bid Vinyl PF 
Gloves 
Lrg=Emerald-Lrg-VG 
*We can only ship this item 100/Box 10 
boxes/case=1,000/case. Price is for 
400/Case.   

American Health and Safety  First Offer - $22.50   1 / case $22.50   Y Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: V24 Series High 
Five Vinyl FDA approved Glove, 5 mil
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 0
Brand Name: High Five
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
1000
Small=V241 
Medium=V242 
Large=V243 
10 boxes of 100 per case, one case equals 
1000 gloves   

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $27.90   1 / case $27.90    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 60 cases 
(combined Americare Orders)
Brand Name: Americare #400
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
10 boxes/case
Minimum order amount applies to all 
Americare Glove Orders   

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $31.38   1 / case $31.38    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: IMP-8608
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: SEE DEVIATIONS
Brand Name: IMPACT
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
1000/CASE
 

Pro Safety Supplies, LLC  Alt 2 - $37.50   1 / case $37.50   Y Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: LIB2900W
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1 CASE
Brand Name: LIBERTY 
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
10 BOXES OF 100 GLOVES (1,000 CT)
This is an industrial grade glove. Same specs 
as exam, but a lower cost. Exam grade is not 
needed normally for Janitoral type work.   

Pro Safety Supplies, LLC  First Offer - $39.00   1 / case $39.00   Y Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: LIB2900
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1 Case
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Brand Name: LIBERTY BIOSKIN
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
10 BOXES OF 100 GLOVES (1,000 CT)
Exam grade is only needed if in contact with 
blood and bodily fluids. Spec sheet attached.   

 07728-09-1-43   Vinyl Exam Glove
 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / case $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 0
Brand Name: 0
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 0
 

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / case $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: NO BID
Brand Name: NO BID
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
NO BID
 

Interboro Packaging Corp  First Offer - $12.20   1 / case $12.20    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: As per sample #43
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: $200.00
Brand Name: Maxxim, Med Pride, Emerald
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
400*
Sm=Maxxim-Sm-VG 
Med=Med Pride-Med-VPFG. We bid Vinyl PF 
Gloves 
Lrg=Emerald-Lrg-VG 
*We can only ship this item 100/Box 10 
boxes/case=1,000/case. Price is for 
400/Case.   

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $27.90   1 / case $27.90    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 60 cases
Brand Name: Americare # 500
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
10 Boxes/case
 

American Health and Safety  First Offer - $28.00   1 / case $28.00   Y Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: TG Medical 60000 
Series Vinyl Exam Grade Glove
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 0
Brand Name: TG Medical 
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
1000
Small=60005 
Medium=60010 
Large=60015 
10 boxes of 100 per case, one case equals 
1000 gloves   

Pro Safety Supplies, LLC  First Offer - $39.00   1 / case $39.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: LIB2900
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1 CASE
Brand Name: LIBERTY BIOSKIN
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Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 1 
CASE
 

 07728-09-1-44   Mop Bucket with Wringer
 Supplier Unit Price  Qty/Unit Total Price  Attch.  Docs

Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / case $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 0
Brand Name: 0
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 0
 

Empire Paper Co.  First Offer - $0.00   1 / case $0.00    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: NO BID
Brand Name: NO BID
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
NO BID
 

Ace Mart Restaurant Supply  First Offer - $59.28   1 / case $59.28    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 7580-16
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: Rubbermaid
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 1
 

OLMSTED-KIRK EQUIPMENT SUPPLY, CO.  First Offer - $62.50   1 / case $62.50    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 7580-88
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 1
Brand Name: RUBBERMAID
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 1
 

Pyramid School Products First Offer - $76.95   1 / case $76.95    Y

Agency Product Code: 
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 
Supplier Notes:
Minimum Order Amount: 10
Brand Name: Rubbermaid 7580-88
Unit Quantity per Case (as applicable): 
each
 

Supplier Totals

 Advantage Resources Services, (Map, Inc. $100.563    (44/44 items) 

Bid Contact Sam Oladipo 
mapdallas@msn.com
Ph 972-687-9120   
Fax 972-447-9442 

Address Dallas, TX 75370
14275 Midway Road, Suite 220
Addison, TX 75001 

Qualifications  DBE   HUB   MBE   NCTRCA   SB   TX   

Bid Notes  We request a "Min Order of $85.00", if and when Min is not, additional $15.00 Fee will be 
added 

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
We request a "Min Order of $85.00", if and when Min 
is not, additional $15.00 Fee will be added 

 Empire Paper Co. $136.24    (44/44 items) 

Bid Contact Rochelle Morath 
Rochelle.Morath@empirepaper.com

Address 2708 Central Frwy E
Wichita Falls, TX 76301 
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Ph 800-299-9626 x117   
Fax 940-766-3867 

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

 Interboro Packaging Corp $30.60    (2/44 items) 

Bid Contact Abraham Jeremias 
interbor@frontiernet.net
Ph 845-457-2700 x101   
Fax 845-457-1927 

Address 114 Bracken Road
Montgomery, NY 12549-2600 

Qualifications  HUB   MBE   SB   WBE   

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

 Pyramid School Products $688.84    (40/44 items) 

Bid Contact DANIEL SANDERS 
bids@pyramidsp.com
Ph 800-792-2644 x246   
Fax 813-621-7688 

Address 6510 N 54TH ST
Tampa, FL 33610-1908 

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

 OLMSTED-KIRK EQUIPMENT SUPPLY, CO. $387.52    (16/44 items) 

Bid Contact JAWANA WILLIAMS 
jwilliams@okpaper.com
Ph 214-879-7000   

Address 5280 TEX OAK AVE
DALLAS, TX 75235 

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

 Ace Mart Restaurant Supply $355.13    (30/44 items) 

Bid Contact Ron Keene 
rkeene@acemart.com
Ph 210-323-4426   
Fax 210-323-4683 

Address 2653 Austin Hwy
San Antonio, TX 78218 

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

 American Health and Safety $50.50    (2/44 items) 

Bid Contact Michael Glenn 
mglenn@labsource.com
Ph 800-522-7554   

Address 325 Industrial Circle
Stoughton, WI 53589 

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

 Clean Care, Inc. $124.77    (9/44 items) 

Bid Contact David Roberts 
Ph 972-329-0022   
Fax 972-329-0263 

Address 321 US Hwy 80
P.O. Box 852137
Mesquite, TX 75185-2137 

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

 Pro Safety Supplies, LLC $76.50    (2/44 items) 

Bid Contact Jill Morrow 
jill@prosafetysupplies.com
Ph 469-374-5970   
Fax 214-623-6008 

Address 1800 N. Glenville Dr #120
Richardson, TX 75081 

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

**All bids/proposals submitted for the designated project are reflected on this tabulation sheet. However, the listing of the 
bid/proposal on this tabulation sheet shall not be construed as a comment on the responsiveness of such bid/proposal or as any 
indication that the agency accepts such bid/proposal as being responsive. The agency will make a determination as to the 
responsiveness of the vendor responses submitted based upon compliance with all applicable laws, purchasing guidelines and 
project documents, including but not limited to the project specifications and contract documents. The agency will notify the 
successful vendor upon award of the contract and, as according to the law, all bid/proposal responses received will be available 
for inspection at that time.
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