Bid #11068-08 Services: Body Repair and Painting for Light Medium and Heavy Duty Vehicles.

Red River Truck

Grayson Co. 28 miles

ltem # ltem Qty| Unit Price Total
04468-08-1-01 [Light Duty Vehicle Body Damage Repair Metal/Glass 1 | hour No Bid No Bid
04468-08-1-02 [Light Duty Vehicle Body Damage Repair Frame Rate 1 | hour No Bid No Bid
04468-08-1-03 |Light Duty Vehicle Body Damage Repair Materials Rate 1 | hour No Bid No Bid
04468-08-1-04 |Light Duty Vehicle Body Damage Repair Mechanical Rate 1 | hour No Bid No Bid
04468-08-1-05 |Light Duty Vehicle Body Damage Repair Paint Technician Rate 1 | hour No Bid No Bid
04468-08-1-06 |Light Duty Vehicle OEM Replacement Parts Domestic 1 | each No Bid No Bid
04468-08-1-07 |Light Duty Vehicle OEM Replacement Parts Import 1 | each No Bid No Bid
04468-08-1-08 |Light Duty Vehicle Aftermarket Replacement Parts 1 | each No Bid No Bid
04468-08-1-09 [Medium Duty Vehicle Body Damage Repair Metal/Glass 1 | hour $40.00 $40.00
04468-08-1-10 [Medium Duty Vehicle Body Damage Frame Rate 1 | hour $75.00 $75.00
04468-08-1-11 [Medium Duty Vehicle Body Damage Repair Materials Rate 1 | hour $40.00 $40.00
04468-08-1-12 (Medium Duty Vehicle Body Damage Repair Mechanical Rate 1 | hour $58.00 $58.00
04468-08-1-13 [Medium Duty Vehicle Body Damage Repair Paint Technician Rate 1 | hour $40.00 $40.00
04468-08-1-14 |Medium Duty Vehicle OEM Replacement Parts 1 | each 20% 20%
04468-08-1-15 |Medium Duty Vehicle Aftermarket Replacement Parts 1 | each 20% 20%
04468-08-1-16 [Heavy Duty Vehicle Body Damage Repair Metal/Glass 1 | hour $40.00 $40.00
04468-08-1-17 [Heavy Duty Vehicle Body Damage Frame Rate 1 | hour $75.00 $75.00
04468-08-1-18 [Heavy Duty Vehicle Body Damage Repair Materials Rate 1 | hour $40.00 $40.00
04468-08-1-19 |Heavy Duty Vehicle Body Damage Repair Mechanical Rate 1 | hour $58.00 $58.00
04468-08-1-20 [Heavy Duty Vehicle Body Damage Repair Paint Technician Rate 1 | hour $40.00 $40.00
04468-08-1-21 |Heavy Duty Vehicle OEM Replacement Parts 1 | each 20% 20%
04468-08-1-22 |Heavy Duty Vehicle Aftermarket Replacement Parts 1 | each 20% 20%
04468-08-1-23 |Towing - Flat Rate Light Duty Vehicle 1 | each No Bid No Bid
04468-08-1-24 |Towing - Flat Rate Medium Duty Vehicle 1 | each No Bid No Bid
04468-08-1-25 |Towing - Flat Rate Heavy Duty Vehicle 1 | each No Bid No Bid




