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Bill Burke

From: Bill Bilyeu

Sent:  Thursday, September 30, 2010 2:26 PM
To: Bill Burke:

Cc: Brad Harris; Sara Hoglund

Subject: Re: Change Order

Ok by me.
Bill

On Sep 30, 2010, at 10:55 AM, "Bill Burke" <bburke(@co.collin.tx.us> wrote:

Bill,

We have a Change Order being reviewed that will need your approval. Maximum it will be
$6,200.00. The charge relates to the Sanitary line reroute and an additional manhole. | will need to
get this approved as soon as it clears the Civil Engineer. If he approves it will you approve?

Thanks,

Bill

9/30/2010



