Liz Gray

From: Laura Thomas

Sent:  Tuesday, March 01, 2011 3:57 PM

To: Liz Gray

Cc: Linda Riggs

Subject: FW: Clean Vehicle Fleet - Accepted Revised Proposal - Notice to Proceed
Liz,

Marivel Rodriguez TCEQ called me and said the email confirmation of TCEQ's
acceptance of the revised proposal (see Sandra Young's email below) is the only
document that will be issued.

There won't be another contract — TCEQ files the email with the original executed
document and that’s that.

So, the email hetow IS the Notice to Proceed from TCEQ.
Let me know if you need anything elset

Regards,

Laura Thomas

! Speciafst
Couinity Adminis

Colitn County Aucitor
amdale Suite 310(

T 73071

972-5484]
y .

Mbomas@co.colle

From: Laura Thomas

Sent: Monday, February 28, 2011 11:57 AM

To: 'Sandra Young'

Cc: Linda Riggs; Liz Gray; 'Marivel Rodriguez'; 'Santos Olivarez'
Subject: Clean Vehicle Fleet - Accepted Revised Proposal

Sandra,

Thank you for the notice that TCEQ has accepted Collin County’s 2009 Local Initiatives Projects Clean
Vehicle Fleet Revised Proposal.

I understand these funds must be used by August 31, 2011 to acquire the two additional vehicles.

Would you please send me a copy of the newly executed contract, so that the process to purchase the
two vehicles may be set into motion?

Regards,

Lawra Themas

Grant Specialist

Collin County Administration Building
Office of Collin County Auditor

2300 Bloomdale Suite 3100
McKinney, TX 75071

972-548-4511

972-548-4751 fax
Ithomas@co.collin.tx.us
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From: Sandra Young [mailto:Sandra.Young@tceq.texas.gov]

Sent: Wed 2/23/2011 3:27 PM

To: Liz Gray

Cc: Olivarez, Santos; Rodriguez, Marivel

Subject: Re: FW: Coliln County Revised LIP Project Proposal -Email 2

Liz,

Collin County's revised proposal to add two additional vehicles to the 2009 Local Initiatives Projects Clean
Vehicle Fleet Project has been approved. Please note that all transactions, including payment, must be
completed by August 31, 2011.

Please let me know if you have any additional questions.

Please note that as of 1/17/2011, my email address has changed.

How is our customer service?  www.tceq.texas.qov/goto/customersurvey

Sandra Young, Program Specialist

Texas Commission on Environmental Quality
Mobile Source Programs Team

Mail Code 164

12100 Park 35 Circle

Austin, TX 78753

3/1/2011
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