Georgia Shepherd

Subject: Agreement: Organized Crime Drug Enforcement Task Force

From: Jennifer Turner

Sent: Friday, August 26, 2011 8:49 AM

To: Greg Willis; Della Bryant

Subject: FW: Agreement: Organized Crime Drug Enforcement Task Force

FYI....

Thank you all for your help!

From: Holly Heldt

Sent: Friday, August 26, 2011 8:48 AM

To: Jennifer Turner

Subject: RE: Agreement: Organized Crime Drug Enforcement Task Force

Jennifer,

| spoke with Michael DeBlois, FBI, yesterday regarding this grant. He stated that we would not be receiving the OCDETF
contract back because they are going to reimburse the County using only HIDTA funds. Therefore, we need to use the
HIDTA MOU which has not been through Commissioner’s Court. Mr. DeBlois will be supplying us with two original copies
of the HIDTA MOU for both Judge Willis and a HIDTA official to sign. I let him know that | need the signed HIDTA MOU by
August 30" so | can get it on the September 12" Court. If you have any questions please let me know.

Thanks,
Holly

From: Jennifer Turner

Sent: Friday, August 26, 2011 8:24 AM

To: Della Bryant

Cc: Greg Willis; Holly Heldt

Subject: RE: Agreement: Organized Crime Drug Enforcement Task Force

Della,

Holly is actually the one requesting the signed copy. Do happen to have a contact there at the FBI that | might could call
and get the status. This was sent out in July.

Thank you!

From: Della Bryant

Sent: Thursday, August 25, 2011 8:03 PM

To: Jennifer Turner

Cc: Greg Willis

Subject: RE: Agreement: Organized Crime Drug Enforcement Task Force

Hi Jennifer,



It is my understanding that Holly Heldt has been keeping track of the contract status with
someone in Houston. | have been told FBI has not signed it yet.

Della Bryant

Administrative Manager

Collin County District Attorney's Office
2100 Bloomdale Rd., Ste. 20004
McKinney, Texas 75071

972.548.4330

From: Jennifer Turner

Sent: Wednesday, August 24, 2011 1:41 PM

To: Greg Willis; Della Bryant

Subject: Agreement: Organized Crime Drug Enforcement Task Force

| am trying to locate the signed agreement for the above.

| had mailed it out in July for signatures. Did they happen to mail the originals back to you, because | have not received
them back.

Thank you!



