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Tawana Hendricks

From: Tony Bradley

Sent:  Tuesday, July 19, 2011 3:04 PM
To: Shirley Cook; Tawana Hendricks
Cc: Christopher Meehan

Subject: RE: Apple I-Pad

I thought we had already approved it, either way | do approve this.
Licutenant Tony Bradley

Collin County Sheriff's Office

Child Abuse Task Force

Phone: 972-633-6626
e-mail: tbradley@collincountytx.gov

From: Shirley Cook

Sent: Tue 7/19/2011 1:14 PM
To: Tony Bradley

Cc: Christopher Meehan
Subject: Apple I-Pad

Tony,
Agenda will need to be resent to Commissioner's Court; can you please approve the attached req?

Thanks,
shirley
x5152

7/19/2011



Apple Enterprise

SHIP TO: PREPARED BY: WO 4 Y7L o
BRIGITTE BAKER Kyle Houser (] éf 0fy %,d«((

COLLIN COUNTY, TX Phone: 703.264.3215

Fax: 703.264.5158 /,/,/ Konled af o s 2

khouser@apple.com @l = D
Quote Quote Date Valid Until Customer # SEA #
KWHSTATE_OF TEXAS122-01.0 4/15/2011 5/15/2011 704439
Item Description Est. Ship Part Number | Item Price Qty Disc Price Extended Price
iPad 2 Wi-Fi + 3G 32GB for AT&T - Black 2-3 weeks MC774LL/A $729.00 1 $729.00
Apple Digital AV Adapter Within 24 hours ~ MC953ZM/A $39.00 VDo voT— A eed 53900
AppleCare Protection Plan for iPad - Auto-enroli ~ Within 24 hours S3788LL/A $79.00 1 $79.00
iPad 2 Smart Cover - Leather - Navy 1-2 business MC949LL/A $69.00 1 $69.00
days
Subtotal $916.00
Est Shipping Free
Total $916.00

The entire contents of this publication are Copyright (C) 2007, 2008 by Apple Inc. As a condition of receiving this document, you agree that you
will not duplicate, download to a database, transmit electronically, or disseminate by any means whatsoever any portion of this document to
anyone other than employees of your company, nor will you use any information in this document other than as necessary to transact business

with Apple inc.
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Chris

Sgt.Chris Meehan

Collin County Sheriff's Office

Internet Crimes Against Children Task Force
United States Secret Service ECTF
972-633-6753

From: Estelia Almendarez

Sent: Tuesday, April 26, 2011 4:16 PM
To: Christopher Meehan

Subject: IPAD2 Standard

Chris,

Here are the standard items needed for the IPAD2. Attached is the quote with most recent pricing. If approved in Court,
IT will enter the req to order.

iPAD2 with Wi-Fi + 3G - 32GB

iPad Smart Cover — Leather — Various Color Available
Apple Digital AV Adapter

iPad — AppleCare Protections Plan — Auto-Enroll

iWorks for IPAD2 — Per Apple website, this is only available for the iPAD2 as a download via the App Store on the iPAD2.
Pricing listed is $9.99 per app, such as Word, Excel and Powerpoint.

Enterprise Data plan which allows the IPAD2 to be wiped if it is lost, stolen, etc. is $29.60 per month.

Thanks,

Fstella Almendarer

Collin County Information Technology
Operations Supervisor
ealmendarez@co.collin.tx.us

472 548 4559

7/5/2011



Shirley Cook

From: Chuck Ruckel

Sent:  Tuesday, March 22, 2011 12:32 PM
To: Estella Aimendarez; Shirley Cook

Cc: Christopher Meehan

Subject: FW: ICAC Purchase *Time Sensitive*

| am OK with this as long as only ICAC money is used.

Major Chuck Ruckel

Field Operations

Collin County Sheriff's Office
4300 Community Ave
McKinney, TX 75071
972-547-5109 Off
214-686-7124 Cell

|3

LCC -39

From: Christopher Meehan

Sent: Tuesday, March 22, 2011 12:20 PM
To: Chuck Ruckel

Cc: Shirley Cook; Estella Almendarez
Subject: ICAC Purchase *Time Sensitive*

Major Ruckel,

Page | of |

Attached is a justification letter to purchase an IPAD 2 with Dallas PD ICAC Grant money. | have also included an email

from Lt. Lannom (Dallas PD), who oversees the ICAC funding, approving the purchase of this item.

We are using remaining FY 2010 grant money, and it must be spent by the end of March. This puts us on a time frame to
get the order in, received and paid. | have contacted the help desk and Shirley Cook for assistance. They requested that
you forward this email with your approval and form to Estella. She will then see if we can get this ordered and completed

within the time frame.

if you have any questions, please let me know.

Thanks
Chris Meehan

7/5/2011



- Urant Adjustments Home

US DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE

@

OFFICE OF JUSTICE PROGRAMS

GRANT ADJUSTMENT NOTICE

Page 1 of 1

Grantee Information
Grantee ) ... 07/01/2008 - GAN
Name: Dallas Police Department Project Period: 09/30/2011 Number: 010
Jack Evans Headquarters Bldg
Grantee Program .
Address: 1400 South Lamar Street Dallas, Office: 0JiDpP Date: 03/15/2011
75215
Grantee Christopher
DUNS 19-661-6478 Grant Manager: -"1'S'°P
Number: 4
2008-51940-TX-
] } Application MC
Grantee EIN:  75-6005088 Number(s): 2009-55338-TX-
MC
. Award 2008-MC-CX-
Vendor #: 756001508 Number: K026
. .. Internet Crimes Against Children .
Project Title: Grant Continuation Award Amount: $453,305.00
Change Project Period
. Month:
Current Grant Month: New Grant Period:
Period: Day: -
Day:
* =
[Project Start Date: ][07/01/2008 I D:t‘:’_” Project Start 07/01/2008
Project End Date: 03/31/2011
[Proj o331/ Il"‘New Project End Date: 1@9/30/2011
*Required Justification for Change Project Period:
Grantee is being provided a 6 month, no cost
extension in order to complete the goals and
objectives of the cooperative agreement.
Attachments:
None
[ Print
Audit Trail: -
[ Description: WL Role: ][ User: j[ Timestamp: ]
|Approved-Final ___ JOCFMD - Financial Analyst |[sYSTEM_usER l[03/15/2011 12:00 PM |
[Submitted |[PO - GAN 1st Line Supervisor Jlholioway 1[03/09/2011 7:12 AM |

https://grants.ojp.usdoi.gov/gmsexternal/ean/eranteePraiPAGAN <
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City of Dallas

March 8, 2011

Mr. Christopher Holloway
USDOJ/OJIDP

ICAC Task Force Program
810 7™ Street NW
Washington, DC 20531

Dear Mr. Holloway:

I am submitting this letter in connection with an electronic Grant Adjustment Notice in
order to modify the grant funding period on Internet Crimes Continuation Award # 2010-
MC-CX-K037. The grant was originally set to expire on March 31, 2011 but was
extended to July 31, 2011. Irequest that the grant funding period be extended to July 31,
2012. This no-cost extension will allow us to achieve the goals of the grant.

Thank you for your attention to this matter.

Should you have questions or need additional information please feel free to contact
Lieutenant Sally Lannom at 214-671-4201.

Sincerely,

DAVID O. BROWN
CHIEF OF POLICE

Sally D. Lannom

Lieutenant of Police

Special Investigations Division
Investigations Bureau

DALLAS POLICE DEPARTMENT JACK EVANS POLICE HEADQUARTERS 1400 §. LAMAR STREET DALLAS. TEXAS 75215



