Georgia Shepherd

Subject: Tax Abatement Zone 78 - Southwest Corporate Federal Credit Union

From: Finance Administration [mailto:finadmin@plano.gov]

Sent: Wednesday, March 07, 2012 9:24 AM

To: Monika Arris

Subject: RE: Tax Abatement Zone 78 - Southwest Corporate Federal Credit Union

Monika,
There will not be any documents as the agreement was terminated on 2/27. | apologize for not informing the County.

Katherine Crumbley
Administrative Coordinator
City of Plano Finance Dept.
972-941-7479

From: Monika Arris [mailto:marris@co.collin.tx.us]

Sent: Monday, March 05, 2012 2:37 PM

To: Finance Administration

Subject: Tax Abatement Zone 78 - Southwest Corporate Federal Credit Union

Do you all by chance have any final documents for the above referenced tax abatement? We approved the assignment
in September of 2011, but have not received any final documents for the County Judge to sign. Will there be any?

Regards,

Mbénika Arris, CGFO, CIO
Director of Budget & Finance
Collin County

Phone: 972-548-4603

Fax: 972-548-4699
MArris@collincountytx.gov
www.collincountytexas.gov




