From: Sara Hoglund

Sent: Friday, March 09, 2012 8:50 AM

To: Rex Cotten

Cc: Leisa Copin; Mike Malak

Subject: FW: Installation of Zebra Ticket Writer Printer Pedestal &
Charger

All —

See below for the e-mail from shipman with the quote. The $200 that was
in the original budget

meets the requirements for this portion.

Thank You

Sara Hoglund, CPPB
Contract Administrator
972-548-4104

From: Liz Gray

Sent: Friday, March 09, 2012 8:47 AM

To: Sara Hoglund

Subject: FW: Installation of Zebra Ticket Writer Printer Pedestal &
Charger

Here’s the quote you requested.

Please let me know if you need more.

Liz Gray

Fleet Analyst

Collin County Equipment Services

700A Wilmeth Road

McKinney, TX 75069

972-548-3734 (ph) 972-548-3732 (fax)
egray@co.collin_tx.us

From: Wesley Short [mailto:wesleys7971@sbcglobal _net]

Sent: Friday, March 09, 2012 8:45 AM

To: Liz Gray

Subject: RE: Installation of Zebra Ticket Writer Printer Pedestal &
Charger

Liz.

The installation price regardless of vehicle would be $65.00 and the
removal and

reinstallation would be $85.00.

Sorry fTor the delay.

Shipman Communications Inc.
Wesley Short - President



1815 West Morton

Denison, TX. 75020

Office: 800-465-8297

Fax: 903-463-3130

Cell: 903-815-0064

Email: wesleys7971@sbcglobal.net

From: Liz Gray [mailto:lgray@co.collin.tx.us]

Sent: Wednesday, March 07, 2012 9:15 AM

To: Wesley Short

Cc: Liz Gray

Subject: Installation of Zebra Ticket Writer Printer Pedestal & Charger

Wes,

The County is looking at purchasing Zebra RW420 Bluetooth Printers for a
Ticket
Writer system to be installed in the Sheriff Vehicles (Crown Vics).

These printers will require installation of a pedestal: Panavise Mount
Model 727-

06, Slimline, 6” for the printer and a 12VDC power supply, Zebra CC16614-
G1.

Power supply will need to be hardwired thru the ignition.

See attached pictures of what will be installed. The exact mounting
locations of the
mount for the printer and the power supply will have to be determined.

Can you give us a quote for: Install
Remove and
reinstall

IT the quotes will be different when we go to the Ford Pl SUV later this
year, please
submit a quote to remove from the Crown Vic and install in the SUV.

Thanks,

Liz Gray

Fleet Analyst

Collin County Equipment Services
972-548-3734

972-548-3732 (fax)
egray@co.collin.tx.us



