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rﬁ You forwarded this message on 2/22/2012 11:05 AM. |

Tonx Bradlex

From: Lannom, Sally [sally.lannom@dpd.ci.dallas.tx.us] Sent: Wed 2/22/2012 10:29 AM
To: Tony Bradley

Cc:

Subject: RE:

Attachments:

Y'all had $7500 on the 2010 award....I added $10,000 with the 2011 award. They lumped the 2011 money
into the 2010 grant so it became a total of $17,500. That’s the way our City Attorneys wanted the
supplement agreement worded. Itl get even more confusing when they put the 2012 award into the
original 2010 pot.

Clear as mud? ©

Lt. Sally Lannom
Crimes Against Children Unit

214.671.4201

From: Tony Bradley [mailto:tbradley@co.collin.tx.us]
Sent: Wednesday, February 22, 2012 10:11 AM

To: Lannom, Sally

Subject:

Lt. Lannom-

I received the interlocal agreement and attached is the amendments and my boss (Major Ruckel) is confused with the
wording in paragraph 1. Where it add's the amount not to exceed $10,000, from $7500 to $17,500. He feels that our
County Judge will not understand this language. Chris Meehan has stated that he had a conversation with you that
we would receive $10,000 this year. Is there any way we could get this wording cleared up? I also am unaware of
the $17,500 figure?

Give me a shout if you have questions.
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