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Jon Kleinheksel
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From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Philip & Julie™

Jon Kleinheksel

Wednesday, March 21, 2012 1:43 PM

Prodriguez@ci.van-alstyne.tx.us; Julie Fort (Julie@mckamiekrueger.com)
Joe Jaynes

FW: Van Alstyne Mutual Boundary Road Costs

van alstyne mutual boundary.xlsx

Please see the attachment for; mutual boundary logistics’ & County line Rd, {CR 375} rehab estimates.

In the event you have additional questions or concerns please give me a shout and | will respond accordingly.

| can be reached at, 0. 972-548-3700 or C. 214-686-7116

Thanks,

Jon



City

Van Alstyne
Van Alstyne
Van Alstyne
Van Alstyne
Van Alstyne
Van Alstyne
Van Alstyne
Van Alstyne
Total

Additional Costs

Road

CR219
CR289
CR372
CR373
CR429
CR1101
CR290
CR481

County Shared

2,95

2.95

0.68
0.06
0.75
1.14
1.69
0.43
1.67
0.79
7.21

CR 375 aka County Line Rd. $18,254.19

Collin County
Mutual Boundary and City Road Upgrade Costs

Total
City Miles

0.44
0.06
0.75
1.14
1.69
0.43
4.62
0.79
0 9.92

Column A
City Cost to pave
shared segment

only

$2,226.05
$196.42
$2,455.20
$3,731.90
$5,532.38
$1,407.65
$5,466.91
$2,586.14
$23,602.66

Column B
City Cost to pave
City portion only

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

Column A
o
Column B

$2,226.05
$196.42
$2,455.20
$3,731.90
$5,532.38
$1,407.65
$5,466.91
$2,586.14
$23,602.66
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From: Philip Rodriguez [mailto:prodriguez@ci.van-alstyne.tx.us]
Sent: Wednesday, April 25, 2012 10:30 AM

To: Jon Kleinheksel

Subject: RE: Van Alstyne Mutual Boundary Road Costs Update

Jon,

Any chance you could send me a draft document to use — perhaps something used with other cities already with
payment plans?

Thanks,
Philip

From: Jon Kleinheksel [mailto:jkleinheksel@co.collin.tx.us]
Sent: Tuesday, April 24,2012 7:20 PM

To: Philip Rodriguez

Subject: Re: Van Alstyne Mutual Boundary Road Costs Update

Awesome! Thank You, Sir....
Thanks,
Jon

On Apr 24, 2012, at 6:02 PM, "Philip Rodriguez" <prodriguez@ci.van-alstyne.tx.us> wrote:

Jon,

Tonight | will be asking for verbal confirmation from Council to amend the City’s request to pave CR 375
with payment of the full $18,000 upon completion, to incorporate all CR projects we've discussed
including CR 375 with six annual payments of approx. $6976 instead.

Sound ok?

Thanks,
Philip


mailto:prodriguez@cLvan-alstyne.tx.us
mailto:mailto:jkleinheksel@co.collin.tx.us
mailto:mailto:prodriguez@cLvan-alstyne.tx.us

Jon Kleinheksel

From: Jon Kleinheksel

Sent: Wednesday, May 02, 2012 9:30 AM

To: 'Philip Rodriguez’

Subject: RE: Van Alstyne Mutual Boundary Road Costs Update
Philip~

Have you had an opportunity to visit with your Council or make a determination on the aforementioned mutual
boundary project?

When you have a minute, would you please provide me with a status update as to this request..
Thanks,

Jon

From: Tammi Koch

Sent: Wednesday, April 25, 2012 10:52 AM

To: Jon Kleinheksel; 'Philip Rodriguez'

Subject: RE: Van Alstyne Mutual Boundary Road Costs Update

Philip,
Attached are templates/copies of the ILA payback plan schedule, and requests to Commissioners’ Court. If you
need additional information, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Thank you

Fammi Hoch

Collin County Public Works
Office Coordinator
972-548-3719

From: Jon Kleinheksel

Sent: Wednesday, April 25, 2012 10:44 AM

To: 'Philip Rodriguez'

Cc: Tammi Koch

Subject: RE: Van Alstyne Mutual Boundary Road Costs Update

Philip™
We will send a template so you can see the process. however, the process is relatively easy...

One, we facilitate a generic ILA between Collin County and VanAlstyne. And two, you, {van Alstyne}
agree to the road upgrades and request a payment plan, etc....

Jon



