4/5/2012




Jon Kleinheksel

I —

From: Marla Barth <marla.barth@cityofnevada.org>
Sent: Wednesday, August 08, 2012 2:13 PM

To: Jon Kleinheksel

Cc: Mayor Joe Poovey

Subject: re: FW: Nevada

Jon, this is great. We're not needing a payment plan at this time. We understand that some issues have to be worked out
on 544 and that it will be 2013 before any work is done, we are rolling over funds to next years budget to asphalt 544 and
Collins St. When can we expect the routine maintenance to be done?

Thanks

Maria Barth

City Secretary

City of Nevada

424 EFM 6

Nevada, TX 75173

972 853-0027 (also fax)
http://www.cityofnevada.ora/

From: "Jon Kleinheksel" <jkleinheksel@co.collin.tx.us>
Sent: Tuesday, August 07, 2012 3:52 PM

To: marla.barth@cityofnevada.org

Subject: FW: Nevada

Marla™

Nevada currently has an ILA on file that is up to date. In the event you guys are going to “self-finance” the
mutual boundary road proposal, this ILA will suffice.

However, should you guys, {Nevada} seek the payment plan option, | will have to send you another ILA
for your Council to facilitate a resolution.

Please see attachments regarding; current ILA, mutual boundary road estimate, Mutual Boundary Court Order & mutual boundary
info sheet

Any questions please give me a shout....
972-548-3700

Jon

From: Tammi Koch

Sent: Tuesday, August 07, 2012 3:43 PM
To: Jon Kleinheksel

Subject: nevada


mailto:jkleinheksel@co.collin.tx.us

Jammi HKoch <<Nevada ILA.pdf>> <<Nevada MB.pdf>> <<nevada a.pdf>> <<nevada b.pdf>>
Collin County Public Works
Office Coordinator

972-548-3719



