
From: Bill Bilyeu
Sent: Wednesday, August 15, 2012 3:35 PM
To: Stacey Kemp; Michalyn Rains
Subject: FW: Prior Approval Requested

From: Keith Self Judge  
Sent: Wednesday, August 15, 2012 3:05 PM 
To: Bill Bilyeu 
Subject: Re: Prior Approval Requested

Approved. 

Keith Self
County Judge
Collin County

On Aug 15, 2012, at 3:03 PM, "Bill Bilyeu" <bbilyeu@co.collin.tx.us> 
wrote:
50-60 boxes.   I saw the pics this morning and it doesn’t look good.  We 
talked 
specifically about old probate (1920’s) records.  This will come out of 
the clerk’s record 
preservation fund.

From: Keith Self Judge  
Sent: Wednesday, August 15, 2012 2:49 PM 
To: Bill Bilyeu 
Subject: Fwd: Prior Approval Requested

Is there more information?  Are these vital records?  How many boxes for 
$50,000?  Historical records? 

Keith Self
County Judge
Collin County

Begin forwarded message:
From: "Michalyn Rains" <mrains@co.collin.tx.us> 
Date: August 15, 2012 2:44:27 PM CDT 
To: "Keith Self Judge" <keith.self@collincountytx.gov> 
Cc: "Bill Bilyeu" <bbilyeu@co.collin.tx.us>, "Frank Ybarbo" 
<fybarbo@co.collin.tx.us>, "Stacey Kemp" <skemp@co.collin.tx.us> 
Subject: Prior Approval Requested
Judge Self,
Stacey Kemp contacted me first thing this morning with a bit of an 
emergency. In the process of moving boxes of records from the UDCF 
building to the Courthouse, several boxes have been damaged due to 
the rain last night.

This email is to respectfully request the judge’s prior approval for an 
exemption to the bid process per VTCA LGC 262.024 (a)(3)”an item 
necessary because of unforeseen damage to public property”. 



Due to the delicate and historical nature of the records, it is 
imperative 
to move quickly to secure a vendor to start the process to dry and 
preserve these records before any further damage can occur. 

At the time of this email we do not have a cost, but estimate that it 
could be in the $50,000-$75,000 range.

I will get with Georgia and/or Nicole to place the ratification on the 
next 
available Commissioners Court date.

Michalyn Rains, CPPO, CPPB
Contracts Manager
Collin County Purchasing Department
972-548-4113 phone
972-548-4694 fax
mrains@co.collin.tx.us


