
Jon Kleinheksel 

From: Rodney Rhoades < rrhoades@mckinneytexas.org> 
Sent: Tuesday, October 02, 2012 6:31 PM 
To: Jon Kleinheksel 
Cc: Lisa Koslan 
Subject: County road participation 

Big Jon, 

Council approved a resolution tonight to redirect funds to cover our costs for roadway participation. Jack will be in 
touch. 

Rodney Rhoades 
Chief Financial Officer 
City of McKinney 

rrhoades@mckinneytexas.org 

(972)547-7531 (office) 
(214)796-5211 (cell) 

Sent from my iPad 
The material in this e-mail is intended only for the use of the individual to whom it is addressed and may contain 
information that is confidential, privileged, and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If you are not the intended 
recipient, be advised that the unauthorized review, use,disclosure, duplication, distribution, or the taking of any action 
in reliance on this information is strictly prohibited. If you have received this e-mail in error, please notify the sender by 
return email and destroy all electronic and paper copies of the original message and any attachments immediately. 
Please note that neither City of McKinney nor the sender accepts any responsibility for viruses and it is your 
responsibility to scan attachments (if any). Thank You. 



Jon Kleinheksel 

From: Tracy Homfeld 
Sent: Thursday, September 06, 2012 4:45 PM 
To: Jon Kleinheksel 
Subject: RE: McKinney Bond Reduction for Mutual Boundary roads 

It will be Bond project # 07-043 Custer rd. from SH 121 to Stonebridge. 
Tracy 

Tracy Homfeld, P.E., CFM 
Assistant Director 
Collin County Engineering Dept 
825 N. McDonald St., Ste 160 
McKinney, TX 75069 
P) 972-548-3733 
F) 972-548-5555 
www.co.collin.tx.us 
From: Jon Kleinheksel 
Sent: Thursday, September 06, 2012 4:44 PM 
To: Tracy Homfeld 
Subject: RE: McKinney Bond Reduction for Mutual Boundary roads 

is there a particular bond or project you want to use? 

From: Tracy Homfeld 
Sent: Thursday, September 06, 2012 4:34 PM 
To: Jon Kleinheksel 
Subject: McKinney Bond Reduction for Mutual Boundary roads 

I think we reached a consensus on the bond project that will be reduced for McKinney's Mutual Boundary funding 
responsibility. What do you need from me for you to proceed to court? 
Tracy 

Tracy Homfeld, P.E., CFM 
Assistant Director 
Collin County Engineering Dept. 
825 N, McDonald St., Ste 160 
McKinney, TX 75069 
P) 972-548-3733 
F) 972-548-5555 
www.co.collin.tx.us 



Jon Kleinheksel 

From: Jon Kleinheksel 
Sent: Tuesday, August 14, 2012 11:01 AM 
To: 'Rodney Rhoades' 
Subject: RE: County ILA Funds for Road Paving 

Rodney'" 

This looks good from the County's perspective. Also, would you send me the City Council Resolution 
as soon as the item has been addressed by your Council. I will get the item on Commissioner's Court 
as soon as I receive your resolution for the bond reduction ... 

In the event you have any questions please give me a shout and I will respond accordingly ... 

I appreciate your help.. 

Jon 

From: Rodney Rhoades [mailto:rrhoades@mckinneytexas.org] 
Sent: Wednesday, August 01, 2012 12:59 PM 
To: Jon Kleinheksel 
Subject: FW: County lLA Funds for Road Paving 

Hey Jon. Please take a look at the response from Jack on how to reduce our County 
request by the amount mentioned. Let me know if this works for you and if you need 
anything else. I will let my folks know so we can make necessary adjustments once I 
know your good with this. 

Thanks for being patient. 

From: Jack earr
 
Sent: Thursday, May 10, 2012 10:04 AM
 
To: Rodney Rhoades
 
Subject: County lLA Funds for Road Paving
 

Rodney-

This is in response to your request for approximately $650,000 to pull out of one of the 2007 County Bond projects to
 
cover the City share of paving gravel roads along our common boundary.
 

We are recommending the funds be pulled out of the Custer (south of Stonebridge) project.
 
This Custer project is the subject of current discussions with Frisco and County to swap responsibilities for two projects.
 
Coit NB lanes would be McKinney responsibility and Custer Lanes 5&6 would be Frisco responsibility.
 

Let me know jf you need additional information.
 

From: Matt Richardson
 
Sent: Thursday, May 10, 2012 9:52 AM
 
To: Jack Carr
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Cc: Dedra Bates 
Subject: RE: ASAP - County ILA Funds 

The attached spreadsheet shows the current distribution of our funds, included both approved and proposed 
reallocations. I recommend taking the $650,000 from Virginia 5 & 6 (which in turn is being funded $2,500,000 with a 
reallocation from Custer 5 & 6). 

Thanks, 

Matt Richardson, P.E. 
CIP Manager 
City of McKinney 

The material in this e-mail is intended only for the use of the individual to whom it is addressed and may 
contain information that is confidential, privileged, and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If you are 
not the intended recipient, be advised that the unauthorized review, use,disclosure, duplication, distribution, or 
the taking of any action in reliance on this information is strictly prohibited. If you have received this e-mail in 
error, please notify the sender by return email and destroy all electronic and paper copies of the original 
message and any attachments immediately. Please note that neither City of McKinney nor the sender accepts 
any responsibility for viruses and it is your responsibility to scan attachments (if any). Thank You. 
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