Melissa Marﬂuez

From: Melissa Marquez

Sent: Monday, September 23, 2013 12:54 PM
To: Melissa Marquez

Subject: FW: Requested Road abandonment

From: Charles Stearman [mailto:Charles@pyleswhatley.com]
Sent: Monday, September 23, 2013 12:50 PM

To: Melissa Marquez
Subject: RE: Requested Road abandonment

Hi Melissa,

As discussed, we can provide an appraisal report on the small tract of County land, to be abandoned
or sold as surplus property. Our fee would be $1,000.00, with delivery in about three weeks. We
appreciate the opportunity to provide real estate appraisal services to Collin County. Please phone
me if | may be of further assistance.

Charles

Charles Stearman, SR/WA
Pyles Whatley Corporation

11551 Forest Central Dr., Suite 220, Dallas, TX 75243
214-340-5880 F: 214-340-5422

777 Main Street, Suite 600, Fort Worth, TX 76102
817-887-8176 F: 817-887-8177
www.PylesWhatley.com

Note: The information contained in this transmission as well as all documents transmitted here with
are privileged and confidential information. This information is intended only for the use of the
individual or entity to whom it was sent, and the recipient is obliged to protect this information as
appropriate. If the recipient of the e-mail, and/or the documents attached is not the intended recipient,
you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or reproduction, copy, or storage of this
communication is strictly prohibited.



Melissa Marguez

From: Wesley Smart <wesmart420@aol.com>
Sent: Monday, September 23, 2013 2:55 PM
To: Melissa Marquez

Subject: Abandonment

Yes | agree to pay the $1,000 appraisal fee.

Sent from my iPhone



