Tracy Homfeld

From: Gary Graham <ggraham@mckinneytexas.org>
Sent: Friday, June 20, 2014 6:17 AM

To: Tracy Homfeld

Subject: FW: Custer Road Funding Agreement

Gary Graham, PE, PTOE

CIP & Transportation Engineering Manager
City of McKinney

(972) 547-7438
ggraham@mckinneytexas.org

From: George Purefoy [mailto:GPurefoy@friscotexas.gov]

Sent: Thursday, June 19, 2014 3:46 PM

To: Gary Graham; Tom Muehlenbeck

Cc: Barry Shelton; Mark Hines; Paul Knippel; Brian Moen; Jason Brodigan
Subject: RE: Custer Road Funding Agreement

Gary/Tom
| fully support the agreement as worded below.
Thank you for meeting with me and being willing to work together to reach agreement on the issue.

George

From: Gary Graham [mailto:ggraham@mckinneytexas.org]
Sent: Thursday, June 19, 2014 2:33 PM

To: Tom Muehlenbeck; George Purefoy

Cc: Barry Shelton; Mark Hines

Subject: Custer Road Funding Agreement

Mr. Purefoy and Mr. Muehlenbeck,

As we discussed Tuesday regarding the Custer Road funding agreement, | have reached out to Tracy Homfeld at the
County and briefed her on the agreement between the two cities. Tracy informed me that the ILA between Frisco and
the County will go to the Commissioners Court on July 7" The following is the language | will send to Tracy if you both
agree.

The Cities of Frisco and McKinney have met and agreed to the following resolution regarding the 2007 Bond Funds for
the Custer Road project from SH 121 to Stonebridge Drive.

The City of McKinney would like to transfer the 2007 Bond Funds allocated to the Custer Road project from SH 121 to
Stonebridge Drive to the City of Frisco. This will allow the City of Frisco to proceed with the project. As the City of Frisco
is reimbursed construction costs up to 80 percent of the total construction amount through TxDOT’s Pass-Through
Financing Program, the City of Frisco will reimburse the County an amount proportional to the amount the County
contributed to construction. The County would then make these funds available to the City of McKinney to be used on a
mutually agreed upon project.



Tracy needs this information by Monday to ensure she can revise the agenda packet for the July 7" meeting.

Please let me know if you have any questions.

Gary Graham, PE, PTOE

CIP & Transportation Engineering Manager
City of McKinney

(972) 547-7438
gagraham@mckinneytexas.org

The material in this e-mail is intended only for the use of the individual to whom it is addressed and may
contain information that is confidential, privileged, and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If you are
not the intended recipient, be advised that the unauthorized review, use,disclosure, duplication, distribution, or
the taking of any action in reliance on this information is strictly prohibited. If you have received this e-mail in
error, please notify the sender by return email and destroy all electronic and paper copies of the original
message and any attachments immediately. Please note that neither City of McKinney nor the sender accepts
any responsibility for viruses and it is your responsibility to scan attachments (if any). Thank You.
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