Collin County Bid 2014-324
Bid #2014-324 - ROAD MATERIALS, ASPHALTIC CONCRETE
Creation Date Aug 4, 2014 End Date Sep 4, 2014 2:00:00 PM CDT
Start Date Aug 19, 2014 1:17:01 PM CDT Awarded Date Not Yet Awarded
2014-324--01-01 PLANT SITE MATERIAL PICKUP: Type B Pick Up
Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] [First Offer - $56.00 1/ ton $56.00 Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes: Plant Location: 11481 CR 53, Celina,
TX 75009

Distance to Plant: 17.7

APAC-Texas, Inc. [ [First Offer - $61.00

1/ ton | $61.00 | ¥

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes: Plant Location: Frisco Plant - 14800 SH
121, Frisco, TX 75035

Distance to Plant: varies

2014-324--01-02 PLANT SITE MATERIAL PICKUP: TYPE B with RAP and/or RAS Plant Site Pick Up

Agency Notes:

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] |First Offer - $46.75 | 1/ ton $46.75 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes: Plant Location: 11481 CR 53, Celina,
TX 75009
Distance to Plant: 17.7

APAC -Texas, Inc. [[First Offer - $49.00

1/ ton | $49.00 | Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes: Plant Location: Frisco Plant - 14800 SH
121, Frisco, TX 75035

Distance to Plant: varies

2014-324--01-03 PLANT SITE MATERIAL PICKUP: Type C Pick Up

Agency Notes:

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] |First Offer - $60.00 1/ton $60.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes: Plant Location: 11481 CR 53, Celina,
TX 75009
Distance to Plant: 17.7

APAC-Texas, Inc. [ [First Offer - $63.00

1/ ton [ $63.00 | [y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes: Plant Location: Frisco Plant - 14800 SH
121, Frisco, TX 75035

Distance to Plant: varies

2014-324--01-04 PLANT SITE MATERIAL PICKUP: TYPE C with RAP and/or RAS Plant Site Pick Up

Supplier Unit Price

Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] |[First Offer - $51.00

1/ ton $51.00 Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes: Plant Location: 11481 CR 53, Celina,
TX 75009

Distance to Plant: 17.7

APAC -Texas, Inc. [ [First Offer - $53.00

1/ ton | $53.00 | [ v

9/4/2014

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes: Plant Location: Frisco Plant - 14800 SH
121, Frisco, TX 75035

Distance to Plant: varies
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Collin County Bid 2014-324
2014-324--01-05 PLANT SITE MATERIAL PICKUP: Type D Pick Up
Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] |First Offer - $62.50 1/ton $62.50 Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes: Plant Location: 11481 CR 53, Celina,
TX 75009

Distance to Plant: 17.7

APAC -Texas, Inc. | [First Offer - $64.00

1/ ton $64.00 | | Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes: Plant Location: Frisco Plant - 14800 SH
121, Frisco, TX 75035

Distance to Plant: varies

2014-324--01-06 PLANT SITE MATERIAL PICKUP: TYPE D with RAP and/or RAS Plant Site Pick Up

Supplier Unit Price

Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs

APAC-Texas, Inc.

[First Offer - $51.00

1/ton $51.00 Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes: Plant Location: Frisco Plant - 14800 SH
121, Frisco, TX 75035

Distance to Plant: varies

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | [First Offer - $52.00

1/ ton | $52.00 | | Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes: Plant Location: 11481 CR 53, Celina,
TX 75009

Distance to Plant: 17.7

2014-324--01-07 PLANT SITE MATERIAL PICKUP: Warm Mix Pick Up

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] [First Offer - $53.00 1/ton $53.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes:

Supplier Notes: Plant Location: 11481 CR 53 Celina,
TX 75009
Distance to Plant: 17.7

APAC-Texas, Inc. | [First Offer - $65.00

1/ ton $65.00 | | Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes: Plant Location: Frisco Plant - 14800 SH
121, Frisco, TX 75035

Distance to Plant: varies

2014-324--01-08 PLANT SITE MATERIAL PICKUP: High Performace Cold Mix

Supplier Unit Price

Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | First Offer - $0.00

1/ton $0.00 Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes: Plant Location: 11481 CR 53 Celina,
TX 75009

Distance to Plant: 17.7

No Bid

APAC-Texas, Inc. | [First Offer - $97.00

1/ ton $97.00 | | Y

9/4/2014

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes: Plant Location: Frisco Plant - 14800 SH
121, Frisco, TX 75035

Distance to Plant: varies

2014-324--02-01 SURFACE ZONE 1: TYPE B Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] |Fir5t Offer - $62.50 | 1/ton $62.50 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
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Agency Notes:

Collin County

Supplier Notes:

Bid 2014-324

APAC-Texas, Inc.

| |First Offer - $67.25

1/ ton |

$67.25 | | v

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

2014-324--02-02 SURFACE ZONE 1: Type B with RAP and/or RAS Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] [First Offer - $53.25 1/ ton $53.25 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

APAC-Texas, Inc. | |First Offer - $55.25 [ 1/ton | $55.25 | | v

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

2014-324--02-03 SURFACE ZONE 1: TYPE C Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] |First Offer - $66.50 1/ton $66.50 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

APAC-Texas, Inc. | |First Offer - $69.25 | 1/ ton | $69.25 | | Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

2014-324--02-04 SURFACE ZONE 1: Type C with RAP and/or RAS Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] |First Offer - $57.50 1/ton $57.50 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

APAC -Texas, Inc. [ [First Offer - $59.25 | 1/ ton | $59.25 | [ v

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

2014-324--02-05 SURFACE ZONE 1: TYPE D Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] [First Offer - $69.00 | 1/ton $69.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

APAC-Texas, Inc. | |First Offer - $70.25 | 1/ ton | $70.25 | Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

2014-324--02-06 SURFACE ZONE 1: Type D with RAP and/or RAS Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. |First Offer - $57.25 1/ton $57.25 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | [First Offer - $58.50 | 1/ ton $58.50 | Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

2014-324--02-07 SURFACE ZONE 1: Warm Mix Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | First Offer - $0.00 1/ton $0.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No Bid

APAC -Texas, Inc. | |First Offer - $71.25 | 1/ton | $71.25 | | v

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:

2014-324--02-08 SURFACE ZONE 1: Warm Mix with RAP and/or RAS Delivered

Supplier

| Unit Price | Qty/Unit |

Total Price | Attch. | Docs

9/4/2014
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9/4/2014

Collin County Bid 2014-324

APAC-Texas, Inc. | [First Offer - $58.25 | 1/ ton | $58.25 | | ¥
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | [First Offer - $59.50 [ 1/ ton ] $59.50 | | Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Type D PG 64-22 (RAP and/or RAS)
2014-324--02-09 SURFACE ZONE 1: High Performance Cold Mix

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | First Offer - $0.00 | 1/ton $0.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No Bid

APAC-Texas, Inc. | |First Offer - $108.25 | 1/ ton | $108.25 | Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

2014-324--03-01 SURFACE ZONE 2: TYPE B Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] |First Offer - $64.50 | 1/ton $64.50 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

APAC-Texas, Inc. [ |First Offer - $67.75 | 1/ ton | $67.75 | | v
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

2014-324--03-02 SURFACE ZONE 2: Type B with RAP and/or RAS Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] |First Offer - $55.25 | 1/ ton $55.25 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

APAC-Texas, Inc. | [First Offer - $55.75 | 1/ton | $55.75 | Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

2014-324--03-03 SURFACE ZONE 2: TYPE C Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] |First Offer - $68.50 | 1/ ton $68.50 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
APAC - Texas, Inc. | |First Offer - $69.75 | 1/ ton $69.75 | | v
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

2014-324--03-04 SURFACE ZONE 2: Type C with RAP and/or RAS Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] |First Offer - $59.50 | 1/ton $59.50 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
APAC-Texas, Inc. | [First Offer - $59.75 [ 1/ton $59.75 | | ¥
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

2014-324--03-05 SURFACE ZONE 2: TYPE D Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. [First Offer - $70.25 1/ton $70.25 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | [First Offer - $71.00 | 1/ ton | $71.00 | [ v
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
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9/4/2014

Collin County Bid 2014-324

2014-324--03-06 SURFACE ZONE 2: Type D with RAP and/or RAS Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. |First Offer - $57.75 | 1/ton $57.75 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | [First Offer - $60.50 | 1/ton $60.50 | | %
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

2014-324--03-07 SURFACE ZONE 2: Warm Mix Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | First Offer - $0.00 1/ton $0.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No Bid

APAC-Texas, Inc. | |First Offer - $71.25 [ 1/ton | $71.25 | Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

2014-324--03-08 SURFACE ZONE 2: Warm Mix with RAP and/or RAS Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. [First Offer - $58.75 1/ ton $58.75 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | [First Offer - $61.50 | 1/ton J $61.50 | | Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Type D PG 64-22 (RAP and/or RAS)
2014-324--03-09 SURFACE ZONE 2: High Performance Cold Mix

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | First Offer - $0.00 1/ton $0.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No Bid

APAC-Texas, Inc. | |First Offer - $108.50 | 1/ ton | $108.50 | [ v
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

2014-324--04-01 SURFACE ZONE 3: TYPE B Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] IFirst Offer - $67.00 | 1/ton $67.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
APAC -Texas, Inc. | |First Offer - $69.25 | 1/ ton | $69.25 | [ v
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

2014-324--04-02 SURFACE ZONE 3: Type B with RAP and/or RAS Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. |First Offer - $57.25 | 1/ton $57.25 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | [First Offer - $57.75 | 1/ ton | $57.75 | ¥
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

2014-324--04-03 SURFACE ZONE 3: TYPE C Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] |First Offer - $71.00 | 1/ton $71.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
APAC -Texas, Inc. | [First Offer - $71.25 [ 1/ton $71.25 | | ¥
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
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9/4/2014

Collin County Bid 2014-324
|Agency Notes: |Supplier Notes: |

2014-324--04-04 SURFACE ZONE 3: Type C with RAP and/or RAS Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. |First Offer - $61.25 1/ ton $61.25 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | |First Offer - $62.00 | 1/ton | $62.00 | Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

2014-324--04-05 SURFACE ZONE 3: TYPE D Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. |Fir5t Offer - $72.25 1/ton $72.25 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | [First Offer - $73.50 | 1/ton | $73.50 | [y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

2014-324--04-06 SURFACE ZONE 3: Type D with RAP and/or RAS Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. [First Offer - $59.25 [ 1/ton $59.25 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | |First Offer - $63.00 | 1/ton | $63.00 | Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

2014-324--04-07 SURFACE ZONE 3: Warm Mix Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] ] First Offer - $0.00 | 1/ton $0.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No Bid

APAC -Texas, Inc. | |First Offer - $73.25 | 1/ ton | $73.25 | | v
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

2014-324--04-08 SURFACE ZONE 3: Warm Mix with RAP and/or RAS Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. |First Offer - $60.25 | 1/ton $60.25 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] [ [First Offer - $64.00 | 1/ton | $64.00 | | v
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Type D PG 64-22 (RAP and/or RAS)

2014-324--04-09 SURFACE ZONE 3: High Performance Cold Mix

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | First Offer - $0.00 | 1/ ton $0.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No Bid

APAC -Texas, Inc. | [First Offer - $109.50 [ 1/ton [ $109.50 | Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

2014-324--05-01 SURFACE ZONE 4: TYPE B Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] |First Offer - $64.50 1/ton $64.50 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Iﬂency Notes: Supplier Notes:
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APAC-Texas, Inc.

Collin County

| [First Offer - $66.00

1/ ton |

Bid 2014-324

$66.00 | | v

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

2014-324--05-02

SURFACE ZONE 4: Type B with RAP and/or RAS Delivered

Supplier

Unit Price

Qty/Unit

Total Price | Attch. | Docs

APAC-Texas, Inc. |First Offer - $54.00 1/ ton $54.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | [First Offer - $55.25 | 1/ton | $55.25 | ¥

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

2014-324--05-03

SURFACE ZONE 4: TYPE C Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. [First Offer - $68.00 | 1/ton $68.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] [ [First Offer - $68.50 | 1/ ton $68.50 | Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

2014-324--05-04

SURFACE ZONE 4: Type C with RAP and/or RAS Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. [Fir'.-‘.t Offer - $58.00 1/ ton $58.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | [First Offer - $59.50 | 1/ ton | $59.50 | Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

2014-324--05-05

SURFACE ZONE 4: TYPE D Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. ]First Offer - $69.00 1/ ton $69.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | |First Offer - $71.00 | 1/ton | $71.00 | Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

2014-324--05-06

SURFACE ZONE 4: Type D with RAP and/or RAS Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. [First Offer - $56.00 1/ton $56.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | |First Offer - $60.50 [ 1/ton | $60.50 | Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

2014-324--05-07

SURFACE ZONE 4: Warm Mix Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | First Offer - $0.00 1/ton $0.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No Bid

APAC -Texas, Inc. | |First Offer - $70.00 | 1/ ton $70.00 | | v

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

2014-324--05-08

SURFACE ZONE 4: Warm Mix with RAP

and/or RAS Delivered

Supplier

Unit Price

Qty/Unit

Total Price | Attch. | Docs

APAC-Texas, Inc.

[First Offer - $57.00

1/ton

$57.00 Y

9/4/2014
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Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | |First Offer - $61.50 | 1/ton | $61.50 | | Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Type D PG 64-22 (RAP and/or RAS)

2014-324--05-09 SURFACE ZONE 4: High Performance Cold Mix

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | First Offer - $0.00 | 1/ton $0.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No Bid

APAC-Texas, Inc. | [First Offer - $106.25 | 1/ ton | $106.25 | Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

2014-324--06-01 SURFACE ZONE 5: TYPE B Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] [First Offer - $67.00 | 1/ton $67.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

APAC-Texas, Inc. | |First Offer - $68.25 [ 1/ton | $68.25 | Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

2014-324--06-02 SURFACE ZONE 5: Type B with RAP and/or RAS Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. |First Offer - $56.25 1/ ton $56.25 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] ] |First Offer - $57.75 1/ ton $57.75 | Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

2014-324--06-03 SURFACE ZONE 5: TYPE C Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. |First Offer - $70.25 | 1/ton $70.25 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] [[First Offer - $71.00 | 1/ ton $71.00 | Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

2014-324--06-04 SURFACE ZONE 5: Type C with RAP and/or RAS Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. |First Offer - $60.25 | 1/ ton $60.25 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | [First Offer - $62.00 | 1/ton | $62.00 | | v
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

2014-324--06-05 SURFACE ZONE 5: TYPE D Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. |First Offer - $71.25 1/ton $71.25 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | |First Offer - $73.50 | 1/ton | $73.50 | [ v
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

| 2014-324--06-06 SURFACE ZONE 5: Type D with RAP and/or RAS Delivered
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Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. |First Offer - $58.25 | 1/ton $58.25 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | [First Offer - $63.00 | 1/ton | $63.00 | Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

2014-324--06-07 SURFACE ZONE 5: Warm Mix Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | First Offer - $0.00 | 1/ton $0.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No Bid

APAC-Texas, Inc. | [First Offer - $72.25 [ 1/ton | $72.25 | Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

2014-324--06-08 SURFACE ZONE 5: Warm Mix with RAP and/or RAS Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. |First Offer - $59.25 | 1/ton $59.25 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | [First Offer - $64.00 | 1/ton $64.00 | [ v
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Type D PG 64-22 (RAP and/or RAS)
2014-324--06-09 SURFACE ZONE 5: High Performance Cold mix

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | First Offer - $0.00 1/ton $0.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No Bid

APAC-Texas, Inc. [ [First Offer - $108.50 | 1/ ton $108.50 | Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

2014-324--07-01 SURFACE ZONE 6: TYPE B Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. |First Offer - $69.25 1/ton $69.25 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | [First Offer - $70.50 | 1/ton | $70.50 | | v
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

2014-324--07-02 SURFACE ZONE 6: Type B with RAP and/or RAS Delivered

Supplier Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. |First Offer - $57.25 | 1/ton $57.25 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | [First Offer - $61.25 | 1/ton | $61.25 | | Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

2014-324--07-03 SURFACE ZONE 6: TYPE C Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. |First Offer - $71.25 | 1/ton $71.25 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | [First Offer - $74.50 | 1/ton [ $74.50 | I
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
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2014-324--07-04 SURFACE ZONE 6: Type C with RAP and/or RAS Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. |First Offer - $61.25 1/ ton $61.25 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | |First Offer - $65.50 | 1/ton | $65.50 | | Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

2014-324--07-05 SURFACE ZONE 6: TYPE D Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. |First Offer - $72.25 | 1/ton $72.25 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | [First Offer - $77.00 | 1/ ton | $77.00 | Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

2014-324--07-06 SURFACE ZONE 6: Type D with RAP and/or RAS Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. |First Offer - $59.25 | 1/ton $59.25 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | |First Offer - $66.50 | 1/ ton | $66.50 | Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

2014-324--07-07 SURFACE ZONE 6: Warm Mix Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | First Offer - $0.00 1/ ton $0.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No Bid

APAC-Texas, Inc. | |First Offer - $73.25 | 1/ton | $73.25 | Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

2014-324--07-08 SURFACE ZONE 6: Warm Mix with RAP and/or RAS Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. |First Offer - $60.25 1/ton $60.25 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | |First Offer - $67.50 | 1/ ton | $67.50 | B
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Type D PG 64-22 (RAP and/or RAS)
2014-324--07-09 SURFACE ZONE 6: High Performance Cold Mix

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | First Offer - $0.00 | 1/ ton $0.00 ¥
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No Bid
APAC-Texas, Inc. | [First Offer - $109.50 | 1/ ton [ $109.50 | [ v
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

2014-324--08-01 SURFACE ZONE 7: TYPE B Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. [First Offer - $67.00 | 1/ton $67.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | |First Offer - $67.50 | 1/ ton | $67.50 | | Y
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2014-324--08-02 SURFACE ZONE 7: Type B with RAP and/or RAS Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. [First Offer - $55.00 1/ ton $55.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | [First Offer - $58.25 | 1/ton | $58.25 | Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

2014-324--08-03 SURFACE ZONE 7: TYPE C Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. ]First Offer - $69.00 1/ ton $69.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
|Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | |First Offer - $71.50 | 1/ ton $71.50 | Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

2014-324--08-04 SURFACE ZONE 7: Type C with RAP and/or RAS Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. |First Offer - $59.00 1/ ton $59.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | |First Offer - $62.50 | 1/ton $62.50 | ¥

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

2014-324--08-05 SURFACE ZONE 7: TYPE D Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. [First Offer - $70.00 | 1/ton $70.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | |First Offer - $74.00 | 1/ ton $74.00 | L ¥

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

2014-324--08-06 SURFACE ZONE 7: Type D with RAP and/or RAS Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. |First Offer - $57.00 | 1/ton $57.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | [First Offer - $63.50 | 1/ ton | $63.50 | Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

2014-324--08-07 SURFACE ZONE 7: Warm Mix Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | First Offer - $0.00 | 1/ ton $0.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Plant Location: 11481 CR 53 Celina,
TX 75009
No Bid
APAC-Texas, Inc. | [First Offer - $71.00 | 1/ton [ $71.00 | | v

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

121, Frisco, TX 75035

Supplier Notes: Plant Location: Frisco Plant - 14800 SH

[ 2014-324--08-08 SURFACE ZONE 7: Warm Mix with RAP and/or RAS Delivered
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Agency Notes:

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. |First Offer - $58.00 | 1/ton $58.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad]

| |First Offer - $64.50

1/ ton | $64.50 | [ v

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes: Type D PG 64-22 (RAP and/or RAS)

2014-324--08-09 SURFACE ZONE 7: High Performance Cold Mix

Supplier

Unit Price

Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad]

| First Offer - $0.00

1/ ton $0.00 Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes: No Bid

APAC-Texas, Inc.

| |First Offer - $108.25

1/ ton | $108.25 | Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

2014-324--09-01 SURFACE ZONE 8: TYPE B Delivered

Agency Notes:

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. |First Offer - $69.00 | 1/ton $69.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad]

[[First Offer - $72.00

1/ ton $72.00 | Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

2014-324--09-02 SURFACE ZONE 8: Type B with RAP and/or RAS Delivered

Agency Notes:

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. |First Offer - $57.00 | 1/ton $57.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad]

| |First Offer - $62.75

1/ ton | $62.75 | Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

2014-324--09-03 SURFACE ZONE 8: TYPE C Delivered

Agency Notes:

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. |[First Offer - $71.00 | 1/ ton $71.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad]

| [First Offer - $76.00

1/ton | $76.00 | | v

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

2014-324--09-04 SURFACE ZONE 8: Type C with RAP and/or RAS Delivered

Agency Notes:

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. }First Offer - $61.00 1/ton $61.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad]

| [First Offer - $67.00

1/ton | $67.00 | | ¥

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Supplier Notes:

2014-324--09-05 SURFACE ZONE 8: TYPE D Delivered

Agency Notes:

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. ]First Offer - $72.00 1/ ton $72.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad]

| [First Offer - $78.50

1/ton $78.50 | Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:

9/4/2014

BidSync

Bid 2014-324

p. 13



9/4/2014

Collin County Bid 2014-324

2014-324--09-06 SURFACE ZONE 8: Type D with RAP and/or RAS Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. |First Offer - $59.00 | 1/ton $59.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | [First Offer - $68.00 | 1/ ton | $68.00 | | »
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

2014-324--09-07 SURFACE ZONE 8: Warm Mix Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | First Offer - $0.00 | 1/ton $0.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
|Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No Bid
APAC -Texas, Inc. | [First Offer - $73.00 | 1/ton $73.00 | "
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

2014-324--09-08 SURFACE ZONE 8: Warm Mix with RAP and/or RAS Delivered

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
APAC-Texas, Inc. |First Offer - $60.00 [ 1/ton $60.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | [First Offer - $69.00 | 1/ ton $69.00 | [
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Type D PG 64-22 (RAP and/or RAS)
2014-324--09-09 SURFACE ZONE 8: High Performance Cold Mix

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] | First Offer - $0.00 | 1/ton $0.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No Bid
APAC -Texas, Inc. | [First Offer - $109.50 | 1/ ton $109.50 | | ¥
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Supplier Totals

Austin Bridge & Road [Ad] $4,043.75 (80/80 items)

Bid Contact Terri Paske
tpaske@austin-ind.com
Ph 214-596-7300

Agency Notes: S

Address 6330 commerce Dr., #150

Irving, TX 75063

upplier Notes:

APAC-Texas, Inc.

Bid Contact Chris Michael
cmichael@apac.com
Ph 972-951-8464
Fax 972-248-0422

$5,480.25 (80/80 items)

Address PO Box 224048

Dallas, TX 75222-4048

Bid Notes  Collin Co. will be allowed to pick up mix at the following APAC plants:
APAC-Leston Plant
4525 Leston Ave.
Dallas TX 75247
APAC-Sunnyvale Plant
4303 E. Scyene Rd.
Sunnyvale TX 75181
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Collin Co. will be allowed to pick up mix at the following
APAC plants:
APAC-Leston Plant
4525 Leston Ave.
Dallas TX 75247
APAC-Sunnyvale Plant
BidSync
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4303 E. Scyene Rd.
Sunnyvale TX 75181
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