RECOMMENDED VENDOR AWARDS (SECONDARY VENDOR)
IFB 2014-324 ROAD MATERIALS, ASPHALTIC CONCRETE

LINE ITEM DESCRIPTION COST PER TON
01-01 Plant Site Material, Type B Pickup PAC Texas Inc. $61.00
01-02 Plant Site Material, Type B with RAP and/or RAS Pickup APAC Texas Inc. $49.00
01-03 Plant Site Material, Type C Pickup APAC Texas Inc. $63.00
01-04 Plant Site Material, Type C with RAP and/or RAS, Pickup APAC Texas Inc. $53.00
01-05 Plant Site Material, Type D, Pickup APAC Texas inc. $64.00
01-06 Plant Site Material, Type D with RAP and/or RAS Pickup Austin Asphalt LP $52.00
01-07 Plant Site Material, Pickup, Warm Mix APAC Texas inc. 565.00
01-08 Plant Site Material, High Performance Cold Mix NG BID
02-01 Surface Zone 1: Type B Delivered APAC Texas Inc. $67.25
02-02 Surface Zone 1: Type B with RAP and/or RAS Delivered APAC Texas Inc. $55.25
02-03 Surface Zone: Type C Delivered APAC Texas Inc. $69.25
02-04 Surface Zone 1: Type C with RAP and/or RAS Delivered APAC Texas Inc. $59.25
02-05 Surface Zone 1: Type D Delivered APAC Texas Inc, §70.25
02-06 Surface Zone 1: Type D with RAP and/or RAS Delivered Austin Asphalt LP S58.50
02-07 Surface Zone 1: Warm Mix Delivered NO BID

Surface Zone 1: Warm Mix with RAP and/or RAS
02-08 Delivered Austin Asphalt LP $59.50
02-09 Surface Zone 1: High Performance Cold Mix NG BID
03-01 Surface Zone 2: Type B Delivered APAC Texas Inc. $67.75
03-02 Surface Zone 2: Type B with RAP and/or RAS Delivered APAC Texas Inc. $55.75
03-03 Surface Zone 2: Type C Delivered APAC Texas Inc. $69.75




03-04 Surface Zone 2: Type C with RAP and/or RAS Delivered APAC Texas Inc. $59.75
03-05 Surface Zone 2: Type D Delivered Austin Asphalt LP $71.00
03-06 Surface Zone 2: Type D with RAP and/or RAS Delivered Austin Asphalt P $60.50
03-07 Surface Zone 2: Warm Mix Delivered NO BID

Surface Zone 2: Warm Mix with RAP and/or RAS
03-08 Delivered Austin Asphalt LP $61.50
03-09 Surface Zone 2: High Performance Cold Mix NO BID
04-01 Surface Zone 3: Type B Delivered APAC Texas Inc. $69.25
04-02 Surface Zone 3: Type B with RAP and/or RAS Delivered Austin Asphalt LP §57.75
04-03 Surface Zone: Type C Delivered APAC Texas Inc, §71.25
04-04 Surface Zone 3: Type C with RAP and/or RAS Delivered Austin Asphalt LP $62.00
04-05 Surface Zone 3: Type D Delivered Austin Asphalt LP $73.50
04-06 Surface Zone 3: Type D with RAP and/or RAS Delivered Austin Asphalt LP $63.00
04-07 Surface Zone 3: Warm Mix Delivered NOBID

Surface Zone 3: Warm Mix with RAP and/or RAS
04-08 Delivered Austin Asphalt LP $64.00
04-09 Surface Zone 3: High Performance Cold Mix NO BID
05-01 Surface Zone 4: Type B Delivered APAC Texas inc. $66.00
05-02 Surface Zone 4: Type B with RAP and/or RAS Delivered Ausint $55.25
05-03 Surface Zone 4: Type C Delivered Austin Asphalt LP $68.50
05-04 Surface Zone 4: Type C with RAP and/or RAS Delivered Austin Asphalt LP $59.50
05-05 Surface Zone 4: Type D Delivered Austin Asphalt LP $71.00
05-06 Surface Zone 4: Type D with RAP and/or RAS Delivered Austin Asphalt LP $60.50
05-07 Surface Zone 4: Warm Mix Delivered NO BID

Surface Zone 4: Warm Mix with RAP and/or RAS
05-08 Delivered Austin Asphalt LP $61.50
05-09 Surface Zone 4: High Performance Cold Mix NO BID




06-01 Surface Zone 5: Type B Delivered APAC Texas inc. 568.25
06-02 surface Zone 5: Type B with RAP and/or RAS Delivered Austin Asphalt LP $57.75
06-03 Surface Zone 5: Type C Delivered Austin Asphalt LP $71.00
06-04 Surface Zone 5: Type C with RAP and/or RAS Delivered Austin Asphalt LP $62.00
06-05 Surface Zone 5: Type D Delivered Austin Asphalt LP $73.50
06-06 Surface Zone 5: Type D with RAP and/or RAS Delivered Austin Asphalt LP $63.00
06-07 Surface Zone 5: Warm Mix Delivered NO BID
Surface Zone 5: Warm Mix with RAP and/or RAS

06-08 Delivered Ausitn $64.00
06-09 Surface Zone 5: High Performance Cold Mix NO BID

07-01 Surface Zone 6: Type B Delivered Austin Asphalt LP $70.50
07-02 Surface Zone 6: Type B with RAP and/or RAS Delivered Austin Asphalt LP $62.25
07-03 Surface Zone 6: Type C Delivered Austin Asphalt LP $74.50
07-04 Surface Zone 6: Type C with RAP and/or RAS Delivered Austin Asphalt LP $66.50
07-05 Surface Zone 6: Type D Delivered Austin Asphalt LP $77.00
07-06 Surface Zone 6: Type D with RAP and/or RAS Delivered Austin Asphalt LP $66.50
07-07 Surface Zone 6: Warm Mix Delivered NO BID

Surface Zone 6: Warm Mix with RAP and/or RAS

07-08 Delivered Austin Asphalt LP $67.50
07-09 Surface Zone 6; High Performance Cold Mis NO BID

08-01 Surface Zone 7: Type B Delivered Austin Asphalt LP $67.50
08-02 Surface Zone 7: Type B with RAP and/or RAS Delivered Austin Asphalt LP $58.25
08-03 Surface Zone 7: Type C Delivered Austin Asphalt LP 571.50
08-04 Surface Zone 7: Type C with RAP and/or RAS Delivered Austin Asphalt LP $62.50
08-05 Surface Zone 7: Type D Delivered Austin Asphalt LP $74.00
08-06 Surface Zone 7: Type D with RAP and/or RAS Austin Asphalt LP $63.50

08-07

Surface Zone 7:

Warm Mix Delivered

NO BID




Surface Zone 7. Warm Mix with RAP and/or RAS

08-08 Delivered Austin Asphalt LP $64.50
08-09 Surface Zone 7: High Performance Cold Mix NO BID
09-01 Surface Zone 8: Type B Delivered Austin Asphalt LP 572.00
09-02 Surface Zone 8: Type B with RAP and/or RAS Delivered Austin Asphalt LP $62.75
09-03 Surface Zone 8: Type C Delivered Austin Asphalt LP $76.00
09-04 Surface Zone 8: Type C with RAP and/or RAS Delivered Austin Asphalt LP $67.00
09-05 Surface Zone 8: Type D Delivered Austin Asphalt LP $78.50
09-06 Surface Zone 8: Type D with RAP and/or RAS Delivered Austin Asphalt LP $68.00
09-07 Surface Zone 8: Warm Mix Delivered NO BID
Surface Zone 8: Warm Mix with RAP and/or RAS
09-08 Delivered Austin Asphalt LP $69.00
09-09 Surface Zone 8: High Performance Cold Mix NO BID




