Bid Tabulation

IFB 2015-145
David's Paint &
Light Duty Vehicle Metro Fleet El Dorado Body
Item # Item Qty [ Unit Price Price Price
2015-145--01-01 Body Repair Labor 1 hour 38.00 38.00 38.00
2015-145--01-02 Frame Repair Labor| 1 hour 38.00 38.00 38.00
2015-145--01-03 Glass Repair Labor 1 hour 38.00 38.00 38.00
2015-145--01-04 Materials Labor 1 hour 5.00 32.00 30.00
2015-145--01-05 Mechanical Labor 1 hour 95.00 95.00 95.00
Paint Technician
2015-145--01-06 Labor 1 hour 38.00 38.00 38.00
Paint Supplies
2015-145--01-07 Labor 1 hour 30.00 32.00 30.00
Discount Off OEM
Replacement Parts-
2015-145--01-08 Domestic 1 each 10% 0 5%
Discount Off OEM
Replacement Parts-
2015-145--01-09 Import 1 each 10% 0 5%
Discount Off
Aftermarket/Used
2015-145--01-10 Replacement Parts 1 each 10% 0 5%
flat rate
per
2015-145--01-11 Towing 1 event No Bid No Bid No Bid

Overall Lowest & Best Bid
Overall 2nd Lowest & Best Bid
Martin's is non-responsive. Does not meet requirement
of 30 miles from Service Center for Light Duty Vehicles.
Robertson's did not bid on Light Duty Vehicles.




Bid Tabulation

IFB 2015-145
David's Paint &
Medium Duty Vehicle Metro Fleet Body
Item # Item Qty | Unit Price Price
2015-145--02-01 Body Repair Labor 1|hour 46.00 38.00
2015-145--02-02 Frame Repair Labor 1|hour 46.00 38.00
2015-145--02-03 Glass Repair Labor 1|{hour 38.00 38.00
2015-145--02-04 Materials Labor 1|hour 5.00 30.00
2015-145--02-05 Mechanical Labor 1|hour 95.00 95.00
Paint Technician
2015-145--02-06 Labor 1|{hour 46.00 38.00
Paint Supplies
2015-145--02-07 Labor 1|hour 30.00 30.00
Discount Off OEM
2015-145--02-08 Replacement Parts 1leach 10% 5%
Discount Ott
Aftermarket/Used
2015-145--02-09 Replacement Parts 1leach 10% 5%
tlat rate
per
2015-145--02-10 Towing 1levent No Bid No Bid

Overall Lowest & Best Bid
Overall 2nd Lowest & Best Bid

Martin's, El Dorado and Robertson's did not bid on all items

for Medium Duty Vehicle.




Bid Tabulation

IFB 2015-145
David's Paint &
Heavy Duty Vehicle Metro Fleet Body

2015-145--03-01 Body Repair Labor hour 55.00 38.00
2015-145--03-02 Frame Repair Labor hour 55.00 38.00
2015-145--03-03 Glass Repair Labor hour 38.00 38.00
2015-145--03-04 Materials Labor hour 5.00 30.00
2015-145--03-05 Mechanical Labor hour 95.00 95.00

Paint Technician
2015-145--03-06 Labor hour 55.00 38.00

Paint Supplies
2015-145--03-07 Labor hour 30.00 30.00

Discount Ot OEM

Replacement Parts-
2015-145--03-08 Domestic each 5% 5%

Discount Off

Aftermarket/Used
2015-145--03-09 Replacement Parts each 5% 5%

tlat rate
per

2015-145--03-10 Towing event No Bid No Bid

Overall Lowest & Best Bid
Overall 2nd Lowest & Best Bid

Martin's and Robertson's did not bid on all items for Heavy
Duty Vehicle. El Dorado did not bid on Heavy Duty




