
IFB 2015-344

SUPPLIES, OEM TONER CARTRIDGES FOR LASER AND INKJET PRINTERS

VENDORS

LINE 
ITEMS MODEL# DESCRIPTION
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ANNUAL 
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ANNUAL 
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ANNUAL 
COST

#1
C734, C736 
BLACK

LEXMARK BLACK RETURN 
TONER CARTRIDGE 325 104.50$    33,962.50$   90.00$      29,250.00$             102.56$     33,332.00$   112.38$    36,523.50$    132.00$      42,900.00$     127.47$     41,427.75$    135.14$    43,920.50$   139.99$     45,496.75$    105.87$    34,407.75$    130.66$   42,464.50$    153.55$     49,903.75$   133.38$      43,348.50$    

#2
C734, C736, 
CYAN

LEXMARK CYAN RETURN 
TONER CARTRIDGE 217 165.50$    35,913.50$   132.00$    28,644.00$             160.35$     34,795.95$   178.49$    38,732.33$    185.00$      40,145.00$     202.50$     43,942.50$    214.73$    46,596.41$   259.99$     56,417.83$    167.48$    36,343.16$    207.62$   45,053.54$    244.00$     52,948.00$   181.31$      39,344.27$    

#3
C734, C736, 
MAGENTA

LEXMARK MAGENTA 
RETURN TONER CARTRIDGE 194 165.50$    32,107.00$   132.00$    25,608.00$             160.35$     31,107.90$   179.35$    34,793.90$    185.00$      35,890.00$     202.50$     39,285.00$    214.73$    41,657.62$   229.99$     44,618.06$    167.48$    32,491.12$    207.62$   40,278.28$    244.00$     47,336.00$   181.31$      35,174.14$    

#4
C734, C736, 
YELLOW

LEXMARK YELLOW 
RETURN TONER CARTRIDGE 231 165.50$    38,230.50$   132.00$    30,492.00$             160.35$      37,040.85$   178.86$    41,316.66$    185.00$      42,735.00$     202.50$     46,777.50$    214.73$    49,602.63$   239.99$     55,437.69$    167.48$    38,687.88$    207.62$   47,960.22$    244.00$     56,364.00$   181.31$      41,882.61$    

#5
C734, C736, 
PC UNIT

LEXMARK 
PHOTOCONDUCTOR UNIT 771 32.00$      24,672.00$   29.63$      22,844.73$             32.17$       24,803.07$   26.96$      20,786.16$    36.00$        27,756.00$     30.60$       23,592.60$    32.47$      25,034.37$   35.99$       27,748.29$    33.87$      26,113.77$    31.39$     24,201.69$    37.62$       29,005.02$   35.32$        27,231.72$    

#6

C734, C736, 
WASTE 
TONER

LEXMARK WASTE TONER 
BOTTLE 6 8.10$        48.60$          7.79$        46.74$                    8.74$         52.44$          7.29$        43.74$           13.00$        78.00$            8.39$         50.34$           8.53$        51.18$          10.88$       65.28$           10.89$      65.34$           8.90$       53.40$           10.65$       63.90$          10.92$        65.52$           

#7 C734, C736
LEXMARK 110-120V FUSER 
MAINTENANCE KIT NO HISTORY 100.00$    204.84$    174.04$     199.99$    223.00$      189.48$     232.28$    229.78$     212.47$    210.46$   226.00$     208.36$      

#8 C734, C736
LEXMARK TRANSFER 
MODULE KIT NO HISTORY 167.00$    184.23$    171.34$     178.98$    198.00$      170.29$     207.88$    199.77$     191.10$    192.64$   210.15$     No Bid

#9
T654 TONER 
CARTRIDGE

LEXMARK HIGH-YIELD 
BLACK TONER CARTRIDGE 99 306.50$    30,343.50$   299.00$    29,601.00$             297.88$     29,490.12$   353.42$    34,988.58$    305.00$      30,195.00$     403.95$     39,991.05$    417.71$    41,353.29$   299.78$     29,678.22$    312.46$    30,933.54$    411.40$   40,728.60$    476.75$     47,198.25$   419.99$      41,579.01$    

#10
T650, T652, 
T654

LEXMARK 110-120V FUSER 
MAINTENANCE KIT, BLACK NO HISTORY 85.00$      125.00$    226.38$     266.93$    249.00$      253.98$     310.48$    249.99$     283.60$    274.80$   318.68$     277.21$      

#11
X954DHE 
BLACK

LEXMARK HIGH-YIELD 
BLACK TONER CARTRIDGE 41 81.90$      3,357.90$     91.88$      3,767.08$               82.94$       3,400.54$     83.61$      3,428.01$      99.00$        4,059.00$       94.88$       3,890.08$      99.18$      4,066.38$     115.70$     4,743.70$      83.87$      3,438.67$      97.35$     3,991.35$      116.62$     4,781.42$     103.81$      4,256.21$      

#12
X954DHE 
CYAN

LEXMARK HIGH-YIELD 
CYAN TONER CARTRIDGE 31 387.40$    12,009.40$   300.00$    9,300.00$               377.69$     11,708.39$   394.66$    12,234.46$    380.00$      11,780.00$     448.31$     13,897.61$    467.31$    14,486.61$   489.78$     15,183.18$    392.15$    12,156.65$    459.75$   14,252.25$    540.94$     16,769.14$   482.52$      14,958.12$    

#13
X954DHE 
MAGENTA

LEXMARK HIGH-YIELD 
MAGENTA TONER 
CARTRIDGE 28 387.40$    10,847.20$   300.00$    8,400.00$               377.69$     10,575.32$   394.93$    11,058.04$    380.00$      10,640.00$     448.31$     12,552.68$    467.31$    13,084.68$   489.78$     13,713.84$    392.15$    10,980.20$    459.79$   12,874.12$    540.91$     15,145.48$   482.52$      13,510.56$    

#14
X954DHE 
YELLOW

LEXMARK HIGH-YIELD 
YELLOW TONER 
CARTRIDGE 20 387.40$    7,748.00$     300.00$    6,000.00$               377.69$     7,553.80$     394.91$    7,898.20$      380.00$      7,600.00$       448.31$     8,966.20$      467.31$    9,346.20$     489.78$     9,795.60$      392.15$    7,843.00$      459.75$   9,195.00$      540.91$     10,818.20$   482.52$      9,650.40$      

#15
X954DHE PC 
UNIT

LEXMARK BLACK 
PHOTOCONDUCTOR UNIT 23 215.10$    4,947.30$     159.00$    3,657.00$               210.80$     4,848.40$     188.67$    4,339.41$      206.00$      4,738.00$       212.98$     4,898.54$      226.12$    226.12$        239.99$     5,519.77$      218.20$    5,018.60$      218.35$   5,022.05$      256.62$     5,902.26$     233.00$      5,359.00$      

#16
X954DHE 
TONER

LEXMARK WASTE TONER 
BOTTLE 120  $       27.00 3,240.00$      $      24.87 2,984.40$                $       27.92 3,350.40$      $      24.78 2,973.60$       $         29.00 3,480.00$        $        25.88 3,105.60$       $       27.28 27.28$           $        32.66 3,919.20$      28.79$      3,454.80$      27.00$     3,240.00$      31.57$       3,788.40$     30.00$        3,600.00$      

#17 X954
LEXMARK 110-120V FUSER 
MAINTENANCE KIT NO HISTORY  $     200.00  $    564.56  $     598.96  $    564.84  $       619.00  $      543.63  $     679.87  $      689.99 611.51$    617.31$   No Bid No Bid

#18
MS810 
IMAGING LEXMARK IMAGING UNIT 18  $       38.60 694.80$        39.17$       705.06$                  40.14$        722.52$         $      33.65 605.70$          $         48.00 864.00$           $        38.79 698.22$         40.53$       729.54$        48.66$        875.88$         44.36$      798.48$         39.18$     705.24$         46.95$       845.10$        45.72$        822.96$         

#19 MS810, MS811
LEXMARK 110-120V FUSER 
MAINTENANCE KIT, BLACK NO HISTORY 100.00$    218.71$    250.50$     238.87$    240.00$      224.20$     280.95$    259.99$     252.77$    246.20$   305.19$     255.51$      

#20
CS510DE 
BLACK 

LEXMARK HIGH-YIELD 
BLACK TONER CARTRIDGE 338 91.50$      30,927.00$   85.70$      28,966.60$             84.64$       28,608.32$   72.50$      24,505.00$    89.00$        30,082.00$     82.64$       27,932.32$    87.33$      29,517.54$   89.78$       30,345.64$    84.45$      28,544.10$    84.44$     28,540.72$    101.16$     34,192.08$   90.34$        30,534.92$    

#21
CS510DE 
CYAN 

LEXMARK HIGH-YIELD 
CYAN TONER CARTRIDGE 156 91.50$      14,274.00$   113.56$    17,715.36$             91.39$       14,256.84$   97.85$      15,264.60$    115.00$      17,940.00$     111.53$     17,398.68$    117.87$    18,387.72$   42.88$       6,689.28$      91.65$      14,297.40$    113.95$   17,776.20$    133.93$     20,893.08$   121.16$      18,900.96$    

#22
CS510DE 
MAGENTA 

LEXMARK HIGH-YIELD 
MAGENTA TONER 
CARTRIDGE 148 91.50$      13,542.00$   113.56$    16,806.88$             91.39$       13,525.72$   97.85$      14,481.80$    115.00$      17,020.00$     111.53$     16,506.44$    117.87$    17,444.76$   119.99$     17,758.52$    113.85$    16,849.80$    113.95$   16,864.60$    136.53$     20,206.44$   121.16$      17,931.68$    

#23
CS510DE 
YELLOW 

LEXMARK HIGH-YIELD 
YELLOW TONER 
CARTRIDGE 140 91.50$      12,810.00$   113.56$    15,898.40$             91.39$       12,794.60$   97.85$      13,699.00$    115.00$      16,100.00$     111.53$     15,614.20$    117.87$    16,501.80$   124.99$     17,498.60$    91.65$      12,831.00$    113.95$   15,953.00$    133.93$     18,750.20$   121.16$      16,962.40$    

#24

MS810 HIGH 
YIELD 
BLACK 
TONER 
CARTRIDGE

LEXMARK HIGH-YIELD 
BLACK TONER CARTRIDGE 79 257.00$    20,303.00$   347.69$    27,467.51$             251.38$     19,859.02$   298.11$    23,550.69$    318.00$      25,122.00$     336.64$     26,594.56$    359.08$    28,367.32$   199.99$     15,799.21$    263.21$    20,793.59$    347.19$   27,428.01$    415.94$     32,859.26$   365.42$      28,868.18$    

#25 X745 - 748
LEXMARK HIGH-YIELD 
BLACK TONER CARTRIDGE 84 156.00$    13,104.00$   140.00$    11,760.00$             150.18$     12,615.12$   138.89$    11,666.76$    157.00$      13,188.00$     149.86$     12,588.24$    155.64$    13,073.76$   169.99$     14,279.16$    153.64$    12,905.76$    No Bid No Bid No Bid

#26
X745 - 748 
CYAN

LEXMARK CYAN TONER 
CARTRIDGE 37 144.00$    5,328.00$     160.00$    5,920.00$               142.73$     5,281.01$     160.76$    5,948.12$      159.00$      5,883.00$       167.55$     6,199.35$      174.37$    6,451.69$     189.78$     7,021.86$      146.58$    5,423.46$      171.13$   6,331.81$      201.12$     7,441.44$     180.80$      6,689.60$      

#27
X745 - 748 
MAGENTA

LEXMARK MAGENTA 
TONER CARTRIDGE 47 144.00$    6,768.00$     160.00$    7,520.00$               142.73$     6,708.31$     160.76$    7,555.72$      159.00$      7,473.00$       167.55$     7,874.85$      174.37$    8,195.39$     189.78$     8,919.66$      146.58$    6,889.26$      171.13$   8,043.11$      201.12$     9,452.64$     180.80$      8,497.60$      

LIMITLESS OFFICE 
PRODUCTS CNI OFFICE SUPPLIES

CORE CHANGE 
MANAGEMENT LD PRODUCTSUNITED RIBBON

SPREADSHEET EVALUATION

ENHANCED LASER 
PRODUCTS THE OFFICE PAL STAPLES OFFICE DEPOT LASERLINK INT'L

SOUTHERN COMPUTER 
WAREHOUSE KOMPUTER PLUS 



#28
X745 - 748 
YELLOW

LEXMARK YELLOW TONER 
CARTRIDGE 22 144.00$    3,168.00$     160.00$    3,520.00$               142.73$     3,140.06$     160.76$    3,536.72$      159.00$      3,498.00$       167.55$     3,686.10$      174.37$    3,836.14$     189.78$     4,175.16$      146.58$    3,224.76$      171.13$   3,764.86$      201.12$     4,424.64$     180.80$      3,977.60$      

#29

MS415DN-
MS510DN 
BLACK 
TONER

LEXMARK HIGH-YIELD 
BLACK TONER CARTRIDGE 188 99.00$      18,612.00$   136.91$    25,739.08$             97.23$       18,279.24$   106.52$    20,025.76$    129.00$      24,252.00$     120.07$     22,573.16$    128.12$    24,086.56$   129.99$     24,438.12$    100.33$    18,862.04$    123.87$   23,287.56$    145.58$     27,369.04$   131.49$      24,720.12$    

#30

MS415DN-
MS510DN 
DRUM LEXMARK IMAGING UNT 17 36.00$      612.00$        36.62$      622.54$                  37.53$       638.01$        31.46$      534.82$         48.00$        816.00$          36.80$       625.60$         37.89$      644.13$        42.88$       728.96$         41.35$      702.95$         36.64$     622.88$         43.89$       746.13$        42.50$        722.50$         

#31
C746, C748 
BLACK

LEXMARK BLACK TONER 
CARTRIDGE 31 163.00$    5,053.00$     170.00$    5,270.00$               150.18$     4,655.58$     154.59$    4,792.29$      159.00$      4,929.00$       160.48$     4,974.88$      201.34$    6,241.54$     169.78$     5,263.18$      165.32$    5,124.92$      No Bid No Bid No Bid

#32
C746, C748 
CYAN

LEXMARK CYAN TONER 
CARTRIDGE 16 172.00$    2,752.00$     170.00$    2,720.00$               168.41$     2,694.56$     177.16$    2,834.56$      195.00$      3,120.00$       202.43$     3,238.88$      208.37$    3,333.92$     219.99$     3,519.84$      175.60$    2,809.60$      205.24$   3,283.84$      241.19$     3,859.04$     216.39$      3,462.24$      

#33
C746, C748 
MAGENTA

LEXMARK MAGENTA 
TONER CARTRIDGE 24 172.00$    4,128.00$     170.00$    4,080.00$               168.41$     4,041.84$     177.15$    4,251.60$      195.00$      4,680.00$       202.43$     4,858.32$      208.37$    5,000.88$     219.99$     5,279.76$      175.60$    4,214.40$      205.24$   4,925.76$      241.19$     5,788.56$     216.39$      5,193.36$      

#34
C746, C748 
YELLOW

LEXMARK YELLOW TONER 
CARTRIDGE 23 172.00$    3,956.00$     170.00$    3,910.00$               168.41$     3,873.43$     177.81$    4,089.63$      195.00$      4,485.00$       202.43$     4,655.89$      208.37$    4,792.51$     219.99$     5,059.77$      175.60$    4,038.80$      205.34$   4,722.82$      241.19$     5,547.37$     216.39$      4,976.97$      

#35

CS410-CS510 
WASTE 
TONER

LEXMARK HIGH-YIELD 
BLACK/COLOR WASTE 
TONER CARTRIDGE 46 7.00$        322.00$        8.08$        371.68$                  8.44$         388.24$        7.21$        331.66$         18.00$        828.00$          8.53$         392.38$         8.69$        399.74$        10.78$       495.88$         9.21$        423.66$         9.06$       416.76$         10.83$       498.18$        11.07$        509.22$         

#36
CS310, 
CS410, CS510

LEXMARK 110-120V FUSER 
MAINTENANCE KIT NO HISTORY  $     110.00  $    237.46  $     224.47  $    257.93  $       199.00  $      244.37  $     305.74  $      328.29 272.24$    271.43$   No Bid 276.61$      

#37

CS310dn, 
CS410dn, 
CS510de

LEXMARK HIGH-YIELD 
BLACK/COLOR IMAGING 
KIT NO HISTORY  $     205.00  $    212.98  $     201.45  $    179.48  $       219.00  $      204.29  $     215.82  $      239.78 215.02$    208.67$   245.24$     231.96$      

#38
MS510, 
MS510DN

LEXMARK 110-120V FUSER 
MAINTENANCE KIT, BLACK NO HISTORY 110.00$     $    212.98 204.22$     253.13$    219.00$      243.09$     278.15$    No Bid 246.83$    252.14$   No Bid No Bid

#42

HP 
DESIGNJET 
T1300

HP 72 69 ml PHOTO BLACK 
INK CARTRIDGE NO HISTORY 41.00$      35.28$      38.88$       34.57$      39.00$        39.51$       41.35$      46.99$       39.40$      No Bid 45.46$       46.91$        

#43

HP 
DESIGNJET 
T1300

HP 72 69 ml CYAN INK 
CARTRIDGE NO HISTORY 41.00$      35.28$      38.88$       34.57$      39.00$        39.51$       41.35$      46.99$       39.40$      No Bid 45.46$       46.91$        

#44

HP 
DESIGNJET 
T1300

HP 72 69 ml MAGENTA INK 
CARTRIDGE NO HISTORY 41.00$      35.28$      38.88$       34.57$      39.00$        39.51$       41.35$      46.99$       39.40$      No Bid 45.46$       46.91$        

#45

HP 
DESIGNJET 
T1300

HP 72 69 ml YELLOW INK 
CARTRIDGE NO HISTORY 41.00$      35.28$      38.88$       34.57$      39.00$        39.51$       41.35$      46.99$       39.40$      No Bid 45.46$       46.91$        

#46

HP 
DESIGNJET 
T1300

HP 72 69 ml GRAY INK 
CARTRIDGE NO HISTORY 41.00$      35.28$      38.88$       34.57$      39.00$        39.51$       41.35$      46.99$       39.40$      No Bid 45.46$       46.91$        

5,786.40$ 393,781.20$ 6,430.18$ 379,588.06$           6,650.20$  384,141.60$ 6,982.19$ 406,791.02$  7,249.00$   442,276.00$   7,505.80$  458,789.52$  8,230.92$ 476,458.21$ 7,885.86$  480,485.89$  7,080.94$ 400,668.46$  7,312.29$ 451,982.17$  7,466.37$  532,897.02$ 6,683.70$   452,730.37$  

960.90$    3,679.90$     1,844.00$ 170,952.00$           1,455.00$  89,251.19$   687.86$    61,115.78$    199.99$     15,799.21$    

340,798.08$       

#39

DISCOUNT OFF PRICE LIST 
FOR ALL OTHER LEXMARK 
PRINTER HEADS NOT 
SPECIFIED ABOVE NO HISTORY 20.00% 20.00% 18.00% 10.00% 20.00% 10.00% 20.00% 0.00%

No 
Response No Bid No Bid 15.00%

#40

DISCOUNT OFF PRICE LIST 
FOR ALL OTHER LEXMARK 
MAINTENANCE KITS NOT 
SPECIFIED ABOVE NO HISTORY 20.00% 20.00% 18.00% 10.00% 25.00% 10.00% 20.00% 0.00%

No 
Response No Bid

No 
Response 15.00%

#41

DISCOUNT OFF PRICE LIST 
FOR ALL OTHER LEXMARK 
FUSER KITS NOT SPECIFIED 
ABOVE NO HISTORY 20.00% 20.00% 18.00% 10.00% 26.00% 10.00% 20.00% 0.00%

No 
Response No Bid No Bid 15.00%

#47

DISCOUNT OFF PRICE LIST 
FOR ALL OTHER HEWLETT 
PACKARD PRINTER HEADS 
NOT SPECIFIED ABOVE NO HISTORY 30.00% 20.00% 25.00% 10.00% 22.00% 10.00% 20.00% 0.00% 20.00% No Bid No Bid 15.00%

#48

DISCOUNT OFF PRICE LIST 
FOR ALL OTHER HEWLETT 
PACKARD FUSER KITS NOT 
SPECIFIED ABOVE NO HISTORY 20.00% 20.00% 25.00% 10.00% 27.00% 10.00% 20.00% 0.00% 20.00% No Bid No Bid 15.00%

#49

DISCOUNT OFF PRICE LIST 
FOR ALL OTHER HEWLETT 
PACKARD MAINTENANCE 
KITS NOT SPECIFIED ABOVE NO HISTORY 20.00% 20.00% 25.00% 10.00% 25.00% 10.00% 20.00% 0.00% 20.00% No Bid No Bid 15.00%

**PRICING FOR LINE ITEM #21 TO UNITED RIBBON IS INCORRECT (CONFIRMED WITH VENDOR)

**RECOMMENDATION TO AWARD IN BLUE

RECOMMENDATION NOT TO AWARD IN YELLOW

OVERALL LOWEST TOTAL BY LINE ITEM 
(AWARDING TO MULTIPLE VENDORS)

LOWEST TOTAL BY LINE ITEM

LOWEST OVERALL TOTAL (AWARDING TO ONE 
VENDOR)


