IFB 2015-344
SUPPLIES, OEM TONER CARTRIDGES FOR LASER AND INKJET PRINTERS
SPREADSHEET EVALUATION

ENHANCED LASER SOUTHERN COMPUTER LIMITLESS OFFICE CORE CHANGE
VENDORS PRODUCTS THE OFFICE PAL STAPLES OFFICE DEPOT LASERLINK INT'L WAREHOUSE KOMPUTER PLUS UNITED RIBBON PRODUCTS CNI OFFICE SUPPLIES MANAGEMENT LD PRODUCTS
LINE Approx. Unit Unit ANNUAL Unit ANNUAL Unit ANNUAL ANNUAL ANNUAL Unit ANNUAL ANNUAL Unit ANNUAL Unit ANNUAL ANNUAL ANNUAL
ITEMS |MODEL# DESCRIPTION Usage Cost/Ea COST Cost/Ea ANNUAL COST _|Unit Cost/Ea; COST Cost/Ea COST Unit Cost/Ea COST Unit Cost/Ea COST Cost/Ea COST Unit Cost/Ea COST Cost/Ea COST Cost/Ea COST Unit Cost/Ea COST Unit Cost/Ea COST
C734,C736 |LEXMARK BLACK RETURN
#1 BLACK TONER CARTRIDGE 325 $ 10450 | $ 3396250 |$ 90.00 | $ 29,250.00 | $ 10256 | $ 33,332.00 | $ 11238 |$ 3652350 | $ 132.00 | $ 4290000 | $ 12747 |$ 4142775|$ 13514 [$ 4392050 | $ 139.99 | $ 4549675 |$ 10587 |$ 34407.75]$ 130.66 | $ 4246450 | $ 15355 |$ 4990375 | $ 133.38 | $ 43,348.50
C734,C736, |LEXMARK CYAN RETURN
#2 CYAN TONER CARTRIDGE 217 $ 16550 | $ 35091350 | $ 132.00 | $ 28,644.00 | $ 16035|$ 3479595 |$ 17849 |$ 3873233 | $ 18500 | $ 40,145.00 | $ 20250 | $ 4394250 | $ 21473 [$ 4659641 | $ 25999 | $ 5641783 | $ 16748 | $ 36,343.16 | $ 207.62 | $ 4505354 | $ 244.00 | $ 52948.00 | $ 18131 |$ 39,344.27
C734,C736, |LEXMARK MAGENTA
#3 MAGENTA _|RETURN TONER CARTRIDGE|194 $ 16550 | $ 32107.00 | $ 13200 | $ 2560800 | $ 160.35|3% 3110790 |$ 17935|9% 3479390 |$ 18500 |$ 35890.00 | $ 20250 | $ 39285.00 | $ 21473 |$ 4165762 |$ 22999 |$ 44618.06 |$ 16748 |$ 3249112 |$ 20762 | $ 4027828 | $ 24400 |$ 4733600 |$ 18131 ]|$ 3517414
C734,C736, |LEXMARK YELLOW
#4 YELLOW RETURN TONER CARTRIDGE|231 $ 16550 | $ 3823050 | $ 132.00 | $ 30,492.00 | S 160.35]|3$ 3704085 |% 17886 |$ 4131666 |$ 18500 |$ 4273500 |$ 20250 | $ 4677750 | $ 21473 | $ 49602.63 | $ 23999 |$ 5543769 |$ 16748 |$ 3868788 | $ 207.62 | $ 4796022 | $ 24400 |$ 56,364.00 | $ 18131 |$ 4188261
C734,C736, |LEXMARK
#5 PC UNIT PHOTOCONDUCTOR UNIT _ |771 $ 3200 |$ 2467200 |$ 2963 |$ 2284473 |$ 3217 |3$ 24803.07 |$ 2696 |$ 20,786.16 | $ 36.00|$ 2775600 |$ 3060 |3$ 2359260 |$ 3247 |$ 2503437 [$ 3599 |$ 2774829 |$ 3387 |$ 2611377 |3 3139 |$ 2420169 |$ 3762 ]|$% 29005.02]$ 3532 |$ 2723172
C734, C736,
WASTE LEXMARK WASTE TONER
#6 TONER BOTTLE 6 $ 8.10 | $ 4860 | $ 77918 46.74 | $ 87418 5244 | $ 72918 43.74 | $ 13.00 | $ 78.00 | $ 83918 503419 85318 5118 |$% 1088]% 6528 |$ 1089 |$ 6534 | $ 890183 5340 |$ 10.65]8% 63.90 | $ 1092 | $ 65.52
LEXMARK 110-120V FUSER
#7 C734,C736__ |MAINTENANCE KIT NO HISTORY $_100.00 $ 204.84 $ 174.04 $ 199.99 $  223.00 $ 18948 $ 232.28 $ 229.78 $ 21247 $ 210.46 $_ 226.00 $  208.36
LEXMARK TRANSFER
#8 C734,C736 _ |[MODULE KIT NO HISTORY $ _167.00 $ 18423 $ 171.34 $ 178.98 $ 198.00 $ 170.29 $ 207.88 $ 199.77 $ 191.10 $ 192.64 $ _210.15 No Bid
T654 TONER [LEXMARK HIGH-YIELD
#9 CARTRIDGE |BLACK TONER CARTRIDGE |99 $ 30650 | $ 30,343.50 | $ 299.00 | $ 29,601.00 | $ 297.88 |$ 29490.12 | $ 35342 |$ 3498858 | $ 30500 | $ 30,195.00 | $ 40395 |$ 39991.05|$ 41771 |$ 4135329 |$ 29978 | $ 2967822 |$ 31246 |$ 3093354 | $ 41140 |$ 4072860 | $ 476.75|$ 4719825 |$ 419.99 | $ 41,579.01
T650, T652, |LEXMARK 110-120V FUSER
#10 T654 MAINTENANCE KIT, BLACK |NO HISTORY $ 85.00 $ 125.00 $ _ 226.38 $ 266.93 $  249.00 $  253.98 $ 310.48 $ 249.99 $ 283.60 $ 274.80 $ _ 318.68 $ 277.21
X954DHE LEXMARK HIGH-YIELD
#11 BLACK BLACK TONER CARTRIDGE |41 $ 8190|$ 335790|3% 91888 376708 |$ 8294 |$ 340054 |$ 8361 |$ 342801]% 99.00 |$ 405900 |$ 9488 |% 3890.08|$ 9918 |$ 406638 |$ 11570 |$ 474370 |$ 8387 |$ 343867 |$ 9735]|% 399135|% 11662 |$ 478142 |$ 10381 | $  4,256.21
X954DHE LEXMARK HIGH-YIELD
#12 CYAN CYAN TONER CARTRIDGE _ |31 $ 38740 | $ 12,009.40 | $ 300.00 | $ 9,300.00 | $ 377.69 | $ 11,708.39 | $ 394.66 | $ 1223446 |$ 38000 |$ 1178000 | $ 44831 ]|$ 1389761 |$ 46731 |$ 1448661 |$ 48978 | $ 15183.18 | $ 39215 |$ 12,156.65 | $ 459.75 | $ 1425225 |$ 54094 | $ 16,769.14 | $ 48252 | $ 14958.12
X954DHE MAGENTA TONER
#13 MAGENTA _|CARTRIDGE 28 $ 38740 |$ 10,847.20 | $ 300.00 | $ 8,400.00 | $ 377.69 | $ 1057532 |$ 39493 |$ 1105804 |$ 38000 $ 1064000 |$ 44831 ]|$ 12552.68 | $ 46731 |$ 1308468 | $ 489.78 | $ 13,713.84 | $ 392.15|$ 10,980.20 | $ 459.79 | $ 1287412 |$ 54091 |$ 1514548 | $ 48252 | $ 13510.56
X954DHE  |YELLOW TONER
#14 YELLOW CARTRIDGE 20 $ 38740 |$ 774800 |$ 300.00|$ 6,00000 |$ 37769 |$ 755380 |% 39491 |$ 789820]% 38000 |$ 760000 |$ 44831 |$ 896620 |$ 46731 ]|3% 934620 |$ 48978 |$ 979560 |$ 39215]|$% 784300 % 459.75]|3% 919500 |$ 54091 |$ 1081820 | $ 48252 | $  9,650.40
X954DHE PC |LEXMARK BLACK
#15 UNIT PHOTOCONDUCTOR UNIT |23 $ 21510 |$ 494730 |$ 159.00 | $ 365700 |$ 21080 |$ 484840 |% 18867 |$ 433941 % 20600 |$ 473800 |$ 21298 |$ 489854 |$ 22612 ]8% 22612 |$ 23999 f$ 551977 |$ 21820 |3$ 501860 |$ 21835|$ 5022.05|3% 25662 % 590226 |$ 23300 |$ 5359.00
X954DHE LEXMARK WASTE TONER
#16 TONER BOTTLE 120 $ 27.00$ 324000 |$ 2487($ 2,084.40 | $ 27.921$ 335040 |$ 2478|$ 297360 |$ 29.00 | $  3,480.00 [ $ 2588 |$ 310560 |$ 2728 1% 2728 | $ 3266 |$ 391920 |$ 2879|$ 345480 % 2700|$ 3240.00|$ 3157 |$ 378340|$ 30.00 | $  3,600.00
LEXMARK 110-120V FUSER
#17 X954 MAINTENANCE KIT NO HISTORY $ 200.00 $ 564.56 $  598.96 $ 564.84 $ 619.00 $  543.63 $ 679.87 $  689.99 $  611.51 $ 617.31 No Bid No Bid
MS810
#18 IMAGING LEXMARK IMAGING UNIT _ |18 $ 38603 69480 | S  39.17(8$ 705.06 | S 40.14 1% 72252 |$  3365]$% 605.70 | $ 48.00 | $ 864.00 | $ 38791 $ 69822 |S 40539 72954 | S 4866 | $ 875.88 | $ 4436 1S 798.48 | $ 39181 $ 70524 [$ 4695 $ 845.10 | $ 4572 1$ 822.96
LEXMARK 110-120V FUSER
#19 MS810, MS81IMAINTENANCE KIT, BLACK |NO HISTORY $_100.00 $ 21871 $ _ 250.50 $ 23887 $ 240.00 $ 224.20 $ 280.95 $  259.99 $ 252.77 $ 246.20 $ _ 305.19 $ 25551
CS510DE LEXMARK HIGH-YIELD
#20 BLACK BLACK TONER CARTRIDGE {338 $ 9150|$ 30092700 |$ 8570 ($ 2896660 | $ 84.64 |$ 2860832 |$ 7250 |$ 24505.00 | $ 89.00 | $ 3008200 |$ 8264 |3$ 2793232 |$ 8733 |$ 2951754 |$ 8978 |$ 3034564 |$ 8445|$ 2854410 |$ 8444 |$ 2854072 |$ 10116 | $ 34192.08 | $ 90.34 | $ 30,534.92
CS510DE LEXMARK HIGH-YIELD
#21 CYAN CYAN TONER CARTRIDGE _ |156 $ 9150 |$ 1427400 |$ 11356 $ 1771536 | $ 9139 |$ 1425684 |$ 9785]$% 1526460 |$ 11500 ]|$ 17940.00 |$ 11153 |$ 1739868 |$ 11787 |$ 1838772 |$ 42838 |$ 668928 |$ 9165|$ 1429740 |$ 11395|$ 1777620 | $ 133.93 |$ 20893.08 | $ 121.16 | $ 18,900.96
CS510DE MAGENTA TONER
#22 MAGENTA _|CARTRIDGE 148 $ 9150 |$ 1354200 % 11356 ]$ 16,806.88 | $ 9139 |$ 1352572 |$ 9785]|$ 1448180 |$ 11500]|$ 17,020.00 |$ 11153 |$ 1650644 |$ 11787 |$ 1744476 |$ 11999 |$ 17,75852 | $ 11385|$ 16,849.80 | $ 113.95|$ 16,86460 | $ 136.53 |$ 20,206.44 | $ 12116 |$ 17,931.68
CS510DE YELLOW TONER
#23 YELLOW CARTRIDGE 140 $ 9150 |¢$ 1281000 |$ 11356 $ 1589840 | $ 9139 |$ 1279460 |$ 9785]% 13699.00|$ 11500]|$ 16,100.00 |$ 11153 |$ 1561420 % 11787 |$ 1650180 |$ 12499 |$ 1749860 |$ 9165|% 1283100 |$ 113.95|$% 1595300 |$ 13393 |3$ 1875020 | $ 12116 |$ 16,962.40
YIELD
BLACK
TONER LEXMARK HIGH-YIELD
#24 CARTRIDGE |BLACK TONER CARTRIDGE |79 $ 257.00 | $ 20,303.00 | $ 34769 |$ 2746751 | $ 25138 | $ 19859.02 | $ 298.11 | $ 2355069 | $ 31800 | $ 25122.00 | $ 33664 |$ 2659456 | $ 359.08 | $ 2836732 |$ 19999 | $ 15799.21 | $ 263.21 | $ 20,79359 | $ 34719 |$ 2742801 |$ 41594 |$ 32859.26 | $ 36542 | $ 28,868.18
LEXMARK HIGH-YIELD
#25 X745 - 748 BLACK TONER CARTRIDGE |84 $ 156.00 | $ 13,104.00 | $ 140.00 | $ 11,760.00 | $ 15018 [ $ 1261512 |$ 13889 |$ 1166676 |$ 157.00 | $ 13188.00 | $ 14986 |$ 1258824 [$ 15564 | $ 1307376 |$ 169.99 | $ 14279.16 | $ 15364 | $ 12,905.76 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
X745 - 748 LEXMARK CYAN TONER
#26 CYAN CARTRIDGE 37 $ 14400 |$ 532800 |$ 160.00 | $ 592000 |$ 14273 |$ 528101 |$ 16076 |$ 594812 ]¢$ 15900 |$ 588300 |$ 16755|$ 6,19935|8% 17437 |3$ 645169 |$ 18978 |$ 702186 |$ 14658 |$ 542346 |$ 17113 ]|$ 633181 |$ 20112 |$ 744144|$ 18080 |$  6,689.60
X745 - 748 LEXMARK MAGENTA
#27 MAGENTA _|TONER CARTRIDGE 47 $ 14400|$ 6,768.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 752000 |$ 14273 |$ 670831 |$ 16076 |$ 755572 ]$ 15900 |$ 747300 |$ 16755|$ 787485|% 17437 |$ 819539 |$ 18978 |$ 8910.66 |$ 14658 |$ 688926 [$ 17113 |$ 8043.11|$ 20112 |$ 945264 |$ 180.80 | $  8,497.60




X745-748  [LEXMARK YELLOW TONER
#28  [YELLOW  |CARTRIDGE 22 $ 14400 [ 3168.00|$ 160.00|$ 352000 |$ 14273 |$ 314006 |$ 160.76 |$ 353672 |$ 15000 [$ 349800 |$ 16755|$ 368610 [$ 17437 |$ 383614 |$ 18978 |$ 417516 |$ 14658 |$ 322476 |$ 17113 |$ 3764.86 |$ 20112 |$ 442464 (S 18080 |$  3,977.60
MS415DN-
MS510DN
BLACK LEXMARK HIGH-YIELD
#29  |TONER BLACK TONER CARTRIDGE |188 $ 99.00|s 1861200|% 136.91|$ 2573008 | 97.23|$ 1827924 |$ 10652 [$ 2002576 [$ 129.00 | $ 2425200 [$ 12007 |$ 2257316 |$ 12812 [ 2408656 |$ 12099 |$ 2443812 |$ 10033 |$ 1886204 [$ 12387 |5 2328756 |$ 14558 |5 27,360.04 |$ 13149 | 24,720.12
MS415DN-
MS510DN
#30  [DRUM LEXMARK IMAGING UNT _ |17 $ 3600[s 61200|% 3662]$ 622549 3753 |$ 63801 |$ 3146[$ 53482[$ 4800|$ 81600|5 3680 |5 62560 |5 3780[$ 64413 |$ 4288|$ 72896 |$ 4135|$ 70295|$ 3664[5 62288| 4389[s 74613|% 4250|s 722,50
C746,C748  [LEXMARK BLACK TONER
#31 _ [BLACK CARTRIDGE 31 $ 163.00[$ 505300|% 170.00|$ 5270.00 [$ 15018 |$ 465558 |$ 15450 [$ 479229 [$ 15000 |$ 492000 [$ 16048 |$ 497488 |$ 20134 ($ 624154 |3 16978 |$ 526318 |$ 16532 |$ 5124.92 [ NoBid No Bid No Bid
C746,C748  [LEXMARK CYAN TONER
#32 _ [cvan CARTRIDGE 16 $ 17200|$ 275200|$ 170.00|$ 272000 [$ 16841 |$ 269456 |$ 177.16 |$ 283456 [$ 19500 |$ 312000 |$ 20243 |$ 323888 |$% 20837 [$ 3333923 21909($ 351984 [$ 17560 |$ 2809.60 | $ 20524 | $ 328384 |$ 241190 |$ 385004 |$ 21639 | $ 346224
C746,C748  [LEXMARK MAGENTA
#33 _ |[MAGENTA |TONER CARTRIDGE 24 $ 17200|$ 412800|$ 170003 408000 |$ 16841 |$ 404184 |$ 177.15[$ 4251603 10500 |$ 468000 [$ 20243 [$ 485832 [$ 20837 |$ 500088 |$ 21099 |$ 527976 |$ 17560 | $ 421440 [$ 20524 [$ 492576 |$ 24110 |$ 578856 | $ 21639 [$  5193.36
C746,C748  |LEXMARK YELLOW TONER
#34 _ |YELLOW _ |CARTRIDGE 23 $ 172.00[$ 3956.00|$ 170.00|$ 3910.00 [ 16841 |$ 387343 |$ 177.81|$ 4089.63 [$ 19500 |$ 448500 |$ 20243 |$ 465589 |$ 20837 [$ 479251 |$ 21909 ($ 505977 [$ 17560 |$ 403880 | $ 20534 | $ 472282 |$ 24119 |$ 554737 |$ 21639 | $ 497697
CS410-CS510 [LEXMARK HIGH-YIELD
WASTE BLACK/COLOR WASTE
#35 _ [TONER TONER CARTRIDGE 46 $ 700|s 3200|5 808|s 37168 (s 8443 388243 721|$ 33166[$ 1800|$  82800|$ 853|$ 39238 |% 869[$ 39974|$ 1078 |$ 49588 |$ 9.21|$  42366[$ 006[s 41676 |$ 1083[s 49818|$ 1107[$  509.22
Cs310, LEXMARK 110-120V FUSER
#36  [CS410, CS510 [MAINTENANCE KIT NOHISTORY _ [$ 110.00 $ 237.46 $  224.47 $ 257.93 $  199.00 $ 24437 $ 305.74 $ 32829 $ 27224 $ 27143 No Bid $ 27661
€S310dn, LEXMARK HIGH-YIELD
€S410dn, BLACK/COLOR IMAGING
#37 __ |css10de KIT NOHISTORY _ |$ 205.00 $ 21208 $ 20145 $  179.48 $  219.00 $  204.29 $ 21582 $ 23978 $ 21502 $ 208.67 $ 24524 $ 23196
MS510, LEXMARK 110-120V FUSER
#38  [MS510DN__ |MAINTENANCE KIT, BLACK [NOHISTORY | $ 110.00 $ 21298 $ 20422 $ 253.13 $  219.00 $ 24309 $ 27815 No Bid $ 24683 $ 25214 No Bid No Bid
HP
DESIGNJET |HP 72 69 ml PHOTO BLACK
#42__ [T1300 INK CARTRIDGE NOHISTORY _[$  41.00 $ 3528 $ 3888 $ 3457 $  39.00 $ 3951 $ 4135 $ 4699 $ 3940 No Bid $ 4546 $ 4691
HP
DESIGNJET |HP 72 69 mI CYAN INK
#43 _ [T1300 CARTRIDGE NOHISTORY _[$ 41.00 $ 3528 $ 3888 $ 3457 $  39.00 $ 3951 $ 4135 $ 4699 $ 3940 No Bid $ 4546 $ 4691
HP
DESIGNJET |HP 72 69 ml MAGENTA INK
#44 LEOO CARTRIDGE NOHISTORY _[$ 41.00 $ 3528 $ 3888 $ 3457 $  39.00 $ 3951 $ 4135 $ 4699 $ 3940 No Bid $ 4546 $ 4691
DESIGNJET |HP 72 69 ml YELLOW INK
#45 {1300 CARTRIDGE NOHISTORY |$ 41.00 $ 3528 $ 3888 $ 3457 $  39.00 $ 3951 $ 4135 $ 4699 $ 3940 No Bid $ 4546 $ 4691
DESIGNJET |HP 72 69 ml GRAY INK
#46__ [T1300 CARTRIDGE NO HISTORY _ [$  41.00 $ 3528 $ 3888 $ 3457 $  39.00 $ 3951 $ 4135 $ 4699 $ 3940 No Bid $ 4546 $ 4691
LOWEST OVERALL TOTAL (AWARDING TO ONE
VENDOR) $5,786.40 | $393,781.20 | $6430.18 | § 379,588.06 | $ 6,650.20 | $384,141.60 | $6,982.19 | $ 406,791.02 | $ 7,249.00 | $ 442276.00 | $ 7,505.80 | $ 458,789.52 | $ 8,230.92 | $ 476,458.21 | $ 7,885.86 | $ 480,485.80 | $ 7,080.94 | $ 400,668.46 | $7,312.20 | $ 451,982.17 | $ 7.466.37 | $ 532,807.02 [ $ 6,683.70 | $ 452,730.37
LOWEST TOTAL BY LINE ITEM $ 960.90 [ $  3679.90 | $1,844.00 | $ 170,952.00 | $ 1,455.00 | $ 89,251.19 | $ 687.86 | $ 61,115.78 $ 19999 |$ 15799.21
OVERALL LOWEST TOTAL BY LINE ITEM
(AWARDING TO MULTIPLE VENDORS) $  340798.08
DISCOUNT OFF PRICE LIST
FOR ALL OTHER LEXMARK
PRINTER HEADS NOT No
#39 SPECIFIED ABOVE NO HISTORY _ [20.00% 20.00% 18.00% 10.00% 20.00% 10.00% 20.00% 0.00% Response No Bid No Bid 15.00%
DISCOUNT OFF PRICE LIST
FOR ALL OTHER LEXMARK
MAINTENANCE KITS NOT No
#40 SPECIFIED ABOVE NO HISTORY __{20.00% 20.00% 18.00% 10.00% 25.00% 10.00% 20.00% 0.00% Response No Bid No Response 15.00%
DISCOUNT OFF PRICE LIST
FOR ALL OTHER LEXMARK
FUSER KITS NOT SPECIFIED No
#41 ABOVE NO HISTORY __[20.00% 20.00% 18.00% 10.00% 26.00% 10.00% 20.00% 0.00% Respanse No Bid No Bid 15.00%
DISCOUNT OFF PRICE LIST
FOR ALL OTHER HEWLETT
PACKARD PRINTER HEADS
#47 NOT SPECIFIED ABOVE NO HISTORY 30.00% 20.00% 25.00% 10.00% 22.00% 10.00% 20.00% 0.00% 20.00% No Bid No Bid 15.00%
DISCOUNT OFF PRICE LIST
FOR ALL OTHER HEWLETT
PACKARD FUSER KITS NOT
#48 SPECIFIED ABOVE NO HISTORY 20.00% 20.00% 25.00% 10.00% 27.00% 10.00% 20.00% 0.00% 20.00% No Bid No Bid 15.00%
DISCOUNT OFF PRICE LIST
FOR ALL OTHER HEWLETT
PACKARD MAINTENANCE
#49 KITS NOT SPECIFIED ABOVE [NO HISTORY 20.00% 20.00% 25.00% 10.00% 25.00% 10.00% 20.00% 0.00% 20.00% No Bid No Bid 15.00%

**PRICING FOR LINE ITEM #21 TO UNITED RIBBON IS INCORRECT (CONFIRMED WITH VENDOR)

**RECOMMENDATION TO AWARD IN BLUE




