3DC

Services, Maintenance: Plumbing Contractor Murley Services
Plumbing '

IFB No. 2016-112 LLC

Line

Iltem # |Description Quantity |JUOM Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price

1 Hourly rate for Labor - Licensed Master Plumber 48 Hour $95.00 $4,560.00f $120.00 $5,760.00
Hourly rate for Labor - Licensed Master Plumber - Overtime 1 Hour $142.50 $150.00
Hourly rate for Labor - Licensed Master Plumber - Weekend Work 1 Hour $142.50 $180.00
Hourly rate for Labor - Licensed Master Plumber - Holiday Work 1 Hour $142.50 $240.00

2 Hourly rate for Labor - Journeyman Plumber 1 Hour $95.00 $90.00
Hourly rate for Labor - Journeyman Plumber - Overtime 1 Hour $142.50 $120.00
Hourly rate for Labor - Journeyman Plumber - Weekend Work 1 Hour $142.50 $150.00
Hourly rate for Labor - Journeyman Plumber - Holiday Work 1 Hour $142.50 $150.00

3 Hourly rate for labor - Plumbers Helper 1 Hour $45.00 $47.00
Hourly rate for labor - Plumbers Helper - Overtime 1 Hour $67.50 $66.00
Hourly rate for labor - Plumbers Helper - Weekend Work 1 Hour $67.50 $83.00
Hourly rate for labor - Plumbers Helper - Holiday Work 1 Hour $67.50 $83.00

4 Domestic Water Back Flow Valve Inspection - First Valve 33 Each $90.00[ $2,970.00 No Bid
Additional Valve 1 Each $90.00

5 Fire Supression Water Back Flow Inspection - First Valve 13 Each $90.00] $1,170.00 No Bid
Additional Valve 1 Each $90.00

6 Irrigation Water Back Flow Valve Inspection - First Valve 18 Each $90.00( $1,620.00 No Bid
Additional Valce 1 Each $90.00

7 Reduced Pressure Zone Device (RPZ Units) 19 Each $90.00] $1,710.00 No Bid

8 Percentage Markup Applied to actual Materials Cost 30% 15%




