Specialized Printing for Elections
IFB 2016-188
Recommendation to Award

FORM# M1, JACKET ENVELOPE, EARLY, 4 3/4" x 11" brown Kraft envelope with black printing on one (1) side.
Estimated annual usage: 10,000 each.
Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.

Qty. 5001-10000. Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor QTY UOM Unit Price Extended 500 - 1000 1001 - 5000

Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 10000 each $0.073 $730.00 0.12 .082 59.00
Extreme Business Service 10000 each $0.075 $750.00 0.368 0.314 0.00
Jayden Graphics Inc. 10000 each $0.094 $940.00 .30 15 0

FORM# M2, BALLOT ENVELOPE, 4 1/4" x 9 1/2" white with black print, two (2) sides, English on one (1) side and Spanish on side two (2). Estimated

annual usage: 10,000 each. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.

Qty. 5001-10000 Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor QTY UOM Unit Price Extended 500 - 1000 1001 - 5000

Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 10000 each $0.039 $390.00 .080 .046 59.00
Jayden Graphics Inc. 10000 each $0.064 $640.00 .293 124 0

Extreme Business Service 10000 each $0.069 $690.00 0.00 0.308 0.00
FORM# M3, REGULAR MAIL MAILER ENVELOPE, 4 3/4" x 11" green envelope with printing (English and Spanish) on one (1) side, black ink. Estimated

annual usage: 10,000 each. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.

Qty. 5001-10000. Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor QTY UOM Unit Price Extended 500 - 1000 1001 - 5000

Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 10000 each $0.071 $710.00 0.177 0.089 59.00
Extreme Business Service 10000 each $0.075 $750.00 0.59 0.295 0.00
Jayden Graphics Inc. 10000 each $0.09 $900.00 .53 22 0

FORM# M4, FPCA CARRIER ENVELOPE, 4 1/2" x 10 x 3/8" white envelope with black printing, two (2) sides, bar coding and postal permit. Estimated

annual usage: 10,000. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.

Qty. 5001-10000. Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor QTY UOM Unit Price Extended 500 - 1000 1001 - 5000

Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 10000 each $0.062 $620.00 115 071 59.00
Jayden Graphics Inc. 10000 each $0.085 $850.00 29 126 0

Extreme Business Service 10000 each $103.00 $1,030,000.00 0.464 0.74 0.00
FORM# M5, FPCA MAILER ENVELOPE, 4 3/4" x 11" white envelope with black printing, one (1) side, bar coding and postal permit. Estimated annual

usage: 10,000. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.

Qty. 5001-10000. Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor QTY UoM Unit Price Extended 500 - 1000 1001 - 5000

Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 10000 each $0.066 $660.00 117 .076 59.00
Extreme Business Service 10000 each $0.07 $700.00 0.289 0.289 0.00
Jayden Graphics Inc. 10000 each $0.08 $800.00 265 12 0

FORM# M6, REGULAR MAIL CARRIER ENVELOPE, 4 1/2" x 10 x 3/8" yellow envelope with black printing, two (2) sides in both English and Spanish.

Estimated annual usage: 7,000. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.

Qty. 5001-10000. Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor Q1Y UoM Unit Price Extended 500 - 1000 1001 - 5000

Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 7000 each $0.074 $518.00 .26 .098 59.00
Jayden Graphics Inc. 7000 each $0.103 $721.00 .53 .25 0

Extreme Business Service 7000 each $0.105 $735.00 0.00 0.318 0.00
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FORM# M10, PARTY AFFILLIATION CERTIFICATE, 8 1/2" x 14" white 24 Ib bond paper with center perforation and six (6) horizontal perforations, black
printing, one (1) side. Estimated annual usage: 3,000. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space

! provided.
Qty. 1001-5000. Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor QTY UoM Unit Price Extended 100 - 500 501 - 1000
Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 3000 each $0.077 $231.00 .27 .16 59.00
Jayden Graphics Inc. 3000 each $0.146 $438.00 .76 .38 0
Extreme Business Service 3000 each $0.147 $441.00 0.00 0.728 0.00
FORM# M24, PROVISIONAL ENVELOPE, 11 1/2" x 5 5/8" green envelope, perforated at the top with snap over flap, black print on both sides in English
and Spanish. Estimated annual usage: 10,000. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.

8 |oty. 5001-10000.

Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee

Vendor QTY UOM Unit Price Extended 500 - 1000 1001 - 5000
Extreme Business Service 10000 each No Bid
Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 10000 each No Bid
Jayden Graphics Inc. 10000 each $0.197 $1,970.00 1.09 .38 0
FORM# M28, STATEMENT OF COMPENSATION AND OATHS, 14 3/4" x 8 1/2" two (2) part yellow NCR, LEFT 3/4" snap out, black printing on one (1)

9 side with red notational markings. Estimated annual usage: 5,000. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the
space provided.
Qty. 1001-5000. Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor QTY UOM Unit Price Extended 100 - 500 501 - 1000
Extreme Business Service 5000 each $0.098 $490.00 0.00 0.522 0.00
Jayden Graphics Inc. 5000 each $0.11 $550.00 .654 327 100.00
Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 5000 each $0.13 $650.00 41 .29 59.00
FORM# M9, STATEMENT OF RESIDENCE, 8" x 6", 100 Ib, yellow card stock with black printing on two (2) sides in English and Spanish, NO

10 |PERFORATION. Estimated annual usage: 40,000. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.
Qty. 40001-50000. Quantity Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor QTY UoMm Unit Price Extended 10000 - 20000 20001 - 30000 30001 - 40000
Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 50000 each $0.025 $1,250.00 .034 .031 0.029 59.00
Jayden Graphics Inc. 50000 each $0.028 $1,400.00 .043 .038 .03 0
Extreme Business Service 50000 each $0.028 $1,400.00 0.044 0.037 0.034 0.00
FORM# M20, BALLOT AND SEAL CERTIFICATE AND REGISTER OF OFFICIAL BALLOT, 8 1/2" x 14" plus stub, 3 part carbonless, white, yellow, pink; tears
apart at top with black print on one (1) side. Estimated annual usage: 3,000. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity

1 breaks in the space provided.
Qty. 1001-5000. Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor QTY UoOM Unit Price Extended 100 - 500 501 - 1000
Extreme Business Service 3000 each $0.148 $444.00 0.00 0.466 0.00
Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 3000 each $0.169 $507.00 41 .26 59.
Jayden Graphics Inc. 3000 each $0.174 $522.00 43 .30 67.00
FORM# M22, NOTICE OF TOTAL VOTERS, 8 1/2" x 11", 24 Ib bond, blue with black print on one (1) side, English and Spanish. Estimated annual usage:

12 |1,000. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.
Qty. 501-1000. Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor QTY UoM Unit Price Extended 100 - 500 1001 - 5000
Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 1000 each $0.076 $76.00 .109 .049 59.
Jayden Graphics Inc. 1000 each $0.16 $160.00 17 .165 65.00
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Extreme Business Service 1000 each $0.181 $181.00 0.00 0.181 0.00
FORM# M23, REGISTER OF SPOILED BALLOTS, 8 1/2" x 11", 20 Ib bond, goldenrod with black printing on one (1) side, English and Spanish. Estimated

13 |annual usage: 1,000. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.
Qty. 501-1000. Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor QTY UoM Unit Price Extended 100 - 500 1001 - 5000
Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 1000 each $0.074 $74.00 .099 .043 59.
Jayden Graphics Inc. 1000 each $0.15 $150.00 15 .073 65.00
Extreme Business Service 1000 each $0.181 $181.00 0.00 0.181 0.00
FORM# M27, OATHS OF ASSISTANTS AND INTERPRETERS, 8 1/2" x 14", yellow with black printing on one (1) side, both English and Spanish. Estimated

14 |annual usage: 1,000. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.
Qty. 501-1000. Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor QTY UoM Unit Price Extended 100 - 500 1001 - 5000
Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 1000 each $0.156 $156.00 .075 .062 59.00
Extreme Business Service 1000 each $0.232 $232.00 0.00 0.232 0.00
Jayden Graphics Inc. 1000 each $17.00 $17,000.00 .18 175 65.00
FORM# M30, CUSTODIAN OF RECORDS ENVELOPE, 10" x 15", yellow envelope catalog style, black printing on one (1) side,

15 |Estimated annual usage: 1,000. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.
Qty. 501-1000. Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor QTY UoOM Unit Price Extended 100 - 500 1001 - 5000
Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 1000 each $0.52 $520.00 0.00 .32 59.00
Jayden Graphics Inc. 1000 each $0.64 $640.00 1.26 27 0
Extreme Business Service 1000 each $0.797 $797.00 0.00 0.797 0.00
FORM# M31, PRESIDING JUDGE ENVELOPE, 10" x 15", pink envelope, catalog style with black printing on one (1) side,

16 |Estimated annual usage: 1,000. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.
Qty. 501-1000. Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor QTY UoM Unit Price Extended 100 - 5001 1001 - 5000
Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 1000 each $0.52 $520.00 0.00 .33 59.
Jayden Graphics Inc. 1000 each $0.64 $640.00 1.26 273 0
Extreme Business Service 1000 each $0.797 $797.00 0.00 0.797 0.00
FORM# M32, RETURN SHEET, 8 1/2" x 14", black printing on one (1) side, 20 Ib. paper.

17 |Estimated annual usage: 500. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.
Qty. 100-500. Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor Q1Y UOM Unit Price Extended 501 - 1000 Bidder shall sta
Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 500 each $0.076 $38.00 .06 59.
Extreme Business Service 500 each $0.30 $150.00 0.30 0.00
Jayden Graphics Inc. 500 each $0.52 $260.00 .26 75.00
FORM# M33, TALLEY LIST-BLUE 17" x 14", white, center folded to 8 1/2" x 14" size, black printing on two (2) sides with red notational markings and
one (1) 8 1/2" x 3/4" PMS color strip across bottom front of form.

18 Estimated annual usage: 2000. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.
Qty. 1001-5000. Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor QTY UoM Unit Price Extended 100 - 500 501 - 1000
Extreme Business Service 2000 each $0.239 $478.00 0.00 0.63 0.00
Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 2000 each $0.25 $500.00 0.84 0.51 59.00
Jayden Graphics Inc. 2000 each $0.568 $1,136.00 1.14 1.05 75.00
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FORM# M34, TALLEY LIST-YELLOW, 17" x 14", white, center folded to 8 1/2" x 14" size, black printing on two (2) sides with red notational markings
and one (1) 8 1/2" x 3/4" PMS color strip across bottom front of form.

19 Estimated annual usage: 2000. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.
Qty. 1001-5000. Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor QTY UOM Unit Price Extended 100 - 500 501 - 1000
Extreme Business Service 2000 each $0.239 $478.00 0.00 0.63 0.00
Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 2000 each $0.25 $500.00 0.84 0.51 59.00
Jayden Graphics Inc. 2000 each $0.568 $1,136.00 1.14 1.05 75.00
FORM# M35, TALLEY LIST-WHITE, 17" x 14", white, center folded to 8 1/2" x 14" size, black printing on two (2) sides with red notational markings.

20 |Estimated annual usage: 2000. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.
Qty. 1001-5000. Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor QTY UoM Unit Price Extended 100 - 500 501 - 1000
Extreme Business Service 2000 each $0.239 $478.00 0.00 0.63 0.00
Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 2000 each $0.25 $500.00 0.84 0.51 59.00
Jayden Graphics Inc. 2000 each $0.33 $660.00 .66 .64 75.00
MAIL BALLOTS-OPTICAL SCAN pdf format, 8 1/2" x 11", numbered consecutively beginning with number one (1) and ending with the maximum
number of ballots required for a particular section; bundled in increments of 25 or 50 shrink wrapped according to precinct or ballot style as
determined in purchase order; white 90 Ib index, all black ink. Forms to be sequentially numbered on front. "Ballot____ Precinct____ " on back of
forms. Bid price to include dedicated delivery of ballots from vendor to the Elections Office in McKinney, Texas. Estimated Annual Usage: 100,000

1 |total for three possible print sizes (8 1/2" x 11", 8 1/2x 14" and 8 1/2" x 18").
CRITICAL DELIVERY REQUIREMENT FOR THIS ITEM: Bidder shall deliver order 3-7 days ARO.
SAMPLE TEST RUN: The successful bidder shall provide ballots for a sample run for the purpose of quality control. Quantity required for this test to be
determined by the Elections Administrator at the time the request is made. Bidder shall provide one (1) additional professional reference specific to
printing optical scan ballots. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided. . . .
Aty 0001 . 100000 Quantity Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor QTY UOM Unit Price Extended 20000 - 30000 30001 - 40000 40001 - 50000
Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 100000 each No Bid
Jayden Graphics Inc. 100000 each No Bid
Extreme Business Service 100000 each $0.066 $6,600.00 0.075 0.075 0.072 0.00
PROVISIONAL BALLOT-OPTICAL SCAN pdf format, 8 1/2" x 11", numbered consecutively beginning with number one (1) and ending with the
maximum number of ballots required for a particular section; bundled in increments of 25 or 50 shrink wrapped according to precinct or ballot style
as determined in purchase order; white 90 Ib index, all black ink. Forms to be sequentially numbered on front. "Ballot STYLE___ Precinct___ "on
back of forms. Bid price to include dedicated delivery of ballots from vendor to the Elections Office in McKinney, Texas. Estimated Annual Usage:

22 20,000 total for three possible print sizes (8 1/2" x 11", 8 1/2 x 14" and 8 1/2" x 18").
CRITICAL DELIVERY REQUIREMENT FOR THIS ITEM: Bidder shall deliver order 3-7 days ARO.
SAMPLE TEST RUN: The successful bidder shall provide ballots for a sample run for the purpose of quality control. Quantity required for this test to be
determined by the Elections Administrator at the time the request is made. Bidder shall provide one (1) additional professional reference specific to
printing optical scan ballots. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.
Otv. 10000 - 20000 Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor QTY UoM Unit Price Extended 20001 - 30000 30001 - 40000
Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 20000 each No Bid
Jayden Graphics Inc. 20000 each No Bid
Extreme Business Service 20000 each $0.08 $1,600.00 0.080 0.074 0.00
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23

SAMPLE BALLOTS-OPTICAL SCAN pdf format, 8 1/2" x 11", printed on yellow 20 Ib paper stock; bundled in increments of 25 or 50, shrink wrapped
according to precinct or ballot style as determined in purchase order; "SAMPLE" water mark (screened or outlined as necessary) to be printed
diagonally across front and back of each ballot upon request. Forms to be sequentially numbered consecutively numbered on back of forms.
"Ballot___ Precinct____ " on back of forms. Bid price to include dedicated delivery of ballots from vendor to Elections Office in McKinney Texas.
Estimated Annual Usage: 50,000 total for three possible print sizes (8 1/2" x 11", 8 1/2 x 14" and 8 1/2" x 18").

CRITICAL DELIVERY REQUIREMENT FOR THIS ITEM: Bidder shall deliver order 3-7 days ARO.

SAMPLE TEST RUN: The successful bidder shall provide ballots for a sample run for the purpose of quality control. Quantity required for this test to be
determined by the Elections Administrator at the time the request is made. Bidder shall provide one (1) additional professional reference specific to
printing optical scan ballots. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.

Aty 40001 - £0000 Quantity Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor QTY uom Unit Price Extended 20000 - 30000 30001 - 40000 50001 - 100000
Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 50000 each No Bid
Jayden Graphics Inc. 50000 each No Bid
Extreme Business Service 50000 each $0.055 $2,750.00 0.060 0.060 0.055 0.00
MAIL BALLOTS-OPTICAL SCAN pdf format, 8 1/2" x 14", numbered consecutively beginning with number one (1) and ending with the maximum
number of ballots required for a particular section; bundled in increments of 25 or 50, shrink wrapped according to precinct or ballot style as
determined in purchase order; white 90 Ib index, all black ink. Forms to be sequentially numbered on front. "Ballot____ Precinct____ " on back of
forms. Bid price to include dedicated delivery of ballots from vendor to Elections Office in McKinney, Texas. Estimated Annual Usage: 100,000 total for
24 |three possible print sizes (8 1/2" x 11", 8 1/2" x 14" and 8 1/2" x 18"). CRITICAL DELIVERY REQUIREMENT FOR THIS ITEM: Bidder shall deliver order 3-7
days ARO. SAMPLE TEST RUN: The successful bidder shall provide ballots for a sample run for the purpose of quality control. Quantity required for this
test to be determined by the Elections Administrator at the time the request is made. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all
igfnﬁfxﬂt:rea:l;s{:lﬂihe space provided. Quantity Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor QTY UoM Unit Price Extended 20000 - 30000 30001 - 40000 40001 - 50000
Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 100000 each No Bid
Jayden Graphics Inc. 100000 each No Bid
Extreme Business Service 100000 each $0.076 $7,600.00 0.085 0.085 0.082 0.00
PROVISIONAL BALLOT-OPTICAL SCAN pdf format, 8 1/2" x 14", numbered consecutively beginning with number one (1) and ending with the
maximum number of ballots required for a particular section; bundled in increments of 25 or 50 shrink wrapped according to precinct or ballot style
as determined in purchase order; white 90 Ib index, all black ink. Forms to be sequentially numbered on front. "Ballot STYLE____ Precinct___ " on
back of forms. Bid price to include dedicated delivery of ballots from vendor to the Elections Office in McKinney, Texas. Estimated Annual Usage:
25 120,000 total for three possible print sizes (8 1/2" x 11", 8 1/2 x 14" and 8 1/2" x 18").
CRITICAL DELIVERY REQUIREMENT FOR THIS ITEM: Bidder shall deliver order 3-7 days ARO.
SAMPLE TEST RUN: The successful bidder shall provide ballots for a sample run for the purpose of quality control. Quantity required for this test to be
determined by the Elections Administrator at the time the request is made. Bidder shall provide one (1) additional professional reference specific to
E\Tnt:rlg\ggtlcinsﬁin ballots. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided. Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor QTY UoM Unit Price Extended 20001 - 30000 30001 - 40000
Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 20000 each No Bid
Jayden Graphics Inc. 20000 each No Bid
Extreme Business Service 20000 each $0.09 $1,800.00 0.090 0.085 0.00
SAMPLE BALLOTS-OPTICAL SCAN pdf format, 8 1/2" x 14", printed on yellow 20 Ib paper stock; bundled in increments of 25 or 50, shrink wrapped
according to precinct or ballot style as determined in purchase order; "SAMPLE" water mark (screened or outlined as necessary) to be printed
diagonally across front and back of each ballot upon request. Forms to be sequentially numbered consecutively numbered on back of forms.
26 |"Ballot___ Precinct____ " on back of forms. Bid price to include dedicated delivery of ballots from vendor to Elections Office in McKinney Texas.
Estimated Annual Usage: 50,000 total for three possible print sizes (8 1/2" x 11", 8 1/2 x 14" and 8 1/2" x 18").
CRITICAL DELIVERY REQUIREMENT FOR THIS ITEM: Bidder shall deliver order 3-7 days ARO.
SAMPIE TEST RUN- The e bidder shall nrovide hallo or a sample run for the n i Quantity Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor QTY uom Unit Price Extended 20000 - 30000 30001 - 40000 50001 - 100000
Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 50000 each No Bid
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Jayden Graphics Inc. 50000 each No Bid
Extreme Business Service 50000 each $0.062 $3,100.00 0.067 0.067 0.062 0.00
MAIL BALLOTS-OPTICAL SCAN pdf format, 8 1/2" x 18", numbered consecutively beginning with number one (1) and ending with the maximum
number of ballots required for a particular section; bundled in increments of 25 or 50, shrink wrapped according to precinct or ballot style as
determined in purchase order; white 90 Ib index, all black ink. Forms to be sequentially numbered on front. "Ballot____ Precinct____ " on back of
forms. Bid price to incude dedicated delivery of ballots from vendor to Elections Office in McKinney, Texas. Estimated Annual Usage: 100,000 total for
27 |three possible print sizes (8 1/2" x 11", 8 1/2" x 14" and 8 1/2" x 18"). CRITICAL DELIVERY REQUIREMENT FOR THIS ITEM: Bidder shall deliver order 3-7
days ARO. SAMPLE TEST RUN: The successful bidder shall provide ballots for a sample run for the purpose of quality control. Quantity required for this
test to be determined by the Elections Administrator at the time the request is made. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all
quantity breaks in the space provided.
Oty. 50001 - 100000. Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor QTY UOM Unit Price Extended 30000 - 40000 40001 - 50000
Jayden Graphics Inc. 100000 each No Bid
Extreme Business Service 100000 each No Bid
Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 100000 each No Bid
PROVISIONAL BALLOT-OPTICAL SCAN pdf format, 8 1/2" x 18", numbered consecutively beginning with number one (1) and ending with the
maximum number of ballots required for a particular section; bundled in increments of 25 or 50 shrink wrapped according to precinct or ballot style
as determined in purchase order; white 90 Ib index, all black ink. Forms to be sequentially numbered on front. "Ballot STYLE___ Precinct___ "on
back of forms. Bid price to include dedicated delivery of ballots from vendor to the Elections Office in McKinney, Texas. Estimated Annual Usage:
20,000 total for three possible print sizes (8 1/2" x 11", 8 1/2 x 14" and 8 1/2" x 18").
28 CRITICAL DELIVERY REQUIREMENT FOR THIS ITEM: Bidder shall deliver order 3-7 days ARO.
SAMPLE TEST RUN: The successful bidder shall provide ballots for a sample run for the purpose of quality control. Quantity required for this test to be
determined by the Elections Administrator at the time the request is made. Bidder shall provide one (1) additional professional reference specific to
printing optical scan ballots. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.
Qty. 10000 - 20000. Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor QTY UoM Unit Price Extended 20001 - 30000 30001 - 40000
Jayden Graphics Inc. 20000 each No Bid
Extreme Business Service 20000 each No Bid
Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 20000 each No Bid
SAMPLE BALLOTS-OPTICAL SCAN pdf format, 8 1/2" x 18", printed on yellow 20 Ib paper stock; bundled in increments of 25 or 50, shrink wrapped
according to precinct or ballot style as determined in purchase order; "SAMPLE" water mark (screened or outlined as necessary) to be printed
diagonally across front and back of each ballot upon request. Forms to be sequentially numbered consecutively numbered on back of forms.
"Ballot___ Precinct____ " on back of forms. Bid price to include dedicated delivery of ballots from vendor to Elections Office in McKinney Texas.
29 Estimated Annual Usage: 50,000 total for three possible print sizes (8 1/2" x 11", 8 1/2 x 14" and 8 1/2" x 18").
CRITICAL DELIVERY REQUIREMENT FOR THIS ITEM: Bidder shall deliver order 3-7 days ARO.
SAMPLE TEST RUN: The successful bidder shall provide ballots for a sample run for the purpose of quality control. Quantity required for this test to be
determined by the Elections Administrator at the time the request is made. Bidder shall provide one (1) additional professional reference specific to
printing optical scan ballots. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided. . .
Oty 40001 - 50000 Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor QTY UoM Unit Price Extended 20001 - 30000 30001 - 40000
Jayden Graphics Inc. 50000 each No Bid
Extreme Business Service 50000 each No Bid
Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 50000 each No Bid
FORM# M11, VOTER REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE, Blank stock, 4 1/2" x 6", tractor feed, black print two (2) sides, color insert, perforated design of
certificate is prescribed by Secretary of State. Estimated Annual Usage: 100,000. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity
30 breaks in the space provided.
Qty. 50001 - 100000. Quantity Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor QTY UOM Unit Price Extended 20000 - 30000 30001 - 40000 40001 - 50000
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Jayden Graphics Inc. 100000 each $0.012 $1,200.00 .309 .024 .018 110.00
Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 100000 each $0.022 $2,200.00 .031 .028 .023 59.00
Extreme Business Service 100000 each $0.26 $26,000.00 0.045 0.040 0029 0.00
FORM# M44, POLL LIST, 8 1/2" x 14", three (3) part carbonless form plus standard stub; yellow, pink and blue with snap out top. Estimated Annual

31 |Usage: 20,000. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.
Qty. 10000 - 20000. Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor QTY uom Unit Price Extended 20001 - 30000 30001 - 40000
Jayden Graphics Inc. 20000 each $0.082 $1,640.00 .078 .074 75.00
Extreme Business Service 20000 each $0.094 $1,880.00 0.094 0.090 0.00
Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 20000 each $0.124 $2,480.00 118 0.102 59.00
FORM# M47, CONFIRMATION CARD, Green post card, perforated, black print on two 92) sides in both English and Spanish with intelligent barcode

32 and postage permit; 6" x 12" with a 5/8" flap folded over and tabbed with 1" tab, 90 Ib index with peel and stick strip; card to be folded at
perforation. Estimated Annual Usage: 75,000. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.
Qty. 50001 - 100000. Quantity Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor QTY UoM Unit Price Extended 20000 - 30000 30001 - 40000 40001 - 50000
Extreme Business Service 75000 each $0.108 $8,100.00 0.135 0.126 0.118 0.00
Jayden Graphics Inc. 75000 each $0.109 $8,175.00 136 J21 117 0
Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 75000 each $0.137 $10,275.00 .148 144 142 59.00
FORM# M49, TEXAS VOTER REGISTRATION APPLICATION (ENGLISH AND SPANISH). Flat size 6" x 9 1/2" with 1 1/2" fold at top and another 5 1/2"
from top. Finish size folds to 6" x 4" (double postcard), 1/2 inch glue strip at top inside card. Score card at 1 1/2" from top and 5 1/2" from top of form

33 (at folds), white with black printing on both sides, with intelligent barcode and postal permit. 67# Vellum Bristol (White). One to be printed IN
ENGLISH and one to be printed IN SPANISH. Estimated Annual Usage: 100,000. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity
breaks in the space provided.
Qty. 50001 - 100000. Quantity Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor QTY UoM Unit Price Extended 20000 - 30000 30001 - 40000 40001 - 50000
Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 100000 each $0.039 $3,900.00 .054 .048 .045 59.00
Extreme Business Service 100000 each $0.04 $4,000.00 0.073 0.061 0.053 0.00
Jayden Graphics Inc. 100000 each $0.103 $10,300.00 133 122 115 0
FORM# M50, DEPUTY VOTER REGISTRATION CARDS, 90 Ib index, 11" x 6' green card with black writing on one (1) side. One to be printed IN ENGLISH

34 and ONE to be printed IN SPANISH. Two (2) perforations at one end of card. Estimated Annual Usage: 75,000. Bidder shall state the price for quantity
one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.
Qty. 50001 - 100000. Quantity Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor QTY uom Unit Price Extended 20000 - 30000 30001 - 40000 40001 - 50000
Jayden Graphics Inc. 75000 each $0.032 $2,400.00 .044 .038 .035 0
Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 75000 each $0.032 $2,400.00 .043 .042 0.033 59.
Extreme Business Service 75000 each $0.039 $2,925.00 0.046 0.046 0.043 0.00
FORM# M51, BALLOT AND SEAL CERTIFICATE, 8 1/2" x 8 1/2" plus stub, 2 carbonless, blue and pink; top snaps out with black print on one side. Form

35 is prescribed by Secretary of State Section 127.036, V.T.C.A., Election Code. Estimated Annual Usage: 2,000. Bidder shall state the price for quantity
one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.
Qty. 1001 - 5000. Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor QTY UOM Unit Price Extended 100 - 500 501 - 1001
Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 2000 each $0.065 $130.00 .337 22 59.
Extreme Business Service 2000 each $0.103 $206.00 0.00 0.40 0.00
Jayden Graphics Inc. 2000 each $0.142 $284.00 496 .248 100.00
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FORM# M52, DISTANCE MARKER, 8 1/2" x 11" 100 Ib laminated card stock, white with black printing on one (1) side in both ENGLISH and SPANISH.

Form is prescribed by Secretary of State Section 62.010 and 61.008, V.T.C.A., Election Code. Estimated Annual Usage: 1,500. Bidder shall state the

36 price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.
Qty. 1001 - 5000. Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor QTY UoM Unit Price Extended 100 - 500 501 - 1001
Extreme Business Service 1500 each No Bid
Jayden Graphics Inc. 1500 each $0.21 $315.00 42 .30 75.00
Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 1500 each $0.59 $885.00 1.10 0.813 59.
FORM# M55, ELECTION OFFICE TELEPHONE INFORMATION, 8 1/2" x 11" blue paper with black printing on two (2) sides, one (1) side in English and one

37 (1) side in Spanish with lamination on both sides. Estimated Annual Usage: 1,500. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity
breaks in the space provided.
Qty. 1001 - 5000. Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor QTY UOM Unit Price Extended 100 - 500 501 - 1001
Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 1500 each No Bid
Jayden Graphics Inc. 1500 each $0.133 $199.50 43 .15 100.00
Extreme Business Service 1500 each $0.177 $265.50 0.00 0.334 0.00
FORM# M56, DEPUTY VOTER REGISTRAR IDENTIFICATION CARD, Business card sized, white, black printing on one (1) side. sides. Estimated Annual

38 |Usage: 1,000. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.
Qty. 501 - 1000. Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor QTY UOM Unit Price Extended 100 - 500 1001 - 5000
Jayden Graphics Inc. 1000 each No Bid
Extreme Business Service 1000 each No Bid
Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 1000 each $0.06 $60.00 0.088 0.038 59.
FORM# M58, COMBINATION FORM FOR EV/ED, 8 1/2" x 14", white paper, black printing on both sides. Estimated Annual Usage: 50,000. Bidder shall

39 |state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.
Qty. 40001 - 50000. Quantity Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor QTY UoM Unit Price Extended 20000 - 30000 30001 - 40000 50001 - 100000
Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 50000 each $0.02 $1,000.00 .024 .023 .017 59.00
Jayden Graphics Inc. 50000 each $0.024 $1,200.00 .032 .029 .02 75.00
Extreme Business Service 50000 each $0.025 $1,250.00 0.029 0.029 0.025 0.00
FORM# M59, COMBINATION FORM FOR EV/ED, 8 1/2" x 14", white paper, black printing on both sides with statement, "l am a Republican and

40 understand that | am ineligible to vote or participate in another political party's primary election or convention during this voting year." Estimated
Annual Usage: 20,000. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.
Qty. 10000 - 20000. Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor Q1Y UoM Unit Price Extended 20001 - 30000 30001 - 40000
Extreme Business Service 20000 each $0.036 $720.00 0.036 0.031 0.00
Jayden Graphics Inc. 20000 each $0.038 $760.00 .033 .027 100.00
Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 20000 each $0.04 $800.00 0.03 0.028 59.
FORM# M60, COMBINATION FORM FOR EV/ED, 8 1/2" x 14", blue paper, black printing on both sides with statement, "l am a Democrat and

M understand that | am ineligible to vote or participate in another political party's primary election or convention during this voting year." Estimated
Annual Usage: 10,000. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.
Qty. 5000 - 10000. Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor Q1Y UOM Unit Price Extended 10001 - 20000 Bidder shall sta
Extreme Business Service 10000 each $0.047 $470.00 0.047 0.00
Jayden Graphics Inc. 10000 each $0.062 $620.00 .051 75.00
Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 10000 each $0.064 $640.00 0.036 59.
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FORM# M62, NOTICE OF PROHIBITION OF CERTAIN DEVICES, 8 1/2" x 11", blue paper, black printing on ONE (1) side IN ENGLISH and SPANISH.

42 |Estimated Annual Usage: 2,000. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.
Qty. 1001 - 5000. Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor QTY UoM Unit Price Extended 100 - 500 501 - 1000
Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 2000 each $0.05 $100.00 101 0.08 59.
Extreme Business Service 2000 each $0.069 $138.00 0.00 0.22 0.00
Jayden Graphics Inc. 2000 each $0.15 $300.00 277 16 100.00
FORM# M64, LIST OF FIRST TIME VOTERS, 8 1/2" x 11", 20 Ib., white paper, printed in English on one side. Estimated Annual Usage: 2,000. Bidder shall

43 |state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.
Qty. 1001 - 5000 Quantity Quantity Set Up Fee
Vendor QTY UoM Unit Price Extended 100 - 500 501 - 1000
Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 2000 each $0.038 $76.00 0.00 0.064 59.
Extreme Business Service 2000 each $0.071 $142.00 0.00 0.244 0.00
Jayden Graphics Inc. 2000 each $0.12 $240.00 45 .16 70.00
FORM# M64, MASS MAILOUT, VOTER REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE, Reference Section 4, Article 4.16.1-4.16.12 of Bid package for details. 4 1/2" x 6",
black print two (2) sides, color insert, design of certificate is prescribed by Secretary of State.
Vendor will:
1) print certificate blank stock

44 12) print data onto blank stock certificates

3) mail certificates (postage)

Data to be printed will be provided by Collin County Elections Administrator.

See Line Item #30: FORM# M11 VOTER REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE FOR SAMPLES OF FORM.
Bidder shall state the price to mail 450,000 certificates.

Vendor QTY UoM Unit Price Extended
Jayden Graphics Inc. 450000 each No Bid

Extreme Business Service 450000 each No Bid

Safeguard Forms & Systems, Inc. 450000 each $0.0286 $12,870.00
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