Bill Burke

/

From: - Alden Wagner <awagner@chamberlinltd.com>

Sent: Friday, July 15, 2016 1:29 PM

To: Bill Burke

Subject: FW: 900 E. Park Blvd. - DryTec Field Report No.'s 36 and 37
Attachments: 7-15-16 WP 900 E Park final phase T&M Repair.pdf

Bill,

Since the previous Not to Exceed amount of $22,000.00 proved to be insufficient to complete the needed leak repairs,
and a new method of repairs has been suggested by DryTec, please see the attached proposal.

The attached Not to Exceed proposal for $6,000.00 is to make repairs as detailed in the field report dated 7-13-16, and
includes three man days (one day of water test) to confirm the leak repairs.

The previous NTE of $22,000.00 has been more than exhausted. An invoice for the remaining $2,636.00 will be
submitted next week.

Please let me know if you have any questions.
Thank you,

Alden

From: Tom Brand [mailto:tbrand @bsa-designgroup.com]

Sent: Wednesday, July 13, 2016 1:01 PM

To: Bill Burke <bburke@co.collin.tx.us>

Cc: cornstubble56@att.net; Alden Wagner <awagner@chamberlinltd.com>; Michael Rozoto
<mrozoto@chamberlinltd.com>; 'Liz Caballero' <Icaballero@drytecmptc.com>

Subject: 900 E. Park Blvd. - DryTec Field Report No.'s 36 and 37

| have attached copies of the subject documents. Please contact me if you have any questions and let us know when you
would like for Chamberlin to schedule the water test that is anticipated to take 3 days..

Thomas E. Brand, RA, RID, RRC, LEED AP
B|S|A Design Group

DryTec Moisture Protection Technology Consultants
8750 N. Central Expressway, Suite 1725

Dallas, TX. 75231

(0) 214.818.0563, ext. 31

() 214.818.0567

(c) 214.797.3900
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