
Line Description UOM QTY Unit Extended Unit Extended

1
State cost of Type B, Grade 3, Aggregate 
per ton delivered to the McKinney 
Stockpile ton 5000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Attribute 1:  Type B, Grade 3 per ton 
Delivered to Farmesville Stockpile No Bid No Bid
Attribute 2:  Type B, Grade 3 per ton 
Delivered to Weston Stockpile No Bid No Bid
Attribute 3:  Type B, Grade 3 per ton 
Delivered to Copeville Stockpile No Bid No Bid

Attibute 4: Min. Delivery, Type B, Grade 3 No Bid No Bid

2
State cost of Type B, Grade 4, Aggregate 
per ton delivered to the McKinney 
Stockpile ton 10000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Attribute 1:  Type B, Grade 4 per ton 
Delivered to Farmesville Stockpile No Bid No Bid
Attribute 2:  Type B, Grade 4 per ton 
Delivered to Weston Stockpile No Bid No Bid
Attribute 3:  Type B, Grade 4 per ton 
Delivered to Copeville Stockpile No Bid No Bid

Attibute 4: Min. Delivery, Type B, Grade 4 No Bid No Bid

3
State cost of Type B, Grade 5, Aggregate 
per ton delivered to the McKinney 
Stockpile ton 3500 No Bid No Bid $31.00 $108,500.00
Attribute 1:  Type B, Grade 5 per ton 
Delivered to Farmesville Stockpile No Bid $36.00
Attribute 2:  Type B, Grade 5 per ton 
Delivered to Weston Stockpile No Bid $36.00

Attribute 3:  Type B, Grade 5 per ton 
Delivered to Copeville Stockpile No Bid $36.50
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Attibute 4: Min. Delivery, Type B, Grade 5

4
Type B, Grade 3 Aggregate ---- State cost 
for Collin County to pick up at your plant 
site by Collin County trucks. ton 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Attribute 1:  State location of your plant site 
for pickup by Collin County trucks No Bid No Bid

Attribute 2:  State number of miles your plant 
is from 4361 N. Central Expwy, McKinney, TX  
75071 No Bid No Bid

5
Type B, Grade 4, Aggregate ---- State cost 
for Collin County to pick up at your plant 
site by Collin County trucks. ton 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Attribute 1:  State location of your plant site 
for pickup by Collin County trucks No Bid No Bid

Attribute 2:  State number of miles your plant 
is from 4361 N. Central Expwy, McKinney, TX  
75071 No Bid No Bid

6
Type B, Grade 5 Aggregate --- State cost 
for Collin County to pick up at your plant 
site by Collin County trucks ton 3500 No Bid No Bid $17.00 $59,500.00

No Bid

Min. delivery to McKinney 
Stockpile is 1 ton but all deliveries 
will be charged a min. freight of 
25 tons regardless of amount of 
material ordered.  Delivered 
pricing is based on end dump 
trailers or belly dump trailers only.  
All prices are direct from 
Bridgeport quarry.
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Attribute 1:  State location of your plant site 
for pickup by Collin County trucks No Bid
Attribute 2:  State number of miles your plant 
is from 4361 N. Central Expwy, McKinney, TX  
75071 No Bid

7
State Cost per Ton for Delivery of Stone 
Rip Rap: Rip Rap 3" x 7"  to McKinney 
Stockpile ton 500 $28.00 $14,000.00 No Bid No Bid
Attribute 1:  Cost per ton Delivered to 
Farmesville Stockpile $28.00 No Bid
Attribute 2:  Cost per ton Delivered to Weston 
Stockpile $28.00 No Bid
Attribute 3: Cost per ton Delivered to 
Copeville Stockpile $28.00 No Bid

Attibute 4: Min. Delivery, No Bid

8
State Cost per Ton for Delivery of Stone 
Rip Rap: Rip Rap 8" x 12"  to McKinney 
Stockpile ton 500 $32.00 $16,000.00 $40.00 $20,000.00
Attribute 1:  Cost per ton Delivered to 
Farmesville Stockpile $32.00 $45.50
Attribute 2:  Cost per ton Delivered to Weston 
Stockpile $32.00 $42.00

Attribute 3: Cost per ton Delivered to 
Copeville Stockpile $32.00 $48.50

24 tons

Bridgeport, TX

73 miles
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Attibute 4: Min. Delivery, 

9
State Cost per Ton for Delivery of Stone 
Rip Rap: Rip Rap 12" x 18"  to McKinney 
Stockpile ton 500 $34.00 $17,000.00 $41.00 $20,500.00
Attribute 1:  Cost per ton Delivered to 
Farmesville Stockpile $34.00 $46.50

Attribute 2:  Cost per ton Delivered to Weston 
Stockpile $34.00 $43.00
Attribute 3: Cost per ton Delivered to 
Copeville Stockpile $34.00 $49.50
Attibute 4: Min. Delivery, 

10
State cost Per Ton for Delivery of Stone 
Rip Rap: Rip Rap 18" x 24" to McKinney 
Stockpile ton 500 $35.00 $17,500.00 $46.00 $23,000.00

Attribute 1:  Cost per ton Delivered to 
Farmesville Stockpile $35.00 $52.00

Min. delivery to McKinney 
Stockpile is 1 ton but all deliveries 
will be charged a min. freight of 
25 tons regardless of amount of 
material ordered.  Delivered 
pricing is based on end dump 
trailers or belly dump trailers only.  
All prices are direct from 
Bridgeport quarry.

Min. delivery to McKinney 
Stockpile is 1 ton but all deliveries 
will be charged a min. freight of 
25 tons regardless of amount of 
material ordered.  Delivered 
pricing is based on end dump 
trailers or belly dump trailers only.  
All prices are direct from 
Bridgeport quarry.

24 tons

24 tons
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Attribute 2:  Cost per ton Delivered to Weston 
Stockpile $35.00 $52.00
Attribute 3: Cost per ton Delivered to 
Copeville Stockpile $35.00 $46.00
Attibute 4: Min. Delivery, 

11
Stone Rip Rap: Rip Rap  ---- State cost for 
Collin County to pick up at your plant site 
by Collin County trucks. ton 500 $12.00 $6,000.00 No Bid No Bid
Attribute 1: Location of your plant for pickup 
by Collin County trucks
Attribute 2:  State number of miles your plant 
site is from 4361 N. Central Expwy, 
McKinney, TX

12
Please state the percent off any other 
items which Collin County may desire to 
purchase that are not listed in this bid

Estimated Awarded Value

0% 0%

70,500.00$                             168,000.00$                                

Min. delivery to McKinney 
Stockpile is 1 ton but all deliveries 
will be charged a min. freight of 
25 tons regardless of amount of 
material ordered.  Delivered 
pricing is based on end dump 
trailers or belly dump trailers only.  
All prices are direct from 
Bridgeport quarry.

24 tons

Chico, TX

75 miles

No Bid

No Bid


