
Line Description UOM QTY Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
1 Forty-seven (47) soil conservation 

structures acre 732 $68.76 $50,332.32 $70.00 $51,240.00 $60.00 $43,920.00 $372.79 $272,882.28
2 Collin County Justice Center acre 336 No Bid No Bid $35.00 $11,760.00 $50.00 $16,800.00 $200.01 $67,203.36
3 Sister Grove Park acre 270 No Bid No Bid $35.00 $9,450.00 $50.00 $13,500.00 $200.01 $54,002.70
4 Parkhill Prairie acre 135 No Bid No Bid $35.00 $4,725.00 $60.00 $8,100.00 $327.79 $44,251.65
5 Miscellaneous Lots and/or Acreage sq, yd 1 No Bid No Bid $80.00 $80.00 $300.00 $300.00 $328.00 $328.00
6 Verona Radio Tower acre 12 No Bid No Bid $60.00 $720.00 $70.00 $840.00 $150.00 $1,800.00
7 Celina Radio Tower acre 4 No Bid No Bid $60.00 $240.00 $70.00 $280.00 $75.00 $300.00
8 Tree Trimming cu. yd 1 No Bid No Bid $80.00 $80.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00
9 Miscellaneous Mowing of County 

Maintained Roads
lane 
mile 700 No Bid No Bid $95.00 $66,500.00 $150.00 $105,000.00 $23,600.00 $16,520,000.00

AWARD TOTALS $93,555.00 $43,920.00
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