Tammi Benners

From: Robert Evertson

Sent: Wednesday, September 21, 2016 3:02 PM
To: Tammi Benners

Subject: FW: Fence Reimbursement for 1033 CR 557
Attachments: fence reimbursment -Ken Roose.pdf

Tammi , attached is the quote from Bobby Robinson to Mr. Roose.
Thanks for your help.
Mike

From: KJRoose @aol.com [mailto:KJRoose @aol.com]
Sent: Wednesday, September 21, 2016 2:51 PM
To: Robert Evertson <revertson@co.collin.tx.us>
Subject: Fence Reimbursement for 1033 CR 557

Mr. Evertson,

As we discussed on the phone today, | would like a fence reimbursement from the Collin County. Let me know if you
need any additional information.

Respecitfully,

Ken Roose
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