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Total Price $73,559.00 Total Price $74,450.00 Total Price $74,765.50 Total Price $77,098.50
Line # Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1
Cloud Managed Network for Vehicles - 
Option 1 50 each $1,471.18 $73,559.00 $1,489.00 $74,450.00 $1,495.31 $74,765.50 $1,541.97 $77,098.50

1.1 Router Modem Cradlepoint IBR900LP6-NA1 each $676.98 $625.00 $842.42 $809.99
1.2 NetCloud Manager Prime and CradleCare for    Cradlepoint ECM-PRM-CC1 each $427.76 $406.00 No Bid $448.20
1.3 5 in 1 antenna this is the same antenna Cradlepoint XK-IN1958-W    1 each $226.36 $238.00 $295.74 $283.78

Line Notes:

1.4 Installation 1 each $140.08 $220.00 $357.15 No Bid

2
Cloud Managed Network for Vehicles (Band 
14) - Option 2 50 each $2,553.97 $127,698.50 $2,565.50 $128,275.00 $2,844.32 $142,216.00 $2,809.19 $140,459.50

2.1 Router Modem Cradlepoint IBR900LP6-NA1 each $676.98 $625.00 $842.42 $809.99
2.2 NetCloud Manager Prime and CradleCare for    Cradlepoiont ECM-PRM-CC1 each $427.76 $406.00 No Bid $448.20
2.3 5 in 1 antenna Cradlepoint XK-IN1958-W    1 each $226.36 $238.00 $295.74 $283.78

Line Notes:
2.4 Modem that connects to Band 14 and slides    Cradlepoint MC400L2 1 each $776.69 $717.00 $935.92 $899.10
2.5 Extensibility dock for second MC400 modem Cradlepoint 170700-000 1 each $140.21 $130.50 $174.26 $161.99
2.6 3 in 1 antenna for the MC400L2 that support   Cradlepoint LG-IN1959-W    1 each $165.89 $174.00 $215.08 $206.13

2.7 Installation 1 each $140.08 $275.00 $380.90 No Bid

Cooperative Contract

Cooperative Contract-Website

HTTP://www.texasbids.com
State Address for Installation Location 4947 ST. HWY. 276, ROYSE 

CITY, TX 75189

CITY OF ALLEN CONTRACT 2015-
8-313

Texas DIR Contract DIR-TSO-
2704

We are not providing a quote 
for installation, as we don't 

http://dir.texas.gov/View-
Search/Contracts-

Detail.aspx?contractnumber=D
IR-TSO-2704&keyword=DIR-

We will bring a mobile team to 
your locations

TIPS - Contract 3032615

https://www.tips-usa.com/
Install will take place at local 

site.

http://dir.texas.gov/View-
Search/Contracts-
Detail.aspx?contractnumber=D
IR-TSO-3652&keyword=3652

GTS Technology Solutions Inc DCi (Digital connections Inc) PURSUIT SAFETY INC Teksys, Inc.

DIR-TSO-3652

XK antenna sku has been 
changed LP-IN1958-W

Quoted replacement antenna 
with Panorama Antennas 
Model:LP-IN1958-B .MIMO LTE 
WI-FI W/GPS 5M BLK 5IN1 
ANTENNA. Replacement for XK-
IN1958-W.

VEHICLES WILL BE DELIVERED 
TO AND PICKED UP FROM 

PURSUIT SAFETY INC BY COLLIN 
COUNTY

XK antenna sku has been 
changed LP-IN1958-W

Quoted replacement antenna 
with Panorama Antennas 

Model:LP-IN1958-B .MIMO LTE 
WI-FI W/GPS 5M BLK 5IN1 

ANTENNA. Replacement for XK-
IN1958-W.

Quoted Panorama Antennas 
Model:LG-IN1959-W .MIMO 

LTE W/GPS 5M BLK 3IN1 
ANTENNA.

VEHICLES WILL BE DELIVERED 
TO AND PICKED UP FROM 

PURSUIT SAFETY INC BY COLLIN 
COUNTY

http://www.texasbids.com/
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