

QUO2018-009 Addition of Items to IFB 2017-074
 Veterinary and Animal Care Supplies

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Boxes 4 U, Inc.		C. SPECIALTIES INC.		Midwest Veterinary Supply		NAO Global Health LLC		
				Total Price	\$0.00	Total Price	\$820.00	Total Price	\$7,963.15	Total Price	\$17,487.14	
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	
173	Carprieve Chew Tabs 25mg 180ct (Carprofen)	20	each	No Bid		No Bid		\$76.14	\$1,522.80	\$58.29	\$1,165.80	645117067003
174	Carprieve Chew Tabs 75mg 180ct (Carprofen)	20	each	No Bid		No Bid		\$93.96	\$1,879.20	\$72.07	\$1,441.40	645107067001
175	Small live animal trap, 36"x11"x12", for animals up to 40lbs, or Collin County approved equal.	10	each	No Bid		\$82.00	\$820.00	No Bid		\$129.98	\$1,299.80	
176	Dogipot Dog Waste bags, 8"x13", 200/box, 10 boxes/case; or Collin County approved equal.	6	case	No Bid		No Bid		\$12.89	\$77.34	\$119.02	\$714.12	Dogipot Dog Waste Bags S-15585
177	Surgical gloves, size 6 1/2, latex free, 100/box, 10 boxes/case.	2	case	No Bid		No Bid		\$104.16	\$208.32	\$83.81	\$167.62	Cardinal Health 2D73DP65
178	Maxon Dissolvable Suture GS-10, 1/2 circle rez cut 26mm, 30" or Collin County approved equal.	20	each	No Bid		No Bid		\$165.15	\$3,303.00	\$389.29	\$7,785.80	
179	Current year Aluminum rabies tags	5000	each	No Bid		No Bid		\$0.13	\$650.00	No Bid		
180	Trucatch Folding Trap 48F or Collin County approved equal.	10	each	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$438.73	\$4,387.30	Trucatch Folding Trap 48F
181	Erosite (enrofloxacin) Injection for Dogs 2.27%	1	each	No Bid		No Bid		\$23.79	\$23.79	No Bid		20 ml
182	Poop scoop, rust proof aluminum, 6"x7", 3" deep, non slip handle grips- 2 piece set.	20	set	No Bid		No Bid		\$14.40	\$288.00	\$24.57	\$491.40	Jorgenson J1103 Ace PS-S
183	Scalpel Nickle Plated Handle #3 Economy - for #10-15 blades, 5 3/8"L	5	each	No Bid		No Bid		\$2.14	\$10.70	\$6.78	\$33.90	

**Item is not an approved equal. This item will not work with the current dog clean-up stations we have.