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IFB 2018-006 General Road Maintenance

Line # Description QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

CATEGORY 1 - Award to Tommy G. Rose  dba Rose Contracting

1
CATEGORY 1 SUBGRADE, BASE - 
Mobilization(Collin County requests Unit pricing) 5 job No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $2,500.00 $12,500.00

2
CATEGORY 1 SUBGRADE, BASE - Traffic Control, 
Full Road Closure (Collin County requests Unit 
pricing) 5 day No Bid $500.00 $2,500.00 $400.00 $2,000.00

3
CATEGORY 1 SUBGRADE, BASE - Traffic Control, 
Single Lane Closure (Collin County requests Unit 
pricing) 5 day No Bid $500.00 $2,500.00 $300.00 $1,500.00

4
CATEGORY 1 SUBGRADE, BASE - Traffic Control, 
Each Intersecting Road (Collin County requests 
Unit pricing) 5 day No Bid $200.00 $1,000.00 $300.00 $1,500.00

5
CATEGORY 1 SUBGRADE, BASE - 6" Lime 
stabilized compacted subgrade, (0-100 SY). 
(Collin County requests Unit pricing) 250 square yard No Bid $20.00 $5,000.00 $26.00 $6,500.00

6
CATEGORY 1 SUBGRADE, BASE - 6" Lime 
stabilized compacted subgrade, (101-500 SY). 
(Collin County requests Unit pricing) 500 square yard No Bid $19.00 $9,500.00 $24.00 $12,000.00

7
CATEGORY 1 SUBGRADE, BASE - 6" Lime 
stabilized compacted subgrade, (>500 SY). (Collin 
County requests Unit pricing) 1000 square yard No Bid $10.00 $10,000.00 $13.00 $13,000.00

8
CATEGORY 1 SUBGRADE, BASE - Lime stabilized 
compacted subgrade, each additional 1" depth, 
(0-100 SY) (Collin County requests Unit pricing) 250 square yard No Bid $2.00 $500.00 $2.00 $500.00

9

CATEGORY 1 SUBGRADE, BASE - Lime stabilized 
compacted subgrade, each additional 1" depth, 
(101-500 SY). (Collin County requests Unit 
pricing) 500 square yard No Bid $1.00 $500.00 $1.75 $875.00

10
CATEGORY 1 SUBGRADE, BASE - Lime stabilized 
compacted subgrade, each additional 1" depth, 
(>500 SY). (Collin County requests Unit pricing) 1000 square yard No Bid $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.50 $1,500.00

Rose Contracting Wopac Const. Inc.LANE Construction
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11
CATEGORY 1 SUBGRADE, BASE - Cement Treated 
Base, (0-100 SY). (Collin County requests Unit 
pricing) 130 square yard No Bid $7.00 $910.00 $24.00 $3,120.00

12
CATEGORY 1 SUBGRADE, BASE - Cement Treated 
Base, (101-500 SY). (Collin County requests Unit 
pricing) 500 square yard No Bid $7.00 $3,500.00 $20.00 $10,000.00

13
CATEGORY 1 SUBGRADE, BASE - Cement Treated 
Base, (>500 SY).  (Collin County requests Unit 
pricing) 1500 square yard No Bid $7.00 $10,500.00 $12.00 $18,000.00

14
CATEGORY 1 SUBGRADE, BASE - Full Depth 
Reclamation, up to 6", (101-500 SY). (Collin 
County requests Unit pricing) 500 square yard No Bid $20.00 $10,000.00 $24.50 $12,250.00

15
CATEGORY 1 SUBGRADE, BASE - Full Depth 
Reclamation, up to 6", (>500 SY). (Collin County 
requests Unit pricing) 1000 square yard No Bid $7.00 $7,000.00 $22.50 $22,500.00

16
CATEGORY 1 SUBGRADE, BASE - Full Depth 
Reclamation, each additional 2" depth, (101-500 
SY). (Collin County requests Unit pricing) 500 square yard No Bid $2.00 $1,000.00 $2.00 $1,000.00

17
CATEGORY 1 SUBGRADE, BASE - Full Depth 
Reclamation, each additional 2" depth, (> 500 
SY). (Collin County requests Unit pricing) 1000 square yard No Bid $2.00 $2,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00

18
CATEGORY 1 SUBGRADE, BASE - Portland 
Cement Slurry (Collin County requests Unit 
pricing) 20 ton No Bid $220.00 $4,400.00 $200.00 $4,000.00

19
CATEGORY 1 SUBGRADE, BASE - Lime Slurry  
(Collin County requests Unit pricing) 20 ton No Bid $170.00 $3,400.00 $145.00 $2,900.00

20
CATEGORY 1 SUBGRADE, BASE - Select Fill 
material, up to 6", (0-100 CY). (Collin County 
requests Unit pricing) 100 cubic yard No Bid $80.00 $8,000.00 $85.00 $8,500.00

21
CATEGORY 1 SUBGRADE, BASE - Select Fill 
material, up to 6", (101-500 CY ) (Collin County 
requests Unit pricing) 500 cubic yard No Bid $80.00 $40,000.00 $84.00 $42,000.00

22
CATEGORY 1 SUBGRADE, BASE - Select Fill 
material, up to 6", (>500 CY). (Collin County 
requests Unit pricing) 1000 cubic yard No Bid $75.00 $75,000.00 $83.00 $83,000.00
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23
CATEGORY 1 Compact existing subgrade until no 
movement is visible (1-100 SY) (Collin County 
requests Unit pricing) 100 square yard No Bid $3.00 $300.00 $10.00 $1,000.00

24
CATEGORY 1 Compact existing subgrade until no 
movement is visible (101-500 SY) (Collin County 
requests Unit pricing) 500 square yard No Bid $3.00 $1,500.00 $9.50 $4,750.00

25
CATEGORY 1 Compact existing subgrade until no 
movement is visible (>500 SY) (Collin County 
requests Unit pricing) 10000 square yard No Bid $3.00 $30,000.00 $2.30 $23,000.00

26
CATEGORY 1 SUBGRADE, BASE - Stormwater 
Pollution Prevention Plan Preparation  (Collin 
County requests Unit pricing) 3 job No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $1,200.00 $3,600.00

27
CATEGORY 1 SUBGRADE, BASE - Stormwater 
Pollution Prevention Plan Implementation (Collin 
County requests Unit pricing) 3 job No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $2,100.00 $6,300.00

121
CATEGORY 1 SUBGRADE, BASE - Flexible Base, (0-
100 SY). (Collin County requests Unit pricing) 250 square yard No Bid $15.00 $3,750.00 $18.00 $4,500.00

122
CATEGORY 1 SUBGRADE, BASE - Flexible Base, 
(101-500 SY). (Collin County requests Unit 
pricing) 750 square yard No Bid $14.00 $10,500.00 $15.75 $11,812.50

123
CATEGORY 1 SUBGRADE, BASE - Flexible Base, 
(>501 SY). (Collin County requests Unit pricing) 1000 square yard No Bid $13.00 $13,000.00 $15.60 $15,600.00

No Bid $1,981.00 $257,260.00 $7,642.40 $330,707.50

CATEGORY 2 - Award to Wopac Construction, Inc.

28
CATEGORY 2 ASPHALT PAVING - Mobilization 
(Collin County requests Unit pricing) 5 job $2,500.00 $12,500.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,800.00 $9,000.00

29
CATEGORY 2 ASPHALT PAVING - Traffic Control, 
Full Road Closure  (Collin County requests Unit 
pricing) 5 day No Bid $500.00 $2,500.00 $400.00 $2,000.00

30
CATEGORY 2 ASPHALT PAVING - Traffic Control, 
Single Lane Closure (Collin County requests Unit 
pricing) 5 day No Bid $500.00 $2,500.00 $300.00 $1,500.00

TOTAL FOR CATEGORY 1:
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31
CATEGORY 2 ASPHALT PAVING - Traffic Control, 
Each Intersecting Road (Collin County requests 
Unit pricing) 5 day No Bid $200.00 $1,000.00 $300.00 $1,500.00

32
CATEGORY 2 ASPHALT PAVING - HMAC Planing 
(Milling), up to 2", (0-100 SY). (Collin County 
requests Unit pricing) 300 square yard No Bid $7.00 $2,100.00 $9.00 $2,700.00

33
CATEGORY 2 ASPHALT PAVING - HMAC Planing 
(Milling), up to 2", (101-500 SY). (Collin County 
requests Unit pricing) 500 square yard No Bid $7.00 $3,500.00 $8.00 $4,000.00

34
CATEGORY 2 ASPHALT PAVING - HMAC Planing 
(Milling), up to 2", (>500 SY). (Collin County 
requests Unit pricing) 1000 square yard No Bid $7.00 $7,000.00 $4.90 $4,900.00

35
CATEGORY 2 ASPHALT PAVING - HMAC Planing 
(Milling), each additional 1" depth, (0-100 SY). 
(Collin County requests Unit pricing) 300 square yard No Bid $2.00 $600.00 $4.00 $1,200.00

36
CATEGORY 2 ASPHALT PAVING - HMAC Planing 
(Milling), each additional 1" depth, (101-500 SY). 
(Collin County requests Unit pricing) 500 square yard No Bid $2.00 $1,000.00 $3.50 $1,750.00

37
CATEGORY 2 ASPHALT PAVING - HMAC Planing 
(Milling), each additional 1" depth, (>500 SY). 
(Collin County requests Unit pricing) 1000 square yard No Bid $2.00 $2,000.00 $3.20 $3,200.00

38
CATEGORY 2 ASPHALT PAVING - HMAC Saw 
Cutting, min 2", (0-100 LF) (Collin County 
requests Unit pricing) 500 linear foot No Bid $1.50 $750.00 $1.00 $500.00

39
CATEGORY 2 ASPHALT PAVING - HMAC Saw 
Cutting, min 2",(101-1000 LF) (Collin County 
requests Unit pricing) 1000 linear foot No Bid $1.50 $1,500.00 $1.00 $1,000.00

40
CATEGORY 2 ASPHALT PAVING - HMAC Saw 
Cutting, min 2", (>1000 LF) (Collin County 
requests Unit pricing) 2000 linear foot No Bid $1.50 $3,000.00 $0.95 $1,900.00

41
CATEGORY 2 ASPHALT PAVING - Type B HMAC, 
up to 2", (0-100 SY) (Collin County requests Unit 
pricing) 500 square yard $18.00 $9,000.00 $20.00 $10,000.00 $14.30 $7,150.00
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42
CATEGORY 2 ASPHALT PAVING - Type B HMAC, 
up to 2", (101-500 SY) (Collin County requests 
Unit pricing) 1000 square yard $12.50 $12,500.00 $19.00 $19,000.00 $12.10 $12,100.00

43
CATEGORY 2 ASPHALT PAVING - Type B HMAC, 
up to 2", (>500 SY) (Collin County requests Unit 
pricing) 2000 square yard $11.00 $22,000.00 $16.00 $32,000.00 $12.00 $24,000.00

44
CATEGORY 2 ASPHALT PAVING - Type B HMAC, 
each additional 1" depth, (0-100 SY)(Collin 
County requests Unit pricing) 500 square yard $10.00 $5,000.00 $7.00 $3,500.00 $7.15 $3,575.00

45
CATEGORY 2 ASPHALT PAVING - Type B HMAC, 
each additional 1" depth, (101-500 SY) (Collin 
County requests Unit pricing) 1000 square yard $7.00 $7,000.00 $7.00 $7,000.00 $6.05 $6,050.00

46
CATEGORY 2 ASPHALT PAVING - Type B HMAC, 
each additional 1" depth, (>500 SY) (Collin 
County requests Unit pricing) 2000 square yard $5.50 $11,000.00 $7.00 $14,000.00 $6.00 $12,000.00

47
CATEGORY 2 ASPHALT PAVING - Type D HMAC, 
up to 2", (0-100 SY). (Collin County requests Unit 
pricing) 300 square yard $20.00 $6,000.00 $20.00 $6,000.00 $14.30 $4,290.00

48
CATEGORY 2 ASPHALT PAVING - Type D HMAC, 
up to 2", (101-500 SY). (Collin County requests 
Unit pricing) 300 square yard $14.00 $4,200.00 $19.00 $5,700.00 $12.10 $3,630.00

49
CATEGORY 2 ASPHALT PAVING - Type D HMAC, 
up to 2", (>500 SY). (Collin County requests Unit 
pricing) 300 square yard $12.00 $3,600.00 $16.00 $4,800.00 $12.00 $3,600.00

50
CATEGORY 2 ASPHALT PAVING - Type D HMAC, 
each additional 1" depth, (0-100 SY). (Collin 
County requests Unit pricing) 50 square yard $12.00 $600.00 $7.00 $350.00 $7.15 $357.50

51
CATEGORY 2 ASPHALT PAVING - Type D HMAC, 
each additional 1" depth, (101-500 SY). (Collin 
County requests Unit pricing) 500 square yard $8.00 $4,000.00 $7.00 $3,500.00 $6.05 $3,025.00

52
CATEGORY 2 ASPHALT PAVING - Type D HMAC, 
each additional 1" depth, (>500 SY). (Collin 
County requests Unit pricing) 1000 square yard $6.00 $6,000.00 $7.00 $7,000.00 $6.00 $6,000.00

53
CATEGORY 2 ASPHALT PAVING - Seal Coat, (0-
100 SY) (Collin County requests Unit pricing) 250 square yard No Bid $5.00 $1,250.00 $5.85 $1,462.50
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54
CATEGORY 2 ASPHALT PAVING - Seal Coat, (101-
500 SY). (Collin County requests Unit pricing) 500 square yard No Bid $4.50 $2,250.00 $4.50 $2,250.00

55
CATEGORY 2 ASPHALT PAVING - Seal Coat, (>500 
SY). (Collin County requests Unit pricing) 100000 square yard No Bid $4.00 $400,000.00 $2.20 $220,000.00

56
CATEGORY 2 ASPHALT PAVING - Temporary Lane 
Markers, (0-1320 linear LF) (Collin County 
requests Unit pricing) 100 linear foot No Bid $1.00 $100.00 $1.00 $100.00

57
CATEGORY 2 ASPHALT PAVING - Temporary Lane 
Markers, (1321-2640 LF) (Collin County requests 
Unit pricing) 100 linear foot No Bid $1.00 $100.00 $0.96 $96.00

58
CATEGORY 2 ASPHALT PAVING - Temporary Lane 
Markers, (>2640 LF). (Collin County requests Unit 
pricing) 100 linear foot No Bid $1.00 $100.00 $0.94 $94.00

59
CATEGORY 2 ASPHALT PAVING - Stormwater 
Pollution Prevention Plan Preparation (Collin 
County requests Unit pricing) 3 job No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $1,200.00 $3,600.00

60
CATEGORY 2 ASPHALT PAVING - Stormwater 
Pollution Prevention Plan Implementation (Collin 
County requests Unit pricing) 3 job No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $2,100.00 $6,300.00

$2,636.00 $103,400.00 $1,400.00 $544,100.00 $6,266.20 $354,830.00

CATEGORY 3 - Award to Wopac Construction, Inc.

61
CATEGORY 3 PCC PAVING - Mobilization (Collin 
County requests Unit pricing) 5 job No Bid No Bid $2,500.00 $12,500.00

62
CATEGORY 3 PCC PAVING - Traffic Control, Full 
Road Closure (Collin County requests Unit 
pricing) 5 day No Bid No Bid $400.00 $2,000.00

63
CATEGORY 3 PCC PAVING - Traffic Control, Single 
Lane Closure (Collin County requests Unit 
pricing) 5 day No Bid No Bid $300.00 $1,500.00

64
CATEGORY 3 PCC PAVING - Traffic Control, Each 
Intersecting Road (Collin County requests Unit 
pricing) 5 day No Bid No Bid $300.00 $1,500.00

Not all lines bid by each vendor - TOTAL FOR CATEGORY 2:
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65
CATEGORY 3 PCC PAVING - 4" PCC Drive 
Approach, (0-100 SY). (Collin County requests 
Unit pricing) 125 square yard No Bid No Bid $56.00 $7,000.00

66
CATEGORY 3 PCC PAVING - 4" PCC Drive 
Approach, (101-500 SY). (Collin County requests 
Unit pricing) 125 square yard No Bid No Bid $55.00 $6,875.00

67
CATEGORY 3 PCC PAVING - 4" PCC Drive 
Approach, (>500 SY). (Collin County requests 
Unit pricing) 125 square yard No Bid No Bid $54.00 $6,750.00

68
CATEGORY 3 PCC PAVING - 6" PCC Pavement, (0-
100 SY). (Collin County requests Unit pricing) 125 square yard No Bid No Bid $61.00 $7,625.00

69
CATEGORY 3 PCC PAVING - 6" PCC Pavement, 
(101-500 SY). (Collin County requests Unit 
pricing) 500 square yard No Bid No Bid $55.00 $27,500.00

70
CATEGORY 3 PCC PAVING - 6" PCC Pavement, 
(>500 SY). (Collin County requests Unit pricing) 10000 square yard No Bid No Bid $53.00 $530,000.00

71
CATEGORY 3 PCC PAVING - PCC Pavement, each 
additional inch, (0-100 SY)(Collin County 
requests Unit pricing) 125 square yard No Bid No Bid $3.15 $393.75

72
CATEGORY 3 PCC PAVING - PCC Pavement, each 
additional inch, (101-500 SY) (Collin County 
requests Unit pricing) 125 square yard No Bid No Bid $3.10 $387.50

73
CATEGORY 3 PCC PAVING - PCC Pavement, each 
additional inch, (>500 SY) (Collin County requests 
Unit pricing) 125 square yard No Bid No Bid $3.00 $375.00

74
CATEGORY 3 PCC PAVING - Concrete Saw 
Cutting, min 2" (0-100 LF). (Collin County 
requests Unit pricing) 500 linear foot No Bid No Bid $1.60 $800.00

75
CATEGORY 3 PCC PAVING - Concrete Saw 
Cutting, min 2", (101-1000 LF). (Collin County 
requests Unit pricing) 2000 linear foot No Bid No Bid $1.50 $3,000.00

76
CATEGORY 3 PCC PAVING - Concrete Saw 
Cutting, min 2", (>1000 LF). (Collin County 
requests Unit pricing) 2000 linear foot No Bid No Bid $1.40 $2,800.00
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77
CATEGORY 3 PCC PAVING - Integral Concrete 
Curb and Gutter, (0-100 LF) (Collin County 
requests Unit pricing) 500 linear foot No Bid No Bid $28.00 $14,000.00

78
CATEGORY 3 PCC PAVING - Integral Concrete 
Curb and Gutter, (101-500 LF) (Collin County 
requests Unit pricing) 750 linear foot No Bid No Bid $27.50 $20,625.00

79
CATEGORY 3 PCC PAVING - Integral Concrete 
Curb and Gutter, (>500 LF) (Collin County 
requests Unit pricing) 8000 linear foot No Bid No Bid $26.00 $208,000.00

80
CATEGORY 3 PCC PAVING - Demo and Remove 
Existing Concrete Pavement, 6" thickness, (0-100 
SY) (Collin County requests Unit pricing) 250 square yard No Bid No Bid $24.00 $6,000.00

81
CATEGORY 3 PCC PAVING - Demo and Remove 
Existing Concrete Pavement, 6" thickness, (101-
500 SY). (Collin County requests Unit pricing) 250 square yard No Bid No Bid $23.00 $5,750.00

82
CATEGORY 3 PCC PAVING - Demo and Remove 
Existing Concrete Pavement, 6" thickness, (>500 
SY). (Collin County requests Unit pricing) 250 square yard No Bid No Bid $22.25 $5,562.50

83

CATEGORY 3 PCC PAVING - Demo and Remove 
Existing Concrete Pavement, each additional 1" 
depth, (0-100 SY). (Collin County requests Unit 
pricing) 250 square yard No Bid No Bid $4.00 $1,000.00

84

CATEGORY 3 PCC PAVING - Demo and Remove 
Existing Concrete Pavement, each additional 1" 
depth, (101-500 SY). (Collin County requests Unit 
pricing) 750 square yard No Bid No Bid $3.75 $2,812.50

85

CATEGORY 3 PCC PAVING - Demo and Remove 
Existing Concrete Pavement, each additional 1" 
depth, (>500 SY). (Collin County requests Unit 
pricing) 10000 square yard No Bid No Bid $3.50 $35,000.00

86
CATEGORY 3 PCC PAVING - Stormwater Pollution 
Prevention Plan Preparation (Collin County 
requests Unit pricing) 3 job No Bid No Bid $1,200.00 $3,600.00
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87
CATEGORY 3 PCC PAVING - Stormwater Pollution 
Prevention Plan Implementation (Collin County 
requests Unit pricing) 3 job No Bid No Bid $2,100.00 $6,300.00

$7,309.75 $919,656.25

CATEGORY 4 - Award to Tommy G. Rose  dba Rose Contracting

88
CATEGORY 4 CLEAN UP - Mobilization (Collin 
County requests Unit pricing) 5 job No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $1,200.00 $6,000.00

89
CATEGORY 4 CLEAN UP - Street Sweeping, (0-100 
SY) (Collin County requests Unit pricing) 100 square yard No Bid $2.50 $250.00 $2.25 $225.00

90
CATEGORY 4 CLEAN UP - Street Sweeping, (101-
500 SY) (Collin County requests Unit pricing) 100 square yard No Bid $2.00 $200.00 $2.10 $210.00

91
CATEGORY 4 CLEAN UP - Street Sweeping, (>500 
SY) (Collin County requests Unit pricing) 100 square yard No Bid $0.20 $20.00 $2.00 $200.00

92
CATEGORY 4 CLEAN UP - Vacuum Truck, Material 
Pick Up and Disposal, (0-100 SY) (Collin County 
requests Unit pricing) 100 square yard No Bid $4.00 $400.00 $6.00 $600.00

93
CATEGORY 4 CLEAN UP - Vacuum Truck, Material 
Pick Up and Disposal, (101-500 SY) (Collin County 
requests Unit pricing) 100 square yard No Bid $3.00 $300.00 $5.50 $550.00

94
CATEGORY 4 CLEAN UP - Vacuum Truck, Material 
Pick Up and Disposal, (>500 SY) (Collin County 
requests Unit pricing) 100 square yard No Bid $2.00 $200.00 $5.00 $500.00

$13.70 $1,370.00 $1,222.85 $8,285.00

CATEGORY 5 - Award to Tommy G. Rose  dba Rose Contracting

95
CATEGORY 5 CULVERTS - Mobilization (Collin 
County requests Unit pricing) 5 job No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $2,500.00 $12,500.00

96
CATEGORY 5 CULVERTS - Traffic Control, Full 
Road Closure (Collin County requests Unit 
pricing) 5 day No Bid $500.00 $2,500.00 $400.00 $2,000.00

TOTAL FOR CATEGORY 4:

TOTAL FOR CATEGORY 3:
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97
CATEGORY 5 CULVERTS - Traffic Control, Single 
Lane Closure (Collin County requests Unit 
pricing) 5 day No Bid $500.00 $2,500.00 $300.00 $1,500.00

98
CATEGORY 5 CULVERTS - Traffic Control, Each 
Intersecting Road (Collin County requests Unit 
pricing) 5 day No Bid $200.00 $1,000.00 $300.00 $1,500.00

99
CATEGORY 5 CULVERTS - Culvert Installation for 
12" to 18" culverts (Collin County requests Unit 
pricing) 1000 linear foot No Bid $60.00 $60,000.00 $180.00 $180,000.00

100
CATEGORY 5 CULVERTS - Culvert Installation for 
24" to 42" culverts (Collin County requests Unit 
pricing) 1000 linear foot No Bid $140.00 $140,000.00 $210.00 $210,000.00

101
CATEGORY 5 CULVERTS - Culvert Installation for 
48" to 72" culverts (Collin County requests Unit 
pricing) 500 linear foot No Bid $240.00 $120,000.00 $300.00 $150,000.00

102
CATEGORY 5 CULVERTS - Culvert Installation for 
84" to 96" culverts (Collin County requests Unit 
pricing) 100 linear foot No Bid $400.00 $40,000.00 $300.00 $30,000.00

103
CATEGORY 5 CULVERTS - Trench Safety Plan 
(Collin County requests Unit pricing) 4 job No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $1,100.00 $4,400.00

104
CATEGORY 5 CULVERTS - Trench Safety 
Implementation per OSHA regulations (Collin 
County requests Unit pricing) 3000 linear foot No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $2.40 $7,200.00

105
CATEGORY 5 CULVERTS - Stormwater Pollution 
Prevention Plan Preparation (Collin County 
requests Unit pricing) 3 job No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $1,200.00 $3,600.00

106
CATEGORY 5 CULVERTS - Stormwater Pollution 
Prevention Plan Implementation (Collin County 
requests Unit pricing) 3 job No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $2,500.00 $7,500.00

117
CATEGORY 5 CULVERTS - Each additional 2 feet 
of cover during installation of 12" to 18" culverts 
(Collin County requests Unit pricing) 1000 linear foot No Bid $10.00 $10,000.00 $2.50 $2,500.00

118
CATEGORY 5 CULVERTS - Each additional 2 feet 
of cover during installation of 24" to 42" culverts 
(Collin County requests Unit pricing) 1000 linear foot No Bid $20.00 $20,000.00 $2.50 $2,500.00
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119
CATEGORY 5 CULVERTS - Each additional 2 feet 
of cover during installation of 48" to 72" culverts 
(Collin County requests Unit pricing) 500 linear foot No Bid $30.00 $15,000.00 $2.50 $1,250.00

120
CATEGORY 5 CULVERTS - Each additional 2 feet 
of cover during installation of 84" to 96" culverts 
(Collin County requests Unit pricing) 100 linear foot No Bid $40.00 $4,000.00 $2.50 $250.00

$2,140.00 $415,000.00 $9,302.40 $616,700.00

CATEGORY 6 - Award to Wopac Construction, Inc.

107
CATEGORY 6 GUARDRAILS - Mobilization (Collin 
County requests Unit pricing) 5 job No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $1,500.00 $7,500.00

108
CATEGORY 6 GUARDRAILS - Traffic Control, Full 
Road Closure (Collin County requests Unit 
pricing) 5 day No Bid $500.00 $2,500.00 $400.00 $2,000.00

109
CATEGORY 6 GUARDRAILS - Traffic Control, 
Single Lane Closure (Collin County requests Unit 
pricing) 5 day No Bid $500.00 $2,500.00 $300.00 $1,500.00

110
CATEGORY 6 GUARDRAILS - Traffic Control, Each 
Intersecting Road (Collin County requests Unit 
pricing) 5 day No Bid $200.00 $1,000.00 $300.00 $1,500.00

111
CATEGORY 6 GUARDRAILS - Remove Guard Rail, 
(0-40 linear feet). (Collin County requests Unit 
pricing) 100 linear foot No Bid $25.00 $2,500.00 $20.00 $2,000.00

112
CATEGORY 6 GUARDRAILS - Remove Guard Rail, 
(41-80 linear feet). (Collin County requests Unit 
pricing) 100 linear foot No Bid $25.00 $2,500.00 $20.00 $2,000.00

113
CATEGORY 6 GUARDRAILS - Remove Guard Rail, 
(>80 linear feet). (Collin County requests Unit 
pricing) 100 linear foot No Bid $25.00 $2,500.00 $20.00 $2,000.00

114
CATEGORY 6 GUARDRAILS - Guard Rail 
Installation, (0-40 linear feet) (Collin County 
requests Unit pricing) 200 linear foot No Bid $65.00 $13,000.00 $30.00 $6,000.00

TOTAL FOR CATEGORY 5:
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115
CATEGORY 6 GUARDRAILS - Guard Rail 
Installation, (41-80 linear feet) (Collin County 
requests Unit pricing) 200 linear foot No Bid $65.00 $13,000.00 $30.00 $6,000.00

116
CATEGORY 6 GUARDRAILS - Guard Rail 
Installation, (>80 linear feet) (Collin County 
requests Unit pricing) 200 linear foot No Bid $65.00 $13,000.00 $30.00 $6,000.00

$1,470.00 $52,500.00 $2,650.00 $36,500.00

11

12

13

121

122

123

41

47

Pacific Rope and Tarp Co. submitted a bid of "No Bid" on every line. Bidder not displayed in spreadsheet

Category 2 - Lane Construction - 22 Ton Minimum

Category 2 - Lane Construction - 22 Ton Minimum

TOTAL FOR CATEGORY 6:

Category 1 - Rose Contracting - Square yardage price is assuming the depth is 6 inches.

Category 1 - Rose Contracting - Square yardage price is assuming the depth is 6 inches.

Category 1 - Rose Contracting - Square yardage price is assuming the depth is 6 inches.

Category 1 - Rose Contracting - Square yardage price is assuming the depth is 6 inches.

Category 1 - Rose Contracting - Square yardage price is assuming the depth is 6 inches.

Category 1 - Rose Contracting - Square yardage price is assuming the depth is 6 inches.

Supplier line item notes


	Lines

