
Bid Request Number 2018-280 Addendum 1

Line Description UOM QTY Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1

8 1/2"x11" Multi-purpose 
Copy Paper, delivered by the 
truckload case 3360 $24.50 $82,320.00 $27.40 $92,064.00 $28.33 $95,188.80 $30.92 $103,891.20 $31.88 $107,116.80 $29.07 $97,675.20 $36.93 $124,084.80

2

8 1/2"x11" Multi-purpose 
Copy Paper, delivered by the 
pallet case 1240 $25.50 $31,620.00 $30.95 $38,378.00 $31.87 $39,518.80 $36.25 $44,950.00 $34.10 $42,284.00 $43.49 $53,927.60 $39.30 $48,732.00

3
8 1/2"x14" Multi-purpose 
Copy Paper case 33 $37.75 $1,245.75 No Bid No Bid $41.97 $1,385.01 $57.13 $1,885.29 $67.99 $2,243.67 $54.30 $1,791.90

4
11"x17" Multi-purpose Copy 
Paper case 9 $29.65 $266.85 No Bid No Bid $34.90 $314.10 $47.20 $424.80 $64.99 $584.91 $42.70 $384.30

Total $115,452.60 $130,442.00 $134,707.60 $150,540.31 $151,710.89 $154,431.38 $174,993.00
Contract Buyboard 528-17 Buyboard 528-17 Buyboard 528-17 Buyboard 528-17 None National IPA 13-23R None

MANS Distributors, Inc. Office Depot, Inc. The Clampitt Paper 
Companies, LLCSpecification Responses Western-BRW Paper Company, 

Inc.
DD Office Products, Inc. dba Liberty 

Paper Veritiv Operating Company Contract Paper Group, Inc.


	Lines

