IFB 2018-257 Food Supplies and Service for Jail Operations

National Food Group, Inc

Ben E. Keith. Company

Gordon Food service

Glazier Food Company)

Line

Description

QTY UOM
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UOM

QTY -
Common
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UOM
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Common
UOM
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QTY -
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UOM

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

Percentage Markup for CATEGORY #1 STAPLES, DRY GOODS

0%

6%

3%

PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #1
STAPLES,DRY GOODS: Chili Powder 1#
container or Collin County approved equal.
PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #1
STAPLES,DRY GOODS: Black Pepper ground
18 oz. container or Collin County approved
equal.

PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #1
STAPLES,DRY GOODS: Dried Beans Pinto
50# bag or Collin County approved equal.
PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #1
STAPLES,DRY GOODS: Cereal Frosted
Flakes 35 oz. container or Collin County
approved equal.

PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #1
STAPLES,DRY GOODS: Crackers Saltines
individually packaged 2 crackers per package
or Collin County approved equal.

PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #1
STAPLES,DRY GOODS: Mix Pepper Gravy 24
0z. bag or Collin County approved equal.
PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #1
STAPLES,DRY GOODS: Pasta Spaghetti 20#
package or Collin County approved equal.
PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #1
STAPLES,DRY GOODS: Salt individual packet
.6 GM per packet or Collin County approved
equal.

304 each

360 each

480 bag

608 case

700 case

800 case

460 case

300 case

4864 oz

6480 oz

24000 Ib

21280 oz

350000 pkg

115200 oz

460 case

900000 each

210

=

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 31.72 $ 0151 $ 3,214.29

No Bid

No Bid

$ 2055 $20.550 $ 9,453.00

No Bid

16

18

50

140

500

144

3000

$ 414

$ 23.89

$ 15.27

$ 11.99

$ 14.57

$ 18.37

$ 0.259

$ 0.449

$ 0.478

$ 0.109

$ 0.024

$ 0.101

$18.370

$ 0.003

$

$

$

$

$

1,258.56

2,912.40

11,465.28

2,321.04

8,393.00

11,656.00

8,450.20

2,991.00

16

16

50

112

500

144

3000

$ 24.59

$ 10.73

$ 11.86

$ 13.75

$ 0.329

$ 0.576

$ 0.492

$ 0.056

$ 0.021

$ 0.082

$13.750

$ 0.002

$

$

$

1,599.04

3,731.59

11,803.20

1,194.63

7,511.00

9,488.00

6,325.00

1,713.00

PRODUCT SAMPLING CATEGORY #1 TOTAL

$ 12,667.29

49,447.48

43,365.45

Percentage Markup for CATEGORY #2 CANNED GOODS

0%

6%

3%

PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #2
CANNED GOODS: Fruit mix light syrup #10
can or Collin County approved equal.
PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #2
CANNED GOODS: Sliced Peaches light syrup
#10 can or Collin County approved equal.
PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #2
CANNED GOODS: Green Beans cut #10 can
or Collin County approved equal.

PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #2
CANNED GOODS: Beans Ranch Style #10 can
or Collin County approved equal.

PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #2
CANNED GOODS: Carrots diced #10 can or
Collin County approved equal.

PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #2
CANNED GOODS: Mixed Vegetable #10 can or
Collin County approved equal.

2480 case

2440 case

2040 case

2760 case

1060 case

1196 case

14880 10#

14640 10#

12240 10#

16560 10#

6360 10#

7176 10#

No Bid

$ 2651 $ 4.418 $ 64,684.40

$ 28.00 $ 4.667 $ 57,120.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 36.08

$ 31.27

$ 19.77

$ 22.73

$ 21.82

$ 26.38

$ 6.013

$ 5.212

$ 3.295

$ 3.788

$ 3.637

$ 4.397

89,478.40

76,298.80

40,330.80

62,734.80

23,129.20

31,550.48

$ 36.84

$ 30.34

$ 24.93

$ 30.55

$ 24.93

$ 28.15

$ 6.140

$ 5.057

$ 4.155

$ 5.092

$ 4.155

$ 4.692

91,363.20

74,029.60

50,857.20

84,318.00

26,425.80

33,667.40




19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

29

30

31

32

35

36

38

PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #2

CANNED GOODS: Peas English #10 can or

Collin County approved equal. 1240 case
PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #2

CANNED GOODS: Sweet Potatoes cut #10

can or Collin County approved equal. 1060 case
PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #2

CANNED GOODS: Potatoes diced #10 can or

Collin County approved equal. 1584 case
PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #2

CANNED GOODS: Salsa, #10 can or Collin

County approved equal. 940 case

7440 10#

6360 10#

9504 10#

5640 10#

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 30.38

$ 33.17

$ 23.68

$ 20.78

5.063

5.528

3.947

3.463

37,671.20

35,160.20

$  37.509.12

19,533.20

$ 27.87

$ 28.11

$ 26.92

$ 35.03

4.645

4.685

4.487

5.838

34,558.80

29,796.60

42,641.28

32,925.00

PRODUCT SAMPLING CATEGORY #2 TOTAL

$ 57,120.00

453,396.20

©»

500,582.88

Percentage Markup for CATEGORY #3 BEVERAGE

0%

6%

4%

PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #3
BEVERAGE: Drink Mix fruit punch flavor yield
of 2 gallons per packet or Collin County
approved equal.

PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #3
BEVERAGE: Fruit Juice frozen apple 4 to 6 oz.
cans or Collin County approved equal.
PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #3
BEVERAGE: Fruit Juice frozen cranberry 4 to 6
oz. cans or Collin County approved equal.
PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #3
BEVERAGE: Fruit Juice frozen orange 4 to 6
oz. plastic cups or Collin County approved
PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #3
BEVERAGE: Fruit Juice frozen orange 8 oz.
containers or Collin County approved equal. 940 case
PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #3
BEVERAGE: Tea Bags large 1 oz. bags or
Collin County approved equal.

8 case

40 case

40 case

940 case

24 case

2168 oz

13440 oz

2880 ea

74573.302 ea

2304 ea

No Bid

No Bid

72 $ 2950 $ 0.410 $ 1,180.00

72 $ 2290 $ 0.318 $ 23,718.45

No Bid

No Bid

288

384

96

96

Non-
Responsive -
wrong size

96

$ 27.27

$ 14.69

$ 15.47

$ 18.98

$ 22.08

0.095

0.038

0.161

0.198

0.230

205.28

514.15

464.10

14,743.76

529.92

264

288

48

70

96

$ 19.49

$ 12.04

$ 13.02

$ 11.23

No Bid

$ 12.02

0.074

0.042

0.271

0.160

0.125

©

160.05

561.87

781.20

11,963.69

288.48

PRODUCT SAMPLING CATEGORY #3 TOTAL

$ 24,898.45

16,457.22

13,755.29

Percentage Markup for CATEGORY #4 DAIRY

0%

6%

6%

PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #4
DAIRY: Biscuits 7.5 oz. carton refrigerated or
Collin County approved equal.

PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #4
DAIRY: Sour Cream Individual Cups 1 oz. per
cup or Collin County approved equal.
PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #4
DAIRY: Shredded Cheddar 5 Ib. package or
Collin County approved equal.

PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #4
DAIRY: Cheddar cheese, #10 can /6 per case
or Collin County approved equal.

PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #4
DAIRY: Eggs Large Grade AA or Collin County
approved equal.

1920 case

12 case

48 case

860 case

1920 case

357120 oz

1200 oz

800.0016 Ib

5160 10#

345600 ea

No Bid

No Bid

20 $ 27.00 $ 1350 $ 1,080.00

No Bid

No Bid

192

100

10

180

$ 10.88

$ 9.89

$ 23.19

$ 33.69

$ 19.68

0.057

0.099

2.319

5.615

0.109

20,236.80

118.68

1,855.20

28,973.40

37,785.60

180

100

20

180

$ 11.44

$ 9.64

$ 12.42

$ 30.01

$ 17.00

0.064

0.096

0.621

5.002

0.094

©

22,696.96

115.68

496.60

25,808.60

32,640.00

PRODUCT SAMPLING CATEGORY #4 TOTAL

$ 25,978.46

88,969.68

81,757.84




40

41

42

43

a4

45

46

47

48

49

50

51

52

53

54

55

Percentage Markup for CATEGORY #5 FROZEN FOODS

0%

6%

4%

FRUDUCT SAVIFLING - CATEGURY #9

FROZEN FOODS: Cobbler Crust Dough ready

to bake 16 oz. package or Collin County

approved equal. 80 case

PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #5
FROZEN FOODS: Cookie Dough oatmeal
raisin ready to bake 1 oz. portions or Collin
County approved equal.

PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #5
FROZEN FOODS: Cookie Dough chocolate
chip ready to bake 1 oz. portions or Collin
County approved equal.

PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #5
FROZEN FOODS: Tortillas flour 5 to 6 in.
diameter or Collin County approved equal.
PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #5
FROZEN FOODS: Tortillas flour 5 to 6 in.
diameter or Collin County approved equal.
PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #5
FROZEN FOODS: Burritos beef and bean
ready to eat 5.75 oz. or Collin County approved
equal.

PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #5
FROZEN FOODS: Corn Dogs turkey 4 oz. each
ready to serve or Collin County approved equal.
PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #5
FROZEN FOODS: Pizza Cheese 4.56 0z. each
ready to bake and serve or Collin County
approved equal.

PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #5
FROZEN FOODS: Hash brown patties pre-
cooked 2.2 oz. each or Collin County approved
equal.

PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #5
FROZEN FOODS: Hash brown patties pre-
cooked 2.2 oz. each or Collin County approved
equal.

80 case

40 case

636 case

636 case

1752 case

2480 case

360 case

940 case

940 case

1920 Ib

22400 oz

11200 oz

206064 ea

324 ea

112128 ea

138880 ea

34560 ea

21855 Ibs

21855 Ibs

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

72 $ 3140 $ 0.436 $ 48,900.27

72 $ 2265 $ 0.315 $ 43,689.33

96 $ 53.98 $ 0.562 $ 19,432.80

No Bid

No Bid

24

320

320

360

360

60

48

96

46.09

44.07

40.67

22.98

22.98

43.18

26.89

50.58

24.18

24.18

$ 1.920

$ 0.138

$ 0.127

$ 0.064

$ 0.064

$ 0.720

$ 0.560

$ 0.527

$ 1.465

$ 1.465

3,687.20

3,084.90

1,423.45

13,153.75

20.68

80,694.78

77,801.73

18,208.80

32,027.51

32,027.51

24

240

240

288

288

60

48

96

30

30

$

30.55

30.55

31.98

24.91

24.91

41.76

28.06

38.43

31.20

31.20

$ 1.273

$ 0.127

$ 0.133

$ 0.086

$ 0.086

$ 0.696

$ 0.585

$ 0.400

$ 1.040

$ 1.040

©

2,444.00

2,851.33

1,492.40

17,823.11

28.02

78,041.09

81,186.93

13,834.80

22,729.20

22,729.20

PRODUCT SAMPLING CATEGORY #5 TOTAL

$112,022.40

258,443.12

©*»

240,716.08

Percentage Markup for CATEGORY #6 FRESH PRODUCE

0%

6%

PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #6
FRESH PRODUCE: Apples red 88 ct or Collin
County approved equal.

PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #6
FRESH PRODUCE: Oranges or Collin County
approved equal. 384 case
PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #6

FRESH PRODUCE: Bananas 40# case or

Collin County approved equal. 624 case
PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #6

FRESH PRODUCE: Celery 40# case or Collin

County approved equal. 24 case

1064 case

1064 case

384 case

624 case

24 case

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

29.47

32.29

19.68

20.37

$29.470

$32.290

$19.680

$20.370

31,356.08

12,399.36

12,280.32

488.88

34.39

37.89

19.99

22.71

$34.390

$37.890

$19.990

$22.710

36,590.96

14,549.76

12,473.76

545.04




56

57

58

59

62

63

64

67

68

69

70

71

72

73

PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #6
FRESH PRODUCE: Onions yellow 50# bag or
Collin County approved equal.

PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #6
FRESH PRODUCE: Tomatoes 2 layer flat per
case or Collin County approved equal.
PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #6
FRESH PRODUCE: Potatoes Idaho russet
baking, large or Collin County approved equal.
PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #6
FRESH PRODUCE: Mushrooms white 10# box
or Collin County approved equal.

36 case

160 case

32 case

48 case

36 case

160 case

32 case

48 case

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

13.89

18.67

19.19

17.29

$13.890

$18.670

$19.190

$17.290

500.04

2,987.20

614.08

829.92

$ 10.72

$ 23.46

$ 16.69

$ 16.60

$10.720

$ 23.460

$16.690

$16.600

$ 385.92

$ 3,753.60

$ 534.08

©

796.80

PRODUCT SAMPLING CATEGORY #6 TOTAL

61,455.88

$ 69,629.92

Percentage Markup for CATEGORY #7 MEATS

0%

6%

6%

PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #7
MEATS: Chicken Patty breaded pre-cooked
3.53 oz. each or Collin County approved equal.

PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #7
MEATS: Hamburger Patty raw, all beef 6 to 8
oz each or Collin County approved equal.
PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #7
MEATS: Beef Patty charbroiled frozen 3 oz.
each pre-cooked or Collin County approved
equal.

PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #7
MEATS: Sausage Patty pork raw 2 oz. each or
Collin County approved equal.

PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #7
MEATS: Pulled Chicken cooked 10 Ib. package
or Collin County approved equal.

PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #7
MEATS: Chicken Breast raw individiually
wrapped 4 oz. portions or Collin County
approved equal.

PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #7
MEATS: Turkey Sausage Patty precooked 10#
1.5 oz or Collin County approved equal.

PRODUCT SAMPLING - CATEGORY #7
MEATS: Meatless patties 48/3.5 0z to a case or
Collin County approved equal.

2040 case

1584 case

1392 case

736 case

800 case

700 case

840 case

400 case

189720 ea

76032 ea

437088 ea

53360 ea

8000 Ib

35000 ea

89040 ea

18133.32 ea

80

80

160

106

40

$ 3345 $ 0.418

$ 8444 $ 1.056

$ 5557 $ 0.347

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 2950 $ 0.278

$ 3250 $ 0.813

$ 79,326.68

$ 80.251.78

$151,806.13

$ 24,780.00

$ 1473332

51

24

90

97

10

40

106

48

27.49

31.88

80.88

31.58

28.77

26.68

26.38

50.29

$ 0.539

$ 1.328

$ 0.899

$ 0.326

$ 2.877

$ 0.667

$ 0.249

$ 1.048

$

102,262.80

100,995.84

392,796.42

17,372.26

23,016.00

23,345.00

22,159.20

18,998.43

148

40

64

48

10

60

106

48

$ 54.48

$ 58.17

$ 71.55

$ 16.97

$ 31.47

$ 51.63

$ 31.01

$ 54.23

$ 0.368

$ 1.454

$ 1.118

$ 0.354

$ 3.147

$ 0.861

$ 0.293

$ 1.130

$  69,837.47

$ 110,569.54

$ 488,650.73

$ 18,864.98

$ 25,176.00

$ 30,117.50

$ 26,048.40

$ 20,486.87

PRODUCT SAMPLING CATEGORY #3 TOTAL

$350,897.90

$

700,945.94

$ 789,751.49

EXTENDED PRODUCT SAMPLING TOTAL

$583,584.50

$ 1,629,115.52

$1,739,558.96

Full food analysis for 2 week menus to meet
State requirements.

2 each

No Bid

1.00

No Bid

TOTAL FOR RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD

$ 1,215,798.02

$ 379,594.67

TOTAL FOR RECOMMENDED AWARD

[$

1,595,392.69

** BEK had an exception for line 73, providing this service only if awarded 90% or more of the bid. Line 73 was not awarded.
***Sysco USA |, Inc. submitted a No Bid for lines 1, 12, 23, 30, 40, 51 and 62.

***National Food Group, Inc. did not bid on enough product sampling to be awarded a Section.
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