Bid Analysis
19-41FP

Scoring for price was based on sample project for 1 mile of Rural Arterial Restriping

SECTION I. THERMOPLASTIC (TYPE 1) PAVEMENT MARKINGS (60 MIL) (HAND WORK)

A&M Stripe-A-Zone Total Highway Maint. Cl Pavement
Points Possible Bid | Score Bid Score Bid Score Bid Score
Sample Project Pricing 7.7 S 19,111.00 7.7 S 26,274.00 6.7 S 61,658.00 5.7
Lead Time 3.5 No Bid 14 3 21 2.5 5-7 3.5
Reputation 2.8 - 2.3 - 1.8 - 2.8
Total - Section 1 14 - | 0 - 13 - 11 - 12
SECTION Il. THERMOPLASTIC (TYPE 1) PAVEMENT MARKINGS (60 MIL) (LONG-LINE) (CITY)
A&M Stripe-A-Zone Total Highway Maint. Cl Pavement
Bid | Score Bid Score Bid Score Bid Score
Sample Project Pricing 7.7 S 47,270.40 7.7 S 51,016.00 6.7
Lead Time 3.5 No Bid 14 3.5 21 3 No Bid
Reputation 2.8 - 2.8 - 2.3
Total - Section 2 14 - | 0 - 14 - 12 - 0
SECTION Ill. THERMOPLASTIC (TYPE 1) PAVEMENT MARKINGS (60 MIL) (LONG-LINE) (RURAL)
A&M Stripe-A-Zone Total Highway Maint. Cl Pavement
Bid | Score Bid Score Bid Score Bid Score
Sample Project Pricing 7.7 S 18,480.00 7.7 $ 19,272.00 7.2
Lead Time 3.5 No Bid 14 3.5 21 3 No Bid
Reputation 2.8 2.8 2.3
Total - Section 3 14 - | 0 - 14 - 13 - 0
SECTION IV. PAINT (TYPE II) PAVEMENT MARKINGS (HAND WORK)
A&M Stripe-A-Zone Total Highway Maint. Cl Pavement
Bid Score Bid Score Bid Score Bid Score
Sample Project Pricing 7.7 S 45,396.00 6.7 S 27,808.80 7.7 S 31,710.00 7.2 S 55,398.80 6.2
Lead Time 3.5 14 3 14 3 21 2.5 5-7 3.5
Reputation 2.8 1.3 2.3 1.8 2.8
Total - Section 4 14 - 11 - 13 - 12 - 13
SECTION V. PAINT (TYPE 1l) PAVEMENT MARKINGS (LONG-LINE) (CITY)
A&M Stripe-A-Zone Total Highway Maint. Cl Pavement
Bid | Score Bid Score Bid Score Bid Score
Sample Project Pricing 7.7 S 28,131.20 7.7 S 37,400.00 7.2
Lead Time 3.5 No Bid 14 3.5 21 3 No Bid
Reputation 2.8 - 2.8 - 2.3




[Total - Section 5 14 | - | 0 | - | 14 - 13 - 0
SECTION VI. PAINT (TYPE II) PAVEMENT MARKINGS (LONG-LINE) (RURAL)
A&M Stripe-A-Zone Total Highway Maint. Cl Pavement
Bid | Score Bid Score Bid Score Bid | Score
Sample Project Pricing 7.7 S 15,840.00 7.2 S 11,246.40 7.7
Lead Time 3.5 No Bid 14 3.5 21 3 No Bid
Reputation 2.8 - 2.8 - 2.3
Total - Section 6 14 - 0 - 14 - 13 - 0
SECTION VII. METHYL METHACRYLATE (MMA) PAVEMENT MARKINGS (HAND WORK)
A&M Stripe-A-Zone Total Highway Maint. Cl Pavement
Bid Score Bid | Score Bid Score Bid Score
Sample Project Pricing 7.7 $ 25,056.00 7.7 S 43,484.00 5.7 86515 3.7
Lead Time 3.5 14 3 No Bid 21 2.5 5-7 3.5
Reputation 2.8 - 2.3 - 2.3 - 2.8
Total - Section 7 14 - 13 - 0 - 11 - 10
SECTION VIII. REMOVAL OF PAVEMENT MARKINGS & MARKERS
A&M Stripe-A-Zone Total Highway Maint. Cl Pavement
Bid Score Bid Score Bid Score Bid Score
0 0 0 0
Award Recommendation - -
SECTION IX. REFLECTIVE PAVEMENT MARKERS
A&M Stripe-A-Zone Total Highway Maint. Cl Pavement
Bid Score Bid Score Bid Score Bid Score
0 0 0 0
Award Recommendation - -
TOTAL POINTS
A&M Stripe-A-Zone Total Highway Maint. Cl Pavement
Score Score Score Score
Total Points 24 82 85 35
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