
DRAFT - 7-11-2019

Total Price $16,775.37 Total Price $172,961.92 Total Price $2,193.00
Line # Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1 Laptops 173 each No Bid $985.55 $170,500.15 $1,069.00 $184,937.00
1.1 Laptop - Dell Latitude 3500 CTO 1 each $945.94 $1,069.00
1.2 Absolute Control (Professional), 3 years 1 each $34.98 No Bid
1.3 ProSupport for Software, Absolute Profession     1 each $4.63 No Bid
2 Rolling Laptop Bag Targus or Col    TBR003US 51 each $49.09 $2,503.59 $57.70 $2,942.70 $53.75 $2,741.25
3 USB 3.0 SuperSpeed 7-port USB Hub J5 or approve  JUH377 300 each $32.99 $9,897.00 $46.06 $13,818.00 $33.75 $10,125.00
4 USB Scan Gun - LS4028 Motorola or C    LS4208-SBZU 51 each No Bid $33.02 $1,684.02 No Bid
5 Optical Mouse Dell 275-BBCB 51 each No Bid $15.25 $777.75 $18.25 $930.75
6 Label Printer - QL-800 Brother QL-800 51 each $85.78 $4,374.78 $92.18 $4,701.18 $91.75 $4,679.25
7 Magnetic Card Reader - USB MagTek 21073062 51 each No Bid $171.47 $8,744.97 $43.00 $2,193.00

verified online 7/11/2019 verified online 7/11/2019 verified online 7/11/2019
Not on Cooperative Contract:

ABC Laser USA - Listed EPIC 6.   They are not a vendor listed under this cooperative contract

TIPS/TAPS
180306

N/A

State the cooperative contract name this quote is offered under. (i.e. TX DIR, TXMAS, 
TCPN, National IPA, Buyboard, TIPS/TAPS, etc.) If none, answer N/A.
State the cooperative contract number this quote is offered under. If none, answer N/A.
Please provide the website URL for the cooperative contract this quote is offered under. If 
none, answer N/A.

NIPA
R160901

www.bhphoto.com/NIPA

TX DIR
DIR-TSO-3763

https://dir.texas.gov/

B & H Foto & Electronics Corp GTS Technology Solutions Inc ADORAMA INC.

Howard Technology Solutions (Howard Industries Inc.)
Scan Technology
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