IFB 2019-302 Road Materials, Asphaltic Concrete

PRIMARY AWARD

SECONDARY AWARD
RK Hall LLC Austin Asphalt TexasBit - Oldcastle Materials Texas
Total Price Price with Total Price Price with Total Price Price with
ILine #  Description QTY UOM Unit Mileage Extended Unit Mileage Extended Unit Mileage Extended
WEST ZONES - PICK UP with mileage calculated in bid price
4361 North Central Expressway, McKinney, TX 75071
1 PICKUP West Zones: Type B 400 ton [NoBid $58.50 $74.74 SZ9,896.00| $74.00 $127.36] $50,944.00
2 PICKUP West Zones: Type B with RAP and/or RAS 400 ton [NoBid $50.50 $66.74 $26,696.00| $64.00 $117.36| $46,944.00
3 PICKUP West Zones: Type C 50 ton JNo Bid $61.50 $77.74 S3,887.00| $79.00 $132.36 $6,618.00
4 PICKUP West Zones: Type C with RAP and/or RAS 50 ton [No Bid $53.50 $69.74 $3,487.00I $69.00 $122.36 $6,118.00
5 PICKUP West Zones: Type D 3000 ton JNo Bid $62.50 $78.74 3236,220.00| $79.00 $132.36| $397,080.00
6 PICKUP West Zones: Type D with RAP and/or RAS 3000 ton $65.00 $109.08 $327,240.00§ $55.00 $71.24 $213,720.00| $69.00 $122.36| $367,080.00
7 PICKUP West Zones: Warm Mix 400 ton [NoBid I 58.50 $74.74 329,896.00| $79.00 $132.36] $52,944.00
8 PICKUP West Zones: High Performance Cold Mix 300 ton $110.00 $154.08 S46,224.00| $100.00 $116.24 $34,872.00| $110.00 $163.36]  $49,008.00
TOTAL PICK UP PRICE FOR WEST ZONES: (Includes No Bid lines) $175.00 $263.16 $373,464.00 $500.00 $629.92 $578,674.00 $623.00 $1,049.88| $976,736.00
EAST ZONES - PICK UP with mileage calculated in bid price
1069 North SH 78, Farmersville, TX 75442
9 PICKUP East Zones: Type B 400 ton [NoBid $58.50 $94.46 S37,784.00| $74.00 $116.92| $46,768.00
10  PICKUP East Zones: Type B with RAP and/or RAS 400 ton [NoBid $50.50 $86.46 $34,584.00| $64.00 $106.92| $42,768.00
11  PICKUP East Zones: Type C 50 ton |No Bid $61.50 $97.46 S4,873.00| $79.00 $121.92 $6,096.00
12 PICKUP East Zones: Type C with RAP and/or RAS 50 ton [No Bid $53.50 $89.46 $4,473.00| $69.00 $111.92 $5,596.00
13 PICKUP East Zones: Type D 4000 ton [NoBid $62.50 $98.46 S393,840.00| $79.00 $121.92| $487,680.00
14  PICKUP East Zones: Type D with RAP and/or RAS 4000 ton $65.00 $90.52 $362,080.00) $55.00 $90.96 $363,840.00| $69.00 $111.92| $447,680.00
15  PICKUP East Zones: Warm Mix 400 ton [NoBid I 58.50 $94.46 S37,784.00| $79.00 $121.92| $48,768.00
16  PICKUP East Zones: High Performance Cold Mix 300 ton $110.00 $135.52 $40,656.00| $100.00 $135.96 $40,788.00| $110.00 $152.92| $45,876.00
TOTAL PICK UP PRICE FOR EAST ZONES: (Includes No Bid lines) $175.00 $226.04 $402,736.00 $500.00 $787.68 $917,966.00 $623.00 $966.36|$1,131,232.00
Plant Location Address for Pick-Up (IRS tax rate .58 5651 HWY 224, East Greenville, TX 75401 11481 County Rd 53, Celina, TX 75009 Approx |4601 Scyene Rd, Sunnyvale, TX 75182
cents) Approx 76 miles roundtrip for West Zones 28 miles roundtrip for West Zones $16.24 IRS  [Approx 92 miles roundtrip for West Zones
$44.08 IRS tax rate and 44 miles roundtrip for [tax rate and approx 62 miles roundtrip for East |$53.36 IRS tax rate and 74 miles roundtrip
East Zones $25.52 IRS tax rate Zones $35.96 IRS tax rate for East Zones $42.92 IRS tax rate
DELIVERY BY ZONE
17  DELIVERED Zone 1: TYPE B 50 ton |No Bid 64.51 $3,225.50 $86.50 $4,325.00
18  DELIVERED Zone 1: TYPE B with RAP and/or RAS 50 ton [No Bid 56.51 $2,825.50I $76.50 $3,825.00
19  DELIVERED Zone 1: TYPE C 50 ton JNo Bid $67.51 S3,375.50| $91.50 $4,575.00
20  DELIVERED Zone 1: TYPE C with RAP and/or RAS 50 ton [No Bid 59.51 $2,975.50| $81.50 $4,075.00
21  DELIVERED Zone 1: TYPE D 1000 ton JNo Bid $68.51 368,510.00| $91.50 $91,500.00
22 DELIVERED Zone 1: TYPE D with RAP and/or RAS 1000 ton JNo Bid $61.01 $61,010.00| $81.50 $81,500.00
23  DELIVERED Zone 1: Warm Mix 50 ton JNo Bid $64.51 S3,225.50I $91.50 $4,575.00
24  DELIVERED Zone 1: Warm Mix with RAP and/or RAS 50 ton [No Bid $56.51 $2,825.50I $81.50 $4,075.00
25 DELIVERED Zone 1: High Performance Cold Mix 50 ton 106.01 $122.50 $6,125.00
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ton [NoBid $67.51 $3,375.50] $92.00 $4,600.00
ton [No Bid 59.51 $2,975.50] $82.00 $4,100.00
ton [No Bid $68.51 $68,510.00] $92.00 $92,000.00
ton [No Bid $60.51 $60,510.00] $82.00 $82,000.00
ton [No Bid $64.51 $6,451.00] $92.00 $9,200.00
ton [No Bid $56.51 $5,651.00] $82.00 $8,200.00

$10,601.00 $123.00 $12,300.00

$89.00 $44,500.00
ton [No Bid $60.76 $30,380.00| $79.00 $39,500.00
ton JNo Bid $71.76 $7,176.00| $94.00 $9,400.00
ton [No Bid $63.76 $6,376.00| $84.00 $8,400.00
ton JNo Bid 72.76 S72,760.00| $94.00 $94,000.00
ton [No Bid $65.26 $65,260.00I $84.00 $84,000.00
ton JNo Bid $68.76 $6,876.00| $94.00 $9,400.00
ton [No Bid $6,076.00| $84.00 $8,400.00

$11,026.00

$125.00

$84.50

$12,500.00

$845.00

ton JNo Bid $58.49 $584.9OI $74.50 $745.00
ton [No Bid $69.49 $694.90I $89.50 $895.00
ton JNo Bid $61.49 $614.9OI $79.50 $795.00
ton JNo Bid $70.49 $35,245.00| $89.50 $44,750.00
ton JNo Bid $62.99 S31,495.00| $79.50 $39,750.00
ton [No Bid $66.49 $664.90I $89.50 $895.00
ton JNo Bid $58.49 $584.9OI $79.50 $795.00
ton JNo Bid $107.99 $120.50 $1,205.00

ton JNo Bid 68.29 . $87.50 $43,750.00
ton [No Bid $60.29 $30,145.00| $77.50 $38,750.00
ton JNo Bid 71.29 $7,129.00| $92.50 $9,250.00
ton [No Bid $63.29 $6,329.00| $82.50 $8,250.00
ton JNo Bid $72.29 S72,290.00| $92.50 $92,500.00
ton [No Bid $64.79 $64,790.00| $82.50 $82,500.00
ton JNo Bid $68.29 $6,829.00| $92.50 $9,250.00
ton [No Bid 60.29 $6,029.00| $82.50 $8,250.00
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$10,979.00

$123.50

$12,350.00

$72.11 $89.00 $44,500.00
ton |No Bid $64.11 $32,055.00] $79.00 $39,500.00
ton [No Bid 75.11 $7,511.00] $94.00 $9,400.00
ton |No Bid $67.11 $6,711.00] $84.00 $8,400.00
ton [No Bid 76.11 $76,110.00] $94.00 $94,000.00
ton [No Bid $68.61 $68,610.00] $84.00 $84,000.00
ton [No Bid $72.11 $7,211.00] $94.00 $9,400.00
ton |No Bid $64.11 $6,411.00] $84.00 $8,400.00
ton [No Bid $113.61 $11,361.00 $125.00 $12,500.00

ton [No Bid $69.37 $43,250.00
ton [No Bid $61.37 $30,685.00] $38,250.00
ton [No Bid $72.37 $7,237.00] $91.50 $9,150.00
ton [No Bid $64.37 $6,437.00] $81.50 $8,150.00
ton |No Bid $73.37 $73,370.00] $91.50

$91,500.00 8/30/2019

2019-302

Draft document until award



76  DELIVERED Zone 7: TYPE D with RAP and/or RAS 1000 ton JNo Bid $65.87 $65,870.00| $81.50 $81,500.00
77  DELIVERED Zone 7: Warm Mix 100 ton [No Bid $69.37 $6,937.00I $91.50 $9,150.00
78  DELIVERED Zone 7: Warm Mix with RAP and/or RAS 100  ton [No Bid $61.37 $6,137.00| $81.50 $8,150.00
79 DELIVERED Zone 7: High Performance Cold Mix 100 ton JNo Bid 110.87 $11,087.00] $122.50 $12,250.00
DELIVERED Zone 8: TYPE B $74.04 $89.00 $44,500.00
81  DELIVERED Zone 8: TYPE B with RAP and/or RAS 500 ton [NoBid $66.04 $33,020.00| $79.00 $39,500.00
82 DELIVERED Zone 8: TYPE C 100 ton JNo Bid $77.04 $7,704.00| $94.00 $9,400.00
83 DELIVERED Zone 8: TYPE C with RAP and/or RAS 100 ton [No Bid $69.04 $6,904.00| $84.00 $8,400.00
84 DELIVERED Zone 8: TYPE D 1000 ton [No Bid $78.04 S78,040.00I $94.00 $94,000.00
85 DELIVERED Zone 8: TYPE D with RAP and/or RAS 1000 ton [No Bid $70.54 $70,540.00| $84.00 $84,000.00
86 DELIVERED Zone 8: Warm Mix 100 ton JNo Bid $74.04 $7,404.00| $94.00 $9,400.00
87  DELIVERED Zone 8: Warm Mix with RAP and/or RAS 100 ton [No Bid $66.04 $6,604.00| $84.00 $8,400.00
88 DELIVERED Zone 8: High Performance Cold Mix 100 ton JNo Bid $115.54 $11,554.00| $125.00 $12,500.00
TOTAL DELIVERY PRICE: (includes No Bid lines) $5,124.22 §1,621,272.80I $6,499.00 $2,052,350.00
State (if any) minimum number of Tons for Pickup of
89 product in West and East Zones 0 1 50
State (if any) minimum number of Tons for Delivery of
%0 product for all zones. 0 13 12
Delivery in calendar days from date of order: N/A 1 day 2 days
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