FY20 Pricing - Safeguard 2016-125

Comparison Pricing Only

Item Number

Item Description

Old Price

New Price

% Increase

8 1/2 X 11 NCR Sets, two part form
print one side black ink. Paper will be
various colors (Industry Standard -
white, canary, pink, goldenrod).
Delivery: 8 weeks ARO.

$ 0.1268

S 0.1344

5.96

S 0.1675

0.1945

8 1/2 X 11 NCR Four part form, print
one side black ink. Paper will be
various colors (Industry Standard -
white, canary, pink, goldenrod).
Delivery: 8 weeks ARO.

$ 0.1944

S 0.2061

6.01

S 0.2517

0.3575

8 1/2 X 11 NCR Four part form with
shading, print one side black ink. Paper
will be various colors (Industry standard
- white, canary, pink, goldenrod).
Delivery: 8 weeks ARO

$ 0.2932

S 0.3108

5.99

S 0.3816

0.4220

10

81/2 X 14 NCR Two part form, print
one side black ink. Delivery: 8 weeks
ARO.

$0.2184

S 0.2315

6.02

S 0.2709

0.4580

11

Miscellaneous Carbonless/NCR Form:
Juvenile Pass Agreement or Speedy
Trial Waiver - 8 1/2 X 11, 4 part NCR,
print one side black ink. Two holes
punched in 8 1/2 side for brads.
Delivery: 10 days ARO.

$ 0.1455

S 0.1542

6.01

S 0.1171

0.3248

12

Miscellaneous Carbonless/NCR Forms,
Custody Report -8 1/2 X 11, 3 part NCR,
3/4" top snap tab, print two sides black
ink with screen, front of pages 1, 2 & 33
- 30% screen. Delivery: 10 days ARO.

$ 0.0764

S 0.0810

6.03

S 0.0710

no bid

13

Miscellaneous Carbonless/NCR Animal
Forms -5 1/2 X9, 3 part NCR; white,
yellow and manila card stock.
Sequential numbering in red. Print one
side black ink. Collin County Logo in
black and white. Delivery: 10 days ARO

$ 0.1014

S 0.1075

5.98

S 0.0996

no bid

14

Miscellaneous Carbonless/NCR Animal
Forms (Shaded), 51/2 X 9, 3 part NCR;
White, Manilla Card Stock. Sequential
numbering in red. Print one side black
ink. Collin County Logo in black and
white. Delivery: 10 days ARO.

$ 0.0834

S 0.0884

6.03

S 0.0996

no bid

15

Miscellaneous Carbonless/NCR Prisoner
Release Form, 51/2 X 4 1/4, 2 part NCR,
print one side black ink. Delivery: 10
days ARO.

$ 0.1033

S 0.1095

6.03

S 0.0995

$

0.1125




16

Miscellaneous Carbonless/NCR,
Maintenance Material Request Form, 8
1/2 X 11, 3 part NCR, print one side
black ink with shading. Numbering, 6
digits in red on page one only. Delivery:
10 Days ARO.

$0.1381

0.1464

6.02

0.1852

$

0.3483

17

Miscellaneous Carbonless/NCR Form -
Medical Charge Sheet, 8 1/2 X 11, 3
part NCR with bar code and gray
shading all three copies. Numbering 5
digits in red. Print one side black ink.
Delivery: 10 days ARO.

$ 0.0905

0.0959

6.01

0.1038

$

0.2716

18

Miscellaneous Carbonless/NCR Forms -
Accounts Payable Request, 3 part NCR
Form (green, goldenrod,blue. 8 1/2 X 5
1/2. Print one side black ink. Delivery:
10 days ARO.

$ 0.2328

0.2468

5.99

0.2814

no bid

32

Miscellaneous Forms, Marriage License
8 1/2 X 14, 75% Rag Linen with Gold
Seal. Black Border on one side only.
Print two sides black ink. Delivery: 4
weeks ARO.

$ 0.0787

0.0834

5.96

0.2678

$

0.5910

35

Envelopes/Stationary/Miscellaneous -
#9 Envelope Left Window (Center Line),
print two sides black ink. One color line
across center of envelope. Conversion
required. Delivery: 10 days ARO

$ 0.0283

0.0333

17.83

0.0375

no bid

37

Envelopes/Stationary/Miscellaneous -
#10 Envelope (Center Line). Print two
sides black ink. One color line across
center of envelope. Conversion
required. Delivery: 10 days ARO

$ 0.0263

0.0336

27.82

0.0258

no bid

41

Envelopes/Stationary/Miscellaneous -
#10 Right Window, Black Imprint 1 side.
Delivery: 10 days ARO.

$ 0.0287

0.0375

30.54

0.0273

no bid

43

Envelopes/Stationary/Miscellaneous -
#11 Plain Envelope, Black Imprint - 1
side. Delivery: 10 days ARO.

$ 0.0300

0.0433

44.37

0.0470

no bid

46

Envelopes/Stationary/Miscellaneous -
Exhibit Envelope, 10 X 15, Manila
Envelope, return address, return
postage with permit information.
Delivery: 10 days ARO.

$0.1132

0.1874

65.52

0.1297

no bid

51

Envelopes/Stationary/Miscellaneous -
Security Envelop (1 Left Window), #10
with imprinting. Delivery: 10 days ARO.

$ 0.0287

0.0360

25.46

0.0315

no bid

55

Envelopes/Stationary/Miscellaneous - 6
1/2 X 9 1/2 White Open End Envelope.
Gum seal. Print one side black ink.

Delivery: 10 days ARO.

$ 0.0546

0.0546

0.00

0.0555

no bid
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