
2019-303
DRAFT DOCUMENT UNTIL AWARD

IFB 2019-303 Equipment, Lease: Road Construction and Right of Way Maintenance Equipment
PRIMARY AWARD
SECONDARY AWARD

Total Price $18,500.00 Total Price $35,107.00 Total Price $36,700.00 Total Price $40,587.50 Total Price $46,150.00
Line # Description QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1 Pneumatic Compactor, 22,000 - 25,000lbs; 68" 1 month No Bid No Bid $3,900.00 $3,900.00 No Bid $3,120.00 $3,120.00
State Make/Model/Year Case PT240 2015 Caterpillar, CW16, 2016
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided 172 hours per month 3000
State Maximum Use Per Month 172 hours per month 160

State Additional Costs over Max Hours $22.67 per hour over limit
2 Pneumatic Compactor, 22,000 - 25,000lbs; 82" 1 month No Bid No Bid $4,200.00 $4,200.00 $5,397.50 $5,397.50 $4,880.00 $4,880.00

State Make/Model/Year Dynapac CP271 2006 Sakai / GW751 / 2016-2019 Caterpillar, CW34, 2016
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided 172 hours per month 3000 3000
State Maximum Use Per Month 172 hours per month 176 160
State Additional Costs over Max Hours $24.42 per hour over limit $37.11 per hour

3 Smooth Drum Vibratory Compactor, 23,000 lb 1 month $3,950.00 $3,950.00 $4,060.00 $4,060.00 $3,900.00 $3,900.00 $4,462.50 $4,462.50 $3,600.00 $3,600.00
State Make/Model/Year 2015 Sakai SV544D or Equivalent 150-2770 - Volvo SD115B Dynapac CA2500D 2013 or 2014 Sakai / SV544D / 2016-2019 Caterpillar, CS54B, 2016
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided 3000 Varies by unit available 172 hours per month 2000 3000
State Maximum Use Per Month 176 160 hrs (8 hr day/40 hr wk) 172 hours per month 176 160 Hours
State Additional Costs over Max Hours $22.57 per hour over limit $22.67 per hour over limit $27.89 per hour

4 Tandem Drum Vibratory Compactor, 21,000 lb 1 month No Bid $5,750.00 $5,750.00 No Bid No Bid $3,440.00 $3,440.00
State Make/Model/Year 150-2920 - Volvo DD110C Caterpillar, CB54B, 2016
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided Varies by unit available 3000

State Maximum Use Per Month 160 hrs (8 hr day/40 hr wk) 160

State Additional Costs over Max Hours
5 Padfoot Vibratory Soil Compactor, 24,000 lbs 1 month $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $3,900.00 $3,900.00 $4,462.50 $4,462.50 $3,760.00 $3,760.00

State Make/Model/Year 2019 Sakai SV544T or Equivalent 150-2970 - Volvo Shell Kit Dynapac CA2500PD 2013 0r 2014 Sakai / SV544T / 2016-2019 Caterpillar, CP54B
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided 3000 Varies by unit available 172 hours per month 2000 3000
State Maximum Use Per Month 176 160 hrs (8 hr day/40 hr wk) 172 hours per month 176 160

State Additional Costs over Max Hours $25.56 per hour over limit $22.67 per hour over limit $27.89 per hour
6 Water Truck 4,000 Gallon Minimum 1 month No Bid $4,450.00 $4,450.00 No Bid No Bid $4,400.00 $4,400.00

State Make/Model/Year 659-6050 - Freightliner MS-106 Caterpillar, CT6, 2016
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided Varies by unit available 3000
State Maximum Use Per Month 160 hrs (8 hr day/40 hr wk) 160

State Additional Costs over Max Hours
7 Water Truck 2,000 Gallon Minimum 1 month No Bid $2,500.00 $2,500.00 No Bid No Bid $3,750.00 $3,750.00

State Make/Model/Year 659-6040 - Hino 338 Freightliner, CTM2, 2016
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided Varies by unit available 3000
State Maximum Use Per Month 160 hrs (8 hr day/40 hr wk) 160
State Additional Costs over Max Hours

8 Compact Track Loader, 3,000 lb 1 month $3,850.00 $3,850.00 $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $2,900.00 $2,900.00 $3,553.00 $3,553.00 No Bid
State Make/Model/Year 2018 Mustang 3200VT 200-1470 - Kubota SVL95-2S Kubota SVL95-2S John Deere/331G/2018-2019
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided 1500 Varies by unit available 172 hours per month 1500
State Maximum Use Per Month 176 160 hrs (8 hr day/40 hr wk) 172 hours per month 176
State Additional Costs over Max Hours $21.86 per hour over limit $16.86 per hour over limit $22.21 per hour

9 Skid Steer Loader, 2,200 lbs 1 month $2,750.00 $2,750.00 $1,375.00 $1,375.00 $2,400.00 $2,400.00 $1,870.00 $1,870.00 No Bid
State Make/Model/Year 2019 GEHL R220 200-1360 - Bobcat S590 Kubota SVL75-2HWC / 2019 John Deere/324G/2018-2019
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided 1000 Varies by unit available 172 hours per month 1000
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Four Seasons Equipment, LLC Herc Rentals Inc. Star Tractor Ltd. RDO Equipment Co. Holt Texas, LTD
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State Maximum Use Per Month 176 160 hrs (8 hr day/40 hr wk) 172 hours per month 176
State Additional Costs over Max Hours $15.63 per hour over limit $13.95 per hour over limit $11.69 per hour

10 Dozer, 43,500 lb Minimum 1 month No Bid No Bid $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $9,690.00 $9,690.00 $10,080.00 $10,080.00
State Make/Model/Year JD 850K, Cat D6T or equal/2013+ John Deere/850K/2016-2019 Caterpillar D6TXW, 2016
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided 172 hours per month 4000 3000
State Maximum Use Per Month 172 hours per month 176 160

State Additional Costs over Max Hours $49.42 per hour over limit $60.56 per hour
11 Motor Grader, 31,000 lb Minimum 1 month No Bid No Bid $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $9,010.00 $9,010.00 $9,120.00 $9,120.00

State Make/Model/Year John Deere 770G 2011+ John Deere/770GP/2016-2019 Caterpillar, 140M, 2016
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided 172 hours per month 3000 3000
State Maximum Use Per Month 172 hours per month 176 160
State Additional Costs over Max Hours $40.70 per hour over limit $56.31 per hour

12 Wheeled Rubber Tire Asphalt Paver, 26,000 lb 1 month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
State Make/Model/Year Caterpillar, AP555 Track, 2016
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided 3000
State Maximum Use Per Month 160
State Additional Costs over Max Hours

13 Asphalt Distributor 2,000 Gallon Tank 1 month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
14 Aggregate Spreader 1 month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
15 Self- Propelled Broom 1 month $2,231.00 $2,231.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

State Make/Model/Year 2017 Superior DT74J or Equiv.

State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided 1500 Varies by unit available
State Maximum Use Per Month 176 160 hrs (8 hr day/40 hr wk)
State Additional Costs over Max Hours 13.92 per hour over limit

16 Fork Lift, Diesel 1 month No Bid $1,050.00 $1,050.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
State Make/Model/Year 450-2110 - DOOSAN D25S-7
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided Varies by unit available
State Maximum Use Per Month 160 hrs (8 hr day/40 hr wk)
State Additional Costs over Max Hours

17 Fork Lift, LPG 1 month No Bid $975.00 $975.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
State Make/Model/Year 450-2120 - Toyota 8FGU25
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided Varies by unit available
State Maximum Use Per Month 160 hrs (8 hr day/40 hr wk)
State Additional Costs over Max Hours

18 Tandem Drum Vibratory Compactor, 3,300 lb 1 month No Bid $1,625.00 $1,625.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
State Make/Model/Year 150-2860 - Volvo DD25BW
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided Varies by unit available
State Maximum Use Per Month 160 hrs (8 hr day/40 hr wk)
State Additional Costs over Max Hours

19 Walk Behind Concrete Saw, Gasoline, Push Type 1 month No Bid $574.00 $574.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
State Make/Model/Year 100-2810 - EDCO SK-14-13H
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided Varies by unit available
State Maximum Use Per Month 160 hrs (8 hr day/40 hr wk)
State Additional Costs over Max Hours

20 Handheld Concrete Saw 1 month No Bid $574.00 $574.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
State Make/Model/Year 100-2740 - Stihl TS800
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided Varies by unit available
State Maximum Use Per Month 160 hrs (8 hr day/40 hr wk)
State Additional Costs over Max Hours

21 Vibratory Plate Compactor 1 month No Bid $395.00 $395.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

NON RESPONSIVE
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State Make/Model/Year
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided Varies by unit available
State Maximum Use Per Month 160 hrs (8 hr day/40 hr wk)
State Additional Costs over Max Hours

22 Solar Message Board 1 month No Bid $1,040.00 $1,040.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
State Make/Model/Year 660-1070 -WANCO WTMMB-A
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided Varies by unit available
State Maximum Use Per Month 160 hrs (8 hr day/40 hr wk)
State Additional Costs over Max Hours

23
Skid Steer Loader, High Flow, 2,300 lbs with 
Cold Planer Attachment 1 month No Bid $4,308.00 $4,308.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

State Make/Model/Year
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided Varies by unit available
State Maximum Use Per Month 160 hrs (8 hr day/40 hr wk)
State Additional Costs over Max Hours

24
Regenerative Air Sweeper with High Lift Dump, 
10,000 lbs 1 month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

25 Mini-Excavator, 10,500 lbs operating weight 1 month $3,450.00 $3,450.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 No Bid $2,142.00 $2,142.00 No Bid
State Make/Model/Year Hyundai R55CR-9A or R60CR-9A 240-1500 Bobcat E50 John Deere/50G/2018-2019
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided 2000 Varies by unit available 1000
State Maximum Use Per Month 176 160 hrs (8 hr day/40 hr wk) 176
State Additional Costs over Max Hours 19.60 per hour over limit $13.39 per hour

26 Half-Lane Cold Planer 1 month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

27
Cold Planer attachment for Compact Track 
Loader 1 month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

28
Tracked mobile inclined screen, with 
rinser/washing equipment with diesel engine 

    
1 month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

29 Asphalt Patch Truck 1 month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
30 Sealcoat Machine, 300-500 gallon 1 month No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Any Additional Fees: N/A N/A

State Maximum Use Per Month

Delivery in Calendar Days from Date of Order

See below

See below
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150-1260 - Multiquip 
MVC88CTHW

200-1362/290-2075 - Bobcat 
S630H

Prorated Hourly - Rental Rate/160 
* overage hours

Overtime will be charged at 1/16th 
the day rate, 1/80th the week rate, 
and 1/320th Monthly rate per hour 
for Single Shift only. 2nd shift at 1.5 
times applicable rate. 3rd shift at 2 
times applicable rate. Rate not to 
exceed 2 times applicable rate

See below

$4.75/gallon to top off fuel if not 
returned full

An environmental fee equal to 3% 
of designated rental rate will be 
charged on each invoice

Environmental fee per rent $15.00

3 days 1-2 days depending on availability 1-2 days 3 days 7-10 days
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Delivery Fee

Pick-up Fee

*Additional:

Item #3: $650.00Item #5: $650.00Item 
#8: $500.00Item #9: $500.00Item#15: 
$500.00Item #25:$500.00

Item #3: $650.00Item #5: $650.00Item 
#8: $500.00Item #9: $500.00Item#15: 
$500.00Item #25:$500.00

125/HR PER TRUCK LOAD EACH 
WAY

Lines 8 & 9 = $375 delivery; All other 
items bid on = $475

Line Item 2: Sakai GW751 - $350; 
Line Item 3: Sakai SV544D - $350; 
Line Item 5: Sakai SV544T - $350; 
Line Item 8: John Deere 331G - 
$250; Line Item 9: John Deere 
324G - $250; Line Item 10: John 
Deere 850K - $400; Line Item 11: 
John Deere 770GP - $350; Line 
Item 25: John Deere 50G - $250

$777 for Lines 1,3,4,5,6,7,11 $851 
for Lines 2, 10                      $1,102 
for Line 12

125/HR PER TRUCK LOAD EACH 
WAY

Lines 8 & 9 = $375 delivery; All other 
items bid on = $475

Line Item 2: Sakai GW751 - $350; 
Line Item 3: Sakai SV544D - $350; 
Line Item 5: Sakai SV544T - $350; 
Line Item 8: John Deere 331G - 
$250; Line Item 9: John Deere 
324G - $250; Line Item 10: John 
Deere 850K - $400; Line Item 11: 
John Deere 770GP - $350; Line 
Item 25: John Deere 50G - $250

$351 for Lines 1,3,4,5,6,7,11         
$371 for Lines 2, 10                     
$975 for Lines 12

*Year of Machine will be confirmed 
at time of rental - Unit will be 
Make/Model listed or =


	Lines

