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1
Quantity (Each Price) Quantity (Each Price) Quantity (Each Price)

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer 500 - 1,000 1,001 - 5,000 5,001 - 10,000
VariVerge 10000 each No Bid
Print Tyme (Kellar Graphics Inc) 10000 each No Bid
Runbeck Election Services, Inc. 10000 each No Bid
Jayden Graphics Inc. 10000 each $0.133 $1,330.00 $0.564 $0.292 $0.192

2

Quantity (Each Price) Quantity (Each Price) Quantity (Each Price)
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer 100 - 500 501 - 1,000 1,001 - 5,000
VariVerge 5000 each No Bid
Runbeck Election Services, Inc. 5000 each No Bid
Jayden Graphics Inc. 5000 each $0.139 $695.00 $1.24 $0.622 $0.35
Print Tyme (Kellar Graphics Inc) 5000 each $0.1858 $929.00 Quantities enter       $383.72 $430.27 $929.20

3
Quantity (Each Price) Quantity (Each Price) Quantity (Each Price)

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer 10,000 - 20,000 20,001 - 50,000 50,001 - 60,000
VariVerge 60000 each No Bid
Jayden Graphics Inc. 60000 each $0.032 $1,920.00 $0.07 $0.049 $0.035
Runbeck Election Services, Inc. 60000 each $0.061 $3,660.00 $0.168 $0.078 $0.061
Print Tyme (Kellar Graphics Inc) 60000 each $0.0621 $3,726.00 Quantities enter       $2,287.00 $3,430.50 $3,728.48

5

Quantity (Each Price) Quantity (Each Price) Quantity (Each Price)
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer 20,000 - 30,000 30,001 - 40,000 40,001 - 60,000
Print Tyme (Kellar Graphics Inc) 200000 each No Bid
Jayden Graphics Inc. 200000 each No Bid
Runbeck Election Services, Inc. 200000 each $0.024 $4,800.00 $0.037 $0.036 $0.029
VariVerge 200000 each $0.041 $8,200.00 The unit price is       $0.064 $0.054 $0.047

FORM# M24, PROVISIONAL ENVELOPE, 11 1/2" x 5 5/8" green envelope, perforated at the top with snap over flap, black print on both sides in English and 
Spanish. Estimated annual usage: 10,000. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.

FORM# M28, STATEMENT OF COMPENSATION AND OATHS, 14 3/4" x 8 1/2" two (2) part yellow NCR, LEFT 3/4" snap out, black printing on one (1) side with red 
notational markings. Estimated annual usage: 5,000. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.

FORM# M9, STATEMENT OF RESIDENCE, 8" x 6", 100 lb, yellow card stock with black printing on two (2) sides in English and Spanish, NO PERFORATION. 
Estimated annual usage: 60,000. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided. Lines 5 and  6 will be 
awarded together.

FORM# M11, VOTER REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE, Blank stock, 4 1/2" x 6", tractor feed, black print two (2) sides, color insert, perforated design of certificate is 
prescribed by Secretary of State. Estimated Annual Usage: 200,000. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space 
provided. Award along with Item 6.



2019-270 Bid Tabulation by Line Item Spreadsheet.xlsx

Draft Until After Award Prepared by Matt Dobecka 10/24/2019 Page 2

6

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer
Jayden Graphics Inc. 550000 each No Bid
Print Tyme (Kellar Graphics Inc) 550000 each No Bid
VariVerge 550000 each $0.281 $154,550.00
Runbeck Election Services, Inc. 550000 each $0.285 $156,750.00

7
Quantity (Each Price) Quantity (Each Price) Quantity (Each Price)

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer 10,000 - 20,000 20,001 - 30,000 30,001 - 40,000
VariVerge 20000 each No Bid
Runbeck Election Services, Inc. 20000 each No Bid
Jayden Graphics Inc. 20000 each $0.127 $2,540.00 $0.134 $0.127 $0.093
Print Tyme (Kellar Graphics Inc) 20000 each $0.148 $2,960.00 Quantities enter       $2,960.52 $3,992.40 $4,959.34

8
Quantity (Each Price) Quantity (Each Price) Quantity (Each Price)

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer 10,000 - 20,000 20,001 - 50,000 50,001 - 60,000
VariVerge 75000 each No Bid
Runbeck Election Services, Inc. 75000 each No Bid
Jayden Graphics Inc. 75000 each $0.059 $4,425.00 $0.11 $0.085 $0.063
Print Tyme (Kellar Graphics Inc) 75000 each $0.0822 $6,165.00 Quantities enter      $2,377.77 $4,834.60 $5,145.00

9

Quantity (Each Price) Quantity (Each Price) Quantity (Each Price)
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer 20,000 - 30,000 30,001 - 40,000 40,001 - 50,000
VariVerge 100000 each No Bid
Print Tyme (Kellar Graphics Inc) 100000 each No Bid
Runbeck Election Services, Inc. 100000 each No Bid
Jayden Graphics Inc. 100000 each $0.054 $5,400.00 $0.07 $0.067 $0.061

*Includes postage of $0.257
*Includes postage of $0.257

FORM# M44, POLL LIST, 8 1/2" x 14", three (3) part carbonless form plus standard stub; yellow, pink and blue with snap out top. Estimated Annual Usage: 
20,000. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.

FORM# M47, CONFIRMATION CARD, Green post card, perforated, black print on two 92) sides in both English and Spanish with intelligent barcode and postage 
permit; 6" x 12" with a 5/8" flap folded over and tabbed with 1" tab, 90 lb index with peel and stick strip; card to be folded at perforation. Estimated Annual 
Usage: 75,000. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.

FORM# M49, TEXAS VOTER REGISTRATION APPLICATION (ENGLISH AND SPANISH). Flat size 6" x 9 1/2" with 1 1/2" fold at top and another 5 1/2" from top. 
Finish size folds to 6" x 4" (double postcard), 1/2 inch glue strip at top inside card. Score card at 1 1/2" from top and 5 1/2" from top of form (at folds), white 
with black printing on both sides, with intelligent barcode and postal permit. 67# Vellum Bristol (White). One to be printed IN ENGLISH and one to be printed IN 
SPANISH. Estimated Annual Usage: 100,000. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.

FORM# M64, MASS MAILOUT, VOTER REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE, Reference Section 4, Article 4.16.1-4.16.12 of Bid package for details. 4 1/2" x 6", black print 
two (2) sides, color insert, design of certificate is prescribed by Secretary of State.  Lines 5 and 6 will be awarded together. Award along with Item 5.
 
Vendor will:  
1) print certificate blank stock  
2) print data onto blank stock certificates  
3) mail certificates (postage) to voters both inside and outside of the U.S. 
 
Data to be printed will be provided by Collin County Elections Administrator. See Line Item #5: FORM# M11 VOTER REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE FOR SAMPLES 
OF FORM. Bidder shall state the price to mail 550,000 certificates.
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10
Quantity (Each Price) Quantity (Each Price) Quantity (Each Price)

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer 10,000 - 20,000 20,001 - 50,000 50,001 - 60,000
VariVerge 75000 each No Bid
Jayden Graphics Inc. 75000 each $0.038 $2,850.00 $0.084 $0.058 $0.041
Runbeck Election Services, Inc. 75000 each $0.065 $4,875.00 $0.11 $0.092 $0.071
Print Tyme (Kellar Graphics Inc) 75000 each $0.0794 $5,955.00 Quantities provid        $2,746.05 $4,928.20 $5,379.00

11
Quantity (Each Price) Quantity (Each Price) Quantity (Each Price)

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer 1 -100 101 - 200 201 -400
Jayden Graphics Inc. 400 each No Bid
Runbeck Election Services, Inc. 400 each No Bid
Print Tyme (Kellar Graphics Inc) 400 each No Bid
VariVerge 400 each No Bid

12
Quantity (Each Price) Quantity (Each Price) Quantity (Each Price)

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer 20,000 - 30,000 30,001 - 50,000 50,001 - 100,000
VariVerge 50000 each No Bid
Jayden Graphics Inc. 50000 each $0.022 $1,100.00 $0.031 $0.025 $0.022
Runbeck Election Services, Inc. 50000 each $0.036 $1,800.00 $0.0541 $0.0394 $0.036
Print Tyme (Kellar Graphics Inc) 50000 each $0.0557 $2,785.00 Quantities enter       $1,760.83 $2,785.83 $5,233.56

13
Quantity (Each Price) Quantity (Each Price) Quantity (Each Price)

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer 10,000 - 20,000 20,001 - 30,000 30,001 - 40,000
VariVerge 20000 each No Bid
Jayden Graphics Inc. 20000 each $0.031 $620.00 $0.05 $0.031 $0.025
Runbeck Election Services, Inc. 20000 each $0.0541 $1,082.00 $0.0541 $0.0394 $0.0394
Print Tyme (Kellar Graphics Inc) 20000 each $0.0617 $1,234.00 Quantities enter       $1,233.33 $1,712.88 $2,192.42

14
Quantity (Each Price) Quantity (Each Price) Quantity (Each Price)

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer 1,000 - 5,000 5,001 - 10,000 10,001 - 20,000
VariVerge 10000 each No Bid
Runbeck Election Services, Inc. 10000 each $0.0444 $444.00 $0.0557 $0.0557 $0.0444
Jayden Graphics Inc. 10000 each $0.059 $590.00 $0.352 $0.09 $0.059
Print Tyme (Kellar Graphics Inc) 10000 each $0.072 $720.00 Quantities enter       $449.18 $720.02 $1,261.71

15
Quantity (Each Price) Quantity (Each Price) Quantity (Each Price)

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer 1,000 - 5,000 5,001 - 10,000 10,001 - 20,000

FORM# M58, COMBINATION FORM FOR EV/ED, 8 1/2" x 14", white paper, 60#text,black printing on both sides. Estimated Annual Usage: 50,000. Bidder shall 
state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.

FORM# M59, COMBINATION FORM FOR EV/ED, 8 1/2" x 14", white paper, 60# text,black printing on both sides with statement, "I am a Republican and 
understand that I am ineligible to vote or participate in another political party's primary election or convention during this voting year." Estimated Annual 
Usage: 20,000. Bidder shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.

FORM# M60, COMBINATION FORM FOR EV/ED, 8 1/2" x 14", blue paper,black printing on both sides with statement, "I am a Democrat and understand that I 
am ineligible to vote or participate in another political party's primary election or convention during this voting year." Estimated Annual Usage: 10,000. Bidder 
shall state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.

#10 PLAIN ENVELOPE with Collin County logo, address, and banner of US Postal "OFFICIAL ELECTION MAIL" logo black imprint, one side only.Estimated Annual 
Usage: 20,000

FORM# M50, DEPUTY VOTER REGISTRATION APPLICATIONS, 90 lb index, 11" x 6' green card with black writing on two (2) sides. One side to be printed IN 
ENGLISH and ONE side to be printed IN SPANISH. Two (2) perforations at one end of card. Estimated Annual Usage: 75,000. Bidder shall state the price for 
quantity of two (2)sided forms forall quantity breaks in the space provided.

FORM# M56, DEPUTY VOTER REGISTRAR IDENTIFICATION CARD, 3 3/16" x 2 3/16" white card stock, black lettering on one (1) side with Collin County logo in 
red, white and blue. Cards must be perforated on all sides. Six(6) cards per page with perforations. Estimated Annual Usage: 400sheets of6 cards.Bidder shall 
state the price for quantity one (1) each for all quantity breaks in the space provided.
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VariVerge 20000 each No Bid
Runbeck Election Services, Inc. 20000 each No Bid
Jayden Graphics Inc. 20000 each $0.027 $540.00 $0.082 $0.043 $0.037
Print Tyme (Kellar Graphics Inc) 20000 each $0.0518 $1,036.00 Quantities enter       $366.67 $564.85 $1,036.04

16
Quantity (Each Price) Quantity (Each Price) Quantity (Each Price)

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Unit Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer 1,000 - 5,000 5,001 - 10,000 10,001 - 20,000
VariVerge 20000 each No Bid
Runbeck Election Services, Inc. 20000 each No Bid
Jayden Graphics Inc. 20000 each $0.029 $580.00 $0.084 $0.044 $0.039
Print Tyme (Kellar Graphics Inc) 20000 each $0.0565 $1,130.00 $391.42 $612.10 $1,130.54

#10 LEFT WINDOW ENVELOPE with Collin County logo, address, and banner of US Postal "OFFICIAL ELECTION MAIL" logo black imprint, one side only.Estimated 
Annual Usage: 20,000.
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