IFB 2020-020 Grounds Maintenance Equipment

Longhorn Inc. IRRIGATORS SUPPLY INC Richardson Saw & Lawnmower Co. Inc. Plano Power Equipment
Total Price $6,506.50 Total Price $39,889.69 Total Price $51,221.69 Total Price $58,271.31
Line # Description Qry uom Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
1 STIHL FS 131R Trimmer/Brush Cutter with Loop Handle
or Collin County Approved Equal; Package includes per
unit: One (1) Spare Auto Cut Head. 18 each No Bid $358.93 $6,460.74 $310.69 $5,592.42 $339.53 $6,111.54
1.1  |STIHL FS 131R Trimmer/Brush Cutter 1 each $335.99 $292.69 $319.99
1.2 |Auto Cut Head (spare) 1 each $22.94 $18.00 $19.54
5 STIHL FS 240R Trimmer/Brush CutterLoopHandle, or
Collin County Approved Equal; Package includes per
unit: One (1)SpareDouble Line Auto Cut Head. 2 each No Bid $518.93 $1,037.86 $454.99 $909.98 $499.53 $999.06
2.1 STIHL FS 240R Trimmer/Brush Cutter with LoopHandle each $495.99 $436.99 $479.99
2.2 |Double Line Auto Cut Head (spare) each $22.94 $18.00 $19.54
STIHL FS 240 BladeTrimmer withBikeHandle, or Collin
3 County Approved Equal; Package includes per unit:
One (1)Spare Brush Knife Blade, and One (1)
SpareDouble Line Auto Cut Head. 3 each No Bid $570.97 $1,712.91 $505.13 $1,515.39 $546.47 $1,639.41
3.1 [STIHL FS 240Blade Trimmer withBikeHandle 1 each $519.99 $458.14 $503.99
3.2 |Double Line Auto Cut Head (spare) 1 each $22.94 $18.00 $19.54
3.3 |Brush Knife Blade (spare) 1 each $28.04 $28.99 $22.94
4 STIHL HS82T Hedger with Thirty (30") inch cutting
blade, or Collin County Approved Equal. 2 each  |No Bid $447.99 $895.98 $394.71 $789.42 $447.99 $895.98
5 STIHL HT131 Pole Pruner, or Collin County Approved
Equal; Package includes per unit: Two (2) spare chains 15 each No Bid $552.27 $8,284.05 $488.54 $7,328.10 $552.27 $8,284.05
5.1 [STIHL HT131 Pole Pruner 1 each No Bid $519.99 $458.14 $519.99
5.2 |Chain (spare) 2 each No Bid $16.14 $15.20 $16.14
6 STIHL MS193T Chainsaw with Fourteen (14") inch bar,
or Collin County Approved Equal; Package includes per
unit: One (1) Case, Two (2) spare chains. 1 each  |No Bid $372.96 $372.96 $346.52 $346.52 $410.34 $410.34
6-1 STIHL MS193T Chainsaw with Fourteen (14") inch bar 1 each $287.99 $267.72 $287.99
6.2 |Case 1 each $50.99 $46.80 $50.99
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6.3 |Chain (spare) 2 each $16.99 $16.00 $35.68
2 STIHL MS180C-BE-14 Chainsaw with Fourteen (14")
inch bar, or Collin County Approved Equal; Package
includes per unit: One (1) Case, Two (2) spare chains. 1 each  |No Bid $294.66 $294.66 $284.99 $284.99 $330.34 $330.34
o STIHL MS180C-BE-14 Chainsaw with Fourteen (14")
’ inch bar 1 each $207.99 $207.79 $207.99
7.2 |[Case 1 each $50.99 $46.80 $50.99
7.3 |Chain (spare) 2 each $17.84 $15.20 $35.68
g STIHL MS362 C-M Chainsaw with Sixteen (16")inch bar,
or Collin County Approved Equal; Package includes per
unit: One (1) Case, Two (2) spare chains. 21 each  |No Bid $704.86 $14,802.06 $655.20 $13,759.20 $758.74 $15,933.54
8.1
STIHL MS362CM Chainsaw with Sixteen (16")inch bar 1 each $607.99 $565.20 $615.99
8.2 |[Case 1 each $50.99 $46.80 $50.99
8.3 |Chain (spare) 2 each $22.94 $21.60 $45.88
9 STIHL MS362CM Chainsaw with Eighteen (18")inch bar,
or Collin County Approved Equal; Package includes per
unit: One (1) Case, Two (2) spare chains. 1 each  |No Bid $708.26 $708.26 $658.40 $658.40 $765.54 $765.54
9.1
STIHL MS362CM Chainsaw with Eighteen (18")inch bar 1 each $607.99 $565.20 $615.99
9.2 |[Case 1 each $50.99 $46.80 $50.99
9.3 |Chain (spare) 2 each S24.64 $23.20 $49.28
10 STIHL MS461 Chainsaw with Sixteen (16")inch bar, or
Collin County Approved Equal; Package includes per
unit: One (1) Case, Two (2) spare chains. 1 each  |No Bid $893.46 $893.46 $833.68 $833.68 $1,070.74 $1,070.74
10.1 . . . .
STIHL MS461 Chainsaw with Sixteen (16")inch bar 1 each $799.99 $743.68 $927.99
10.2 |Case 1 each $50.99 $46.80 $50.99
10.3 [Chain (spare) 2 each $21.24 $21.60 $45.88
n STIHL MS461 Chainsaw withTwenty (20")inch bar, or
Collin County Approved Equal; Package includes per
unit: One (1) Case, Two (2) spare chains. 3 each No Bid $903.66 $2,710.98 $840.08 $2,520.24 $1,084.34 $3,253.02
11.1  [STIHL MS461 Chainsaw withTwenty (20")inch bar 1 each $799.99 $743.68 $927.99
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11.2
11.3

12

121
12.2
13

14

15

16

17

18

18 ALT1

19

20

21

22

Case each
Chain (spare) each
Stihl MS461 Chainsaw withTwenty-Five (25")inch bar,

or Collin County Approved Equal; Package includes per

unit: Two (2) spare chains. each
STIHL MS461 Chainsaw withTwenty-Five (25")inch bar each
Chain (spare) each
HONDA HRC216PDA Twenty-One (21") inch Hand

Mower, or Collin County Approved Equal. each
HONDA HRC216HXA Twenty-One (21") inch Hand

Mower, or Collin County Approved Equal. each
HONDA HRS216PKATwenty-One (21") inchPushMower,

or Collin County Approved Equal. each
HONDA FC600K2A2 Midtine Tiller, or Collin County

Approved Equal. each
BILLY GOAT BC2600HEBH Rough-Cut Mower Twenty-

Six (26") inch, or Collin County Approved Equal. each
GRAVELY ARIENS 946154Walk Trimmer, or Collin

County Approved Equal. each
high wheeled trimmer; Twenty-Four (24”) inch cutting

diameter; Honda GCV 160cc engine; off-set trim each
JOHN DEERE 25-gallon Tow-Behind Sprayer, Model

LP19479, or Collin County Approved Equal. each

Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for any
STIHL Equipment and Parts Not Listed Herein

Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for any
HONDA Equipment and Parts Not Listed Herein

Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for any
JOHN DEEREEquipment and Parts Not Listed Herein

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$3,253.25

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$6,506.50

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$50.99
$26.34

$865.77

$807.99
$28.89

$425.00

15

$865.77

$850.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$46.80
$24.80

$808.73

$751.13
$28.80

$588.41
$958.04

$288.71
$1,047.95

$3,219.04

$486.60

$808.73

$2,353.64

$3,832.16

$1,154.84

$2,095.90

$6,438.08

$50.99
$52.68

$1,053.75

$927.99
$62.88

$675.00

$1,100.00

$330.00

$1,299.00

$3,253.00

No Bid

No Bid

15

10

No Bid

$1,053.75

$2,700.00

$4,400.00

$1,320.00

$2,598.00

$6,506.00
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Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for any

23 ARIENS/GRAVELYEquipment and Parts Not Listed
Herein No Bid 20 No Bid No Bid
24 Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for any
BILLY GOATEquipment and Parts Not Listed Herein 23 No Bid 23 10
DELIVERY: 7-10 days 3 days 10 days 3-5 days
MS194T IS NO LONGER AVAILABLE. STIHL MS193T while supplles.lasts. This mc.JdeI
NOTES: has been replaced by the Stihl MS194T with

REPLACEMENT IS MS194T

comparable specs and operation.

Award as deemed to be in the best interest of the county:

Richardson Saw & Lawn Mower Co., Inc. - STIHL items 1-12 and % off line 20
Richardson Saw & Lawn Mower Co., Inc. - HONDA items 13-16 and % off line 21
Richardson Saw & Lawn Mower Co., Inc. - BILLY GOAT item 17 and % off line 24
Irrigators Supply, Inc. - GRAVELY ARIENS ITEM 18 and % off line 23
NO AWARD - JOHN DEERE - item 19 and % off line 22
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