IFB 2020-122 Equipment Trailers

BIG TEX TRAILER WORLD, INC.

North Texas Trailers, LLC

Ledwell & Son Enterprises, Inc.

Total Price $12,099.00 Total Price $13,036.36 Total Price $83,538.23
Line#  Description QTyY UoM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1 ITEM #1 PICKED UP at Dealer Location: 16 foot heavy duty, tandem axle, full tilt bed trailer,

bumper pull -- BIG TEX Model 14FT-16, or Collin County approved equal. Must meet or exceed

specifications. Enter a price for itemif Picked Upat Dealer Location by Collin County. 2 each $6,049.50 $12,099.00 $6,518.17 $13,036.34(No Bid

ITEM #1, OPTION #1 - DELIVERY: Enter a price for delivery of Item #1 (Entercost of deliveryfee
2 only, DO NOT INCLUDE the price of the trailer) Enter price of delivery fee to: 700A Wilmeth

Road, McKinney, TX 75069 2 each No Bid $0.01 $0.02|No Bid

ITEM #2 - PICKED UP at Dealer Location: 40 ton, 40 foot, fifth-wheel hydraulic tail, low profile

trailer -- Ledwell Hydratail, or Collin County approved equal. Must meet or exceed specifications.
3 Enter a price for itemif Picked Upat Dealer Location by Collin County. If bidder is bidding an

alternate item, bidder shall provide complete specifications comparable to those listed in 4.19 of

Special Conditions and Specifications. Attach complete specifications in "Response Attachments -

Specifications for alternate item." 1 each No Bid No Bid $70,282.80 $70,282.80

ITEM #2, OPTION #1 - DELIVERY: Enter a price for delivery of Item #2 (Entercost of deliveryfee
4 only, DO NOT INCLUDE the price of the trailer) Enter price of delivery fee to: 700A Wilmeth

Road, McKinney, TX 75069 2 each No Bid No Bid $250.00 $500.00
5 ITEM #2 - OPTION #2: Self-contained wet kit with pony motor (Enterprice for option itemonly,

DO NOT INCLUDE the price of the trailer) 1 each No Bid No Bid $6,455.43 $6,455.43
6 ITEM #2 - OPTION #3: One Lot of D-rings on both sides of trailer, on twenty-four (24") inch

centers. (Enterprice for option itemonly, DO NOT INCLUDE the price of the trailer) 1 each No Bid No Bid $1,575.00 $1,575.00
7 ITEM #2 - OPTION #4: Swing out side extensions on main deck: 1/4 inch steel extensions on

twenty-four (24") centers; to extend width by twelve (12") inches on each side of trailer.

(Enterprice for option itemonly, DO NOT INCLUDE the price of the trailer) 1 each No Bid No Bid $4,725.00 $4,725.00

TOTAL FOR ITEM #2 WITH OPTIONS #1 & #3: $72,107.80

MAKE & MODEL:

Big Tex 14FT-16BK

Maxxd G6X 83x20 Gravity Tilt

Ledwell Hydratail

COMPLETION TIME: 4 weeks 45-60 days depending on option|95 days
WARRANTY: 2 year 3 year
1030 N. McDonald St.,
ADDRESS IF PICKED UP: 13663 Hwy 75, Van Alstyne, TX |McKinney, TX 3300 Waco St, Texarkana, TX

SERVICE FACILITY NAME/ADDRESS:

Big Tex, 13663 Hwy 75, Van
Alstyne, TX

North Texas Trailers, 1030 N.
McDonald St., McKinney, TX

Patrick Services Inc., 4727
Alexander Ln, Dallas, TX
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