
IFB NO. # 03193-12 GT Distributors, Inc. Lone Star Uniforms, Inc. Regional Uniform & Supply

UNIFORMS: LAW ENFORCEMENT AND RELATED    

ITEMS, WORK UNIFORMS AND MISC.    

DESCRIPTION                                   

SECTION I

03193-12-01-01    

Law Enforcement - Men's S/S Shirt $59.55 $64.00 $71.00

03193-12-01-02

Law Enforcement - Men's S/S Shirt Size over 20.5 $77.42 $73.00 $83.60

03193-12-01-03    

Law Enforcement - Ladies S/S Shirt $56.15 $64.00 $73.65

03193-12-01-04

Law Enforcement - Ladies S/S Shirt Size over 3XL $72.98 $73.00 $86.65

03193-12-01-05

Law Enforcement - Men's L/S Shirt $66.07 $71.00 $75.60

03193-12-01-06

Law Enforcement - Men's L/S Shirt Size over 20.5 $85.89 $80.00 $89.58

03193-12-01-07

Law Enforcement - Ladies L/S Shirt $62.67 $71.00 $77.95

03193-12-01-08

Law Enforcement - Ladies L/S Shirt Size ovr 3XL $81.47 $80.00 $86.00

03193-12-01-09

Law Enforcement - Men's Trouser $0.00 $41.50 No Bid

03193-12-01-10    

Law Enforcement - Men's Trouser Size 54 and over $0.00 $49.00 No Bid

03193-12-01-11

Law Enforcement - Ladies Trouser $0.00 $41.50 No Bid

03193-12-01-12    

Law Enforcement - Ladies Trouser Size 24 and over  $0.00 $49.00 No Bid

03193-12-01-13

Law Enforcement - Patrol Jacket $0.00 $370.00 No Bid 

03193-12-01-14

Law Enforcement - Liner - Duty Jacket 0% 0% No Bid

03193-12-01-15

Law Enforcement - Detention Officer Jacket $154.88 $95.00 No Bid

03193-12-01-16

Law Enforcement - Name Bars $7.87 $9.50 $9.26

03193-12-01-17

Law Enforcement - Serving Since Bar $0.00 $9.50 $9.90

SECTION I - TOTAL: $724.95 $871.00 $663.19

(7) No Bid Items (7) No Bid items

SECTION II

03193-12-02-01

Work Uniforms - Men's S/S Shirt $0.00 $40.00 No Bid

03193-12-02-02    

Work Uniforms - Men's S/S Shirt Size over 20.5 $0.00 $48.00 No Bid

03193-12-02-03

Work Uniforms - Ladies S/S Shirt $0.00 $40.00 No Bid

03193-12-02-04    

Work Uniforms - Ladies S/S Size 3XL and over $0.00 $48.00 No Bid

03193-12-02-05

Work Uniforms - Men's L/S Shirt $0.00 $44.00 No Bid

03193-12-02-06

Work Uniforms - Men's L/S Shirt Size over 20.5 $0.00 $53.00 No Bid

03193-12-02-07

Work Uniforms - Ladies L/S Shirt $0.00 $44.00 No Bid

03193-12-02-08

Work Uniforms - Ladies L/S Shirt 3XL and over $0.00 $53.00 No Bid

03193-12-02-09

Work Uniforms - Men's Trouser $0.00 $42.00 No Bid

03193-12-02-10

Work Uniforms - Men's Trouser Size over 54 $0.00 $49.00 No Bid

03193-12-02-11    

Work Uniforms - Ladies Trouser $0.00 $42.00 No Bid

03193-12-02-12

Work Uniforms - Ladies Trouser Size over 24 $0.00 $49.00 No Bid

SECTION II - TOTAL: $0.00 $552.00 No Bid

(13) No Bid Items  (13) No Bid Items

SECTION 1 & 2 TOTALS: $724.95 $1,423.00 $663.19

(20) No Bid Items  (20) No Bid Items

SECTION III

03193-12-03-01

Discount off Catalog Price List/ Law Enforcement 0% 25% No Bid

03193-12-03-02

Discount off Catalog Price List/ Work Uniforms 0% 25% No Bid

****** NOT AWARDING LINE ITEMS

# 03193-12-01-13 & 03193-12-01-14 *******    


