Evaluation Spreadsheet

Supplies: Specialized Printing for Elections

IFB No. 2013-118

Data Flex
Form Estimated Annual |Business Extreme Business AlphaGraphics Accurate Forms [Color Document
Bid Item |Number |Description Usage Products LLC |Services, Inc. #391 Jayden Graphics |& Supplies Solutions
Election Printing Supplies, Section 1:
1-01 M1 Jacket Envelope, Early 10,000
4-3/4" x 11" brown Kraft envelope with
black printing on one (1) side.
0-100 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.34 $0.50 No Bid
101-500 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.24 $0.50 No Bid
501-1000 $0.12 $0.33 No Bid $0.16 $0.50 No Bid
1001-5000 $0.07 0.241 $0.1519 $0.12 $0.12 No Bid
5001-10000 $0.069 $0.19 $0.1421 $0.08 $0.10 No Bid
Set up fee $59.00 $0.00 $37.50 $35.00 $25.00 No Bid
1-02 M2 Ballot Envelope
4-1/4" x 9 1/2" white with black printing,
two (2) sides, English on one (1) side
and Spanish on side two (2) 10,000
0-100 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.28 $0.44 No Bid
101-500 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.18 $0.44 No Bid
501-1000 $0.106 No Bid $0.1708 $0.105 $0.44 No Bid
1001-5000 $0.049 No Bid $0.0945 $0.045 $0.075 No Bid
5001-10000 $0.042 No Bid $0.0833 $0.038 $0.0620 No Bid
Set up fee $59.00 No Bid $75.00 $70.00 $40.00 No Bid
1-03 M3 Regular Mail Envelope 7,000
4-3/4" x 11" green envelope with printing
(English and Spanish) on one (1) side,
black ink
0-100 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.37 $0.45 No Bid
101-500 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.24 $0.45 No Bid
501-1000 $0.175 $0.23 No Bid $0.21 $0.45 No Bid
1001-5000 $0.119 $0.16 $0.0718 $0.16 $0.18 No Bid
5001-10000 $0.09 $0.144 $0.0639 $0.139 $0.14 No Bid
Set up fee $59.00 $0.00 $37.50 $35.00 $25.00 No Bid
1-04 M4 FPCA Carrier Envelope 7,000
4-1/2" x 10-3/8" white envelope with
black printing, two (2) sides, bar coding
and postal permit
0-100 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.34 $0.48 No Bid
101-500 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.24 $0.48 No Bid
501-1000 $0.119 $0.078 $0.2307 $0.16 $0.48 No Bid
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1001-5000 $0.059 $0.0612 $0.1469 $0.108 $0.12 No Bid
5001-10000 $0.058 $0.0576 $0.1357 $0.09 $0.11 No Bid
Set up fee $59.00 $0.00 $75.00 per hour  [$70.00 $45.00 No Bid
1-05 M5 FPCA Mailer Envelope 10,000
4 3/4" x 11" white envelope with black
printing, one (1) side, bar coding and
postal permit
0-100 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.33 $0.30 No Bid
101-500 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.23 $0.30 No Bid
501-1000 $0.114 $0.0757 $0.205 $0.15 $0.30 No Bid
1001-5000 $0.075 $0.0624 $0.1519 $0.09 $0.15 No Bid
5001-10000 $0.063 $0.0588 $0.1421 $0.074 $0.13 No Bid
Set up fee $59.00 $0.00 $37.50 $35.00 $25.00 No Bid
1-06 M6 Regular Mail Carrier Envelope 5,000
4-1/2" x 10-3/8" yellow envelope with
black printing, two sides in both English
and Spanish
0-100 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.34 $0.47 No Bid
101-500 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.24 $0.47 No Bid
501-1000 $0.141 No Bid No Bid $0.16 $0.47 No Bid
1001-5000 $0.1038 $0.0984 $0.2274 $0.108 $0.18 No Bid
5001-10000 $0.069 $0.0924 $0.2162 $0.09 $0.14 No Bid
Set up fee $59.00 $0.00 $75.00 per hour  [$70.00 $50.00 No Bid
1-07 M10 Party Affiliation Certificate 3,000
8-1/2" x 14", white 24 Ib bond paper with
center perforation and six (6) horizontal
perforations, black printing, one (1) side
0-100 No Bid $0.132 No Bid $0.48 $0.24 No Bid
101-500 $0.276 $0.15 $0.6602 $0.48 $0.24 No Bid
501-1000 $0.16 $0.1668 $0.4637 $0.269 $0.24 No Bid
1001-5000 $0.077 $0.0816 $0.3007 $0.264 $0.11 No Bid
5001-10000 $0.06 $0.0684 $0.2749 $0.135 $0.10 No Bid
Set up fee $59.00 $0.00 $75.00 per hour  [$35.00 $40.00 No Bid
1-08 M11 Voter Registration Certificate 100,000
Blank stock, 4-1/2" x 6", tractor feed,
black print two (2) sides, color insert,
perforated design of cetificate is
prescribed by Secretary of State
0-100 $0.214 $0.246 No Bid $0.48 $0.36 No Bid
101-500 $0.148 $0.1164 No Bid $0.32 $0.20 No Bid
501-1000 $0.084 $0.066 No Bid $0.32 $0.116 No Bid

N
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1001-5000 $0.064 $0.0492 $0.1359 $0.075 $0.095 No Bid
5001-10000 $0.038 $0.0396 $0.0856 $0.04 $0.068 No Bid
Set up fee $59.00 $0.00 $75.00 per hour  [$60.00 $45.00 No Bid
1-09 M24 Provisional Envelope 10,000
perforated at the top with snap over flap,
black print on both sides in ENGLISH
0-100 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.75 $2.03 No Bid
101-500 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.72 $1.35 No Bid
501-1000 $0.455 No Bid No Bid $0.36 $1.14 No Bid
1001-5000 $0.125 No Bid No Bid $0.18 $0.59 No Bid
5001-10000 $0.79 No Bid No Bid $0.127 $0.42 No Bid
Set up fee $59.00 No Bid No Bid $70.00 $75.00 No Bid
1-10 M28 Statement of Compensation and Oaths [5,000
14-3/4" x 8-1/2" two (2) part yellow NCR,
LEFT 3/4" snap out, black printing on
one (1) side with red notational markings
0-100 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.34 $0.32 No Bid
101-500 $0.22 $0.186 No Bid $0.28 $0.25 No Bid
501-1000 $0.211 $0.2016 $0.6191 $0.28 $0.20 No Bid
1001-5000 $0.15 $0.0984 $0.2196 $0.222 $0.19 No Bid
5001-10000 $0.095 $0.078 $0.1661 $0.07 $0.14 No Bid
Set up fee $59.00 $0.00 $75.00 per hour $30.00 No Bid
|
Election Printing Supplies, Section 2:
2-01 M9 Statement of Residence 40,000
8" x 6" 100Ib, yellow card index card
stock with black printing on two (2) sides
in English and Spanish, NO
PERFORATION.
0-1000 $0.059 $0.1836 $0.2073 $0.44 $0.32 No Bid
1001-5000 $0.048 $0.066 $0.1268 $0.39 $0.14 No Bid
5001-10000 $0.045 $0.0528 $0.1131 $0.095 $0.09 No Bid
10001-15000 $0.043 $0.0468 $0.1062 $0.055 $0.074 No Bid
15001-20000 $0.033 $0.0408 $0.1032 $0.045 $0.06 No Bid
20001-30000 $0.032 $0.0384 $0.1014 $0.035 $0.051 No Bid
30001-40000 $0.0319 $0.0368 $0.1001 $0.025 $0.041 No Bid
Set up fee $59.00 $0.00 $75.00 per hour  [$60.00 $40.00 No Bid
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\
Election Printing Supplies, Section 3:
Ballot and Seal Certificate and Register
3-01 M20 of Official Ballot 3,000
8-1/2" x 14" plus stub, 3 part carbonless,
white, yellow, pink; tears apart at top
with black print on one side.
0-100 No Bid No Bid $0.6284 $0.24 $0.675 No Bid
101-500 $0.279 $0.126 $0.4305 $0.24 $0.40 No Bid
501-1000 $0.189 $0.1968 $0.3972 $0.24 $0.29 No Bid
1001-5000 $0.179 $0.1632 $0.3307 $0.085 $0.26 No Bid
Set up fee $59.00 $0.00 $75.00 per hour  [$60.00 $50.00 No Bid
3-02 M22 Notice of Total Voters 1,000
print on one (1) side, English and
Spanish
0-100 No Bid $0.0672 $0.2551 $0.12 $0.28 $0.104
101-500 $0.113 $0.078 $0.0989 $0.12 $0.11 $0.091
501-1000 $0.076 $0.072 $0.0744 $0.12 $0.09 $0.058
1001-5000 $0.047 $0.054 $0.0488 $0.035 $0.07 $0.051
Set up fee $59.00 $0.00 $37.50 $30.00 $25.00 included in pricing
3-03 M23 Register of Spoiled Ballots 1,000
8-1/2" x 11" 20lb. bond, goldenrod with
black printing on one side, English and
Spanish
0-100 No Bid $0.0588 $0.2551 $0.31 $0.28 $0.0573
101-500 $0.106 $0.0696 $0.0989 $0.16 $0.11 $0.049
501-1000 $0.074 $0.084 $0.0744 $0.115 $0.09 $0.0478
1001-5000 $0.043 $0.0492 $0.0488 $0.03 $0.07 $0.0473
Set up fee $59.00 $0.00 $75.00 per hour  [$30.00 $25.00 included in pricing
3-04 M27 Oaths of Assistants and Interpreters 700
8-1/2" x 14", yellow with black printing on
one side, both English and Spanish
0-100 No Bid $0.078 $0.2553 $0.156 No Bid No Bid
101-500 $0.52 $0.0852 $0.0991 $0.156 No Bid No Bid
501-1000 $0.156 $0.096 $0.0746 $0.149 No Bid No Bid
1001-5000 $0.069 $0.0612 $0.0489 $0.05 No Bid No Bid
Set up fee $59.00 $0.00 $75.00 per hour  [$40.00 No Bid No Bid
3-05 M30 Custodian of Records Envelope 1,000
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10" x 15" yellow envelope catalog style,

black printing on one (1) side

0-100 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.20 $2.28 No Bid

101-500 $0.94 No Bid No Bid $0.73 $2.18 No Bid

501-1000 $0.52 $0.6432 No Bid $0.40 $1.67 No Bid

1001-5000 $0.32 $0.6072 No Bid $0.33 $1.50 No Bid

Set up fee $59.00 $0.00 No Bid $60.00 $50.00 No Bid
3-06 M31 Presiding Judge Envelope 1,000

10" x 15" pink envelope, catalog style

with black printing on one (1) side

0-100 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.20 $2.28 No Bid

101-500 $0.93 No Bid No Bid $0.78 $2.18 No Bid

501-1000 $0.52 $0.6432 No Bid $0.40 $1.67 No Bid

1001-5000 $0.33 $0.6072 No Bid $0.33 $1.50 No Bid

Set up fee $59.00 $0.00 No Bid $60.00 $50.00 No Bid
3-07 M32 Return Sheet 100

8-1/2" x 14", black printing on one (1)

side, 20 Ib. paper

0-100 No Bid $0.0972 $0.2553 $0.44 No Bid $0.101

101-500 No Bid $0.09 $0.0991 $0.34 No Bid $0.072

501-1000 No Bid $0.065 $0.0746 $0.17 No Bid $0.493

1001-5000 No Bid $0.048 $0.0489 $0.05 No Bid $0.473

Set up fee No Bid $0.00 $75.00 per hour  [$30.00 No Bid included in pricing
3-08 M33 Talley List - Blue 1,500

17" x 14" white, center folded to 8-1/2" x

14" size, black printing on two (2) sides

with red notational markings and one (1)

8-1/2" X 3/4" PMS color strip across

bottom front of form.

0-100 No Bid $0.324 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

101-500 $0.50 $0.2856 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

501-1000 $0.49 $0.2508 $1.5786 No Bid No Bid No Bid

1001-5000 $0.24 $0.114 $0.4856 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Set up fee $59.00 $0.00 $75.00 per hour  |No Bid No Bid No Bid
3-09 M34 Talley List - Yellow 1,500

17" x 14" yellow, center folded to 8-1/2"

x 14" size, black printing on two(2) sides

with red notational markings and one (1)

8-1/2" X 3/4" PMS color strip across

bottom front of form.

0-100 No Bid $0.324 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid c
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101-500 $0.58 $0.2856 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
501-1000 $0.49 $0.2508 $1.5836 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1001-5000 $0.23 $0.114 $0.4856 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Set up fee $59.00 $0.00 $75.00 per hour  [No Bid No Bid No Bid
3-10 M35 Talley List - White 1,500
17" x 14" white, center folded to 8-1/2" x
14" size, black printing on two (2) sides
with red notational markings.
0-100 No Bid $0.2412 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
101-500 $0.47 $0.2388 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
501-1000 $0.46 $0.2088 $1.3035 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1001-5000 $0.22 $0.126 $0.4339 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Set up fee $59.00 $0.00 $75.00 per hour  [No Bid No Bid No Bid
Election Ballots, Type |, Section 4:
4-01 Mail Ballots - Optical Scan 8-1/2"x 11  |100,000 Extreme Business
.pdf format, 8-1/2 x 11, consecutively
numbered beginning with number one
(1) and ending with the maximum
number of ballots required for a
particular section; bundled in increments
of 25 or 50, shrink wrapped according to
precinct or ballot style as determined in
order; white 90# index; all black ink.
Forms to be sequentially numbered on
front.
1000 No Bid $0.209 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.2001
5000 No Bid $0.187 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1801
10000 No Bid $0.1595 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1734
50000 No Bid $0.132 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1645
100000 No Bid $0.11 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1645
Set up fee No Bid $10.50 per ballot style. |No Bid No Bid No Bid included in pricing
SET UP COST FOR
50,000 = $8.00/PER
BALLOT, SET UP FOR
100,000 = $6.00/PER
BALLOT
4-02 Provisional Ballots - Optical Scan 15,000
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.pdf format, 8-1/2" x 11"; consecutively
numbered beginning with number one
(1) ending with the maximum number of
ballots required for a particular section;
bundled in increments of 25 or 50,
shrink wrapped according to precinct or
ballot style as determined in order; white
90# index, all black ink. Forms to be
sequentially numbered on front.
1000 No Bid $0.209 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.2001
5000 No Bid $0.187 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1801
10000 No Bid $0.1595 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1734
50000 No Bid $0.132 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1645
100000 No Bid $0.11 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1645
Set up fee No Bid $10.50 per ballot style. [No Bid No Bid No Bid included in pricing
SET UP COST FOR
50,000 = $8.00/PER
BALLOT, SET UP FOR
100,000 = $6.00/PER
BALLOT
4-03 Sample Ballots - Optical Scan 15,000
.pdf format, 8-1/2" x 11", printed on
yellow 20# paper stock; bundled in
increments of 25 or 50, shrink wrapped
according to precinct or ballot style as
determined inpurchase order;
"SAMPLE" water mark (screened or
outlined as necessary) to be printed
diagonally across front and back of each
ballot upon request. Forms to be
sequentialy numbered on back of forms.
1000 No Bid $0.209 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.2001
5000 No Bid $0.198 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1801
10000 No Bid $0.187 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1734
50000 No Bid $0.11 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1645
100000 No Bid $0.1089 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1645
Set up fee No Bid 35.50/per ballot style  |No Bid No Bid No Bid included in pricing
4-04 Mail Ballots - Optical Scan 8-1/2" x 14" (100,000
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.pdf format, 8-1/2 x 14, numbered
consecutively beginning with number
one (1) and ending with the maximum
number of ballots required for a
particular section; bundled in increments
of 25 or 50, shrink wrapped according to
precinct or ballot style as determined in
purchase order; white 90# index, all
black ink. Forms to be sequentially
numbered on front.
1000 No Bid $0.66 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.2001
5000 No Bid $0.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1801
10000 No Bid $0.187 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1734
50000 No Bid $0.154 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1645
100000 No Bid $0.132 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1645
Set up fee No Bid $10.50 per ballot style. |No Bid No Bid No Bid included in pricing
SET UP COST FOR
50,000 = $8.00/PER
BALLOT, SET UP FOR
100,000 = $6.00/PER
BALLOT
Provisional Ballots - Optical Scan 8-1/2"
4-05 x 14" 15,000
.pdf format, 8-1/2" x 14"; consecutively
numbered beginning with number one
(1) ending with the maximum number of
ballots required for a particular section;
bundled in increments of 25 or 50,
shrink wrapped according to precinct or
ballot style as determined in order; white
90# index, all black ink. Forms to be
sequentially numbered on front.
1000 No Bid $0.66 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.2001
5000 No Bid $0.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1801
10000 No Bid $0.187 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1734
50000 No Bid $0.154 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1645
100000 No Bid $0.132 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1645
Set up fee No Bid $10.50 per ballot style. [No Bid No Bid No Bid included in pricing

SET UP COST FOR
50,000 = $8.00/PER
BALLOT, SET UP FOR
100,000 = $6.00/PER
BALLOT
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Sample Ballots - Optical Scan 8-1/2" x
4-06 14" 50,000
.pdf format, 8-1/2" x 14", printed on
yellow 20# paper stock; bundled in
increments of 25 or 50, shrink wrapped
according to precinct or ballot style as
determined inpurchase order;
"SAMPLE" water mark (screened or
outlined as necessary) to be printed
diagonally across front and back of each
ballot upon request. Forms to be
sequentialy numbered on back of forms.
1000 No Bid $0.231 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.2001
5000 No Bid $0.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1801
10000 No Bid $0.209 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1734
50000 No Bid $0.132 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1645
100000 No Bid $0.11 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1645
Set up fee No Bid $35.50/per ballot style |No Bid No Bid No Bid included in pricing
4-07 Mail Ballots - Optical Scan 8-1/2" x 18" |100,000
.pdf format, 8-1/2 x 18, numbered
consecutively beginning with number
one (1) and ending with the maximum
number of ballots required for a
particular section; bundled in increments
of 25 or 50, shrink wrapped according to
precinct or ballot style as determined in
purchase order; white 90# index, all
black ink. Forms to be sequentially
numbered on front.
1000 No Bid $0.825 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.2001
5000 No Bid $0.319 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1801
10000 No Bid $0.242 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1734
50000 No Bid $0.187 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1645
100000 No Bid $0.176 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1645
Set up fee No Bid $10.50 per ballot style. [No Bid No Bid No Bid included in pricing
SET UP COST FOR
50,000 = $8.00/PER
BALLOT, SET UP FOR
100,000 = $6.00/PER
BALLOT
Provisional Ballots - Optical Scan 8-1/2"
4-08 x 18" 15,000
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.pdf format, 8-1/2" x 18"; consecutively
numbered beginning with number one
(1) ending with the maximum number of
ballots required for a particular section;
bundled in increments of 25 or 50,
shrink wrapped according to precinct or
ballot style as determined in order; white
90# index, all black ink. Forms to be
sequentially numbered on front.
1000 No Bid $0.825 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.2001
5000 No Bid $0.319 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1801
10000 No Bid $0.242 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1734
50000 No Bid $0.187 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1645
100000 No Bid $0.176 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1645
Set up fee No Bid $10.50 per ballot style. [No Bid No Bid No Bid included in pricing
SET UP COST FOR
50,000 = $8.00/PER
BALLOT, SET UP FOR
100,000 = $6.00/PER
BALLOT
Sample Ballots - Optical Scan 8 1/2" x
4-09 18" 50,000
.pdf format, 8-1/2" x 18", printed on
yellow 20# paper stock; bundled in
increments of 25 or 50, shrink wrapped
according to precinct or ballot style as
determined inpurchase order;
"SAMPLE" water mark (screened or
outlined as necessary) to be printed
diagonally across front and back of each
ballot upon request. Forms to be
sequentialy numbered on back of forms.
1000 No Bid $0.275 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.2001
5000 No Bid $0.264 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1801
10000 No Bid $0.253 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1734
50000 No Bid $0.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1645
100000 No Bid $0.198 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1645
Set up fee No Bid $35.50/per ballot style |No Bid No Bid No Bid included in pricing
Miscellaneous ltems, Section 5:
5-01 M44 Poll List 20,000

8-1/2" x 14", three (3) part carbonless
form plus standard stub; yellow, pink
and blue with snap out top.
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1000 $0.24 $0.234 No Bid $0.27 $0.35 No Bid
5000 $0.11 $0.0984 No Bid $0.11 $0.15 No Bid
10000 $0.088 $0.0936 No Bid $0.083 $0.12 No Bid
20000 $0.085 $0.0888 No Bid $0.063 $0.11 No Bid
50000 $0.083 $0.084 No Bid $0.057 $0.10 No Bid
100000 $0.08 $0.0828 No Bid $0.05 $0.09 No Bid
Set up fee $59.00 $0.00 No Bid $60.00 $50.00 No Bid
5-02 M47 Confirmation Card 75,000
on two (2) sides in both English and
Spanish with intelligent barcode and
1000 $0.41 $0.3252 $0.5805 $0.86 $0.49 No Bid
5000 $0.149 $0.1236 $0.4429 $0.21 $0.18 No Bid
10000 $0.098 $0.092 $0.4117 $0.13 $0.13 No Bid
20000 $0.80 $0.0804 $0.3798 $0.079 $0.09 No Bid
50000 $0.75 $0.0732 $0.3279 $0.05 $0.08 No Bid
100000 $0.74 $0.072 $0.2487 $0.047 $0.07 No Bid
Set up fee $59.00 $0.00 $75.00 $60.00 $125.00 No Bid
Texas Voter Registration Application, 25,000 up to
5-03 M49 (ENGLISH AND SPANISH) 200,000
white with black printing on both sides,
with intelligent barcode and postal
permit. One to be printed in ENGLISH
1000 $0.25 $0.2472 $0.3183 $0.86 $1.50 No Bid
5000 $0.085 $0.0854 $0.1561 $0.21 $0.0856 No Bid
10000 $0.06 $0.0648 $0.1304 $0.13 $0.0428 No Bid
20000 $0.054 $0.054 $0.119 $0.079 $0.0405 No Bid
50000 $0.042 $0.048 $0.1116 $0.05 $0.0399 No Bid
100000 $0.036 $0.0456 $0.1095 $0.047 $0.0388 No Bid
Set up fee $59.00 $0.00 $75.00 per hour  [$60.00 $125.00 No Bid
Deputy Voter Registration Cards (I IN
5-04 M50 ENGLISH AND 1 IN SPANISH) 75,000
one (1) side. One to be printed IN
ENGLISH and One to be printed in
SPANISH. Two (2) perforation's at on
end of card.
1000 $0.134 $0.186 $0.3183 $0.18 $0.169 No Bid
5000 $0.079 $0.0924 $0.1561 $0.09 $0.10 No Bid
10000 $0.055 $0.0768 $0.1304 $0.06 $0.051 No Bid
20000 $0.043 $0.0552 $0.119 $0.05 $0.034 No Bid
50000 $0.033 $0.0456 $0.1116 $0.035 $0.032 No Bid
100000 $0.032 $0.0432 $0.1095 $0.03 $0.027 No Bid
Set up fee $59.00 $0.00 $75.00 per hour  [$35.00 $125.00 No Bid
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Data Flex

Form Estimated Annual |Business Extreme Business AlphaGraphics Accurate Forms [Color Document

Bid Item |Number |Description Usage Products LLC |Services, Inc. #391 Jayden Graphics |& Supplies Solutions
5-05 M51 Ballot and Seal Certificate

8-1/2" x 8-1/2" plus stub, 2 carbonless,

blue and pink; top snaps out with black

print and one side. Form is prescribed

by Secretary of State, Section 62.010

and 61.008, V.T.C.A., Election code 1,000

1000 $0.215 $0.1824 No Bid $0.25 No Bid No Bid

5000 $0.065 $0.0648 No Bid $0.066 No Bid No Bid

10000 $0.049 $0.0492 No Bid $0.05 No Bid No Bid

20000 $0.041 $0.0408 No Bid $0.04 No Bid No Bid

50000 $0.036 $0.0384 No Bid $0.027 No Bid No Bid

100000 $0.0349 $0.0372 No Bid $0.026 No Bid No Bid

Set up fee $59.00 $0.00 No Bid $50.00 No Bid No Bid
5-06 M52 Distance Marker 100

8 1/2" X 11" 100 Ib. laminated card

stock, white with black printing on one

(1) side in both English and Spanish.

Form is prescribed by Secretary of

State, Section 62.010 and 61.008,

V.T.C.A,, Election code

1000 $0.61 No Bid $1.7856 No Bid No Bid $0.052

5000 $0.59 No Bid $1.60 No Bid No Bid $0.054

10000 $0.55 No Bid $1.43 No Bid No Bid $0.057

20000 $0.52 No Bid $1.4122 No Bid No Bid $0.059

50000 $0.50 No Bid $1.401 No Bid No Bid $0.574

100000 $0.45 No Bid $1.3506 No Bid No Bid $0.535

Set up fee $59.00 No Bid $75.00 per hour  [No Bid No Bid included in price
5-07 M53 Voter Information 2,000

8 1/2" X 14" blue paper with black

printing, English on one side, Spanish

on one side.

1000 $0.145 $0.0948 $0.2001 $0.19 No Bid $0.06

5000 $0.055 $0.0528 $0.1201 $0.09 No Bid $0.058

10000 $0.04 $0.0456 $0.11 $0.057 No Bid $0.056

20000 $0.034 $0.0372 $0.1055 $0.039 No Bid $0.054

50000 $0.028 $0.0312 $0.1029 $0.024 No Bid $0.053

100000 $0.025 $0.0276 $0.1021 $0.019 No Bid $0.053

Set up fee $59.00 $0.00 $75.00 per hour  [$35.00 No Bid included in price
5-08 M54 Identification Requirements Notification |2,000

8 1/2" X 11" blue paper with black

printing, English on one side, Spanish

on one side.

1000 $0.108 $0.1116 $0.1795 $0.147 No Bid $0.06 12




Data Flex

Form Estimated Annual |Business Extreme Business AlphaGraphics Accurate Forms [Color Document
Bid ltem [Number [Description Usage Products LLC [Services, Inc. #391 Jayden Graphics |& Supplies Solutions
5000 $0.056 $0.06 $0.1021 $0.0646 No Bid $0.056
10000 $0.039 $0.042 $0.0914 $0.038 No Bid $0.055
20000 $0.025 $0.0324 $0.0875 $0.0253 No Bid $0.054
50000 $0.022 $0.0264 $0.0849 $0.0175 No Bid $0.051
100000 $0.019 $0.0228 $0.084 $0.0135 No Bid $0.051
Set up fee $59.00 $0.00 $75.00 per hour [$35.00 No Bid included in price
5-09 M55 Election Office Telephone Information 1,000
8 1/2" X 11" blue paper with black
printing on two (2) sides, one (1) side in
English and one (1) side in Spanish with
lamination on both sides.
1000 $0.174 $0.116 $0.1795 No Bid No Bid No Bid
5000 $0.072 $0.06 $0.1021 No Bid No Bid No Bid
10000 $0.033 $0.042 $0.0914 No Bid No Bid No Bid
20000 $0.026 $0.0324 $0.0875 No Bid No Bid No Bid
50000 $0.02 $0.0264 $0.0849 No Bid No Bid No Bid
100000 $0.018 $0.0228 $0.084 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Set up fee $59.00 $0.00 $75.00 per hour  [No Bid No Bid No Bid
Deputy Voter Registrar Identification
5-10 M56 Card 400
Business card sized, white, black
printing on one side
1000 $0.09 $0.0648 $0.0947 No Bid No Bid No Bid
5000 $0.04 $0.024 $0.0287 No Bid No Bid No Bid
10000 $0.017 $0.0216 $0.0213 No Bid No Bid No Bid
20000 $0.014 $0.018 $0.0174 No Bid No Bid No Bid
50000 $0.011 $0.0144 $0.0149 No Bid No Bid No Bid
100000 $0.009 $0.0108 $0.0139 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Set up fee $59.00 $0.00 $18.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid
5-11 M58 Combination Form for EV/ED 50,000
8 1/2" X 14", white paper, black printing
on both sides.
1000 $0.061 $0.0816 $0.1482 $0.375 $0.074 No Bid
5000 $0.049 $0.0408 $0.0747 $0.092 $0.03 No Bid
10000 $0.0349 $0.0336 $0.064 $0.054 $0.025 No Bid
20000 $0.021 $0.0252 $0.0601 $0.033 $0.023 No Bid
50000 $0.019 $0.0216 $0.0576 $0.02 $0.02 No Bid
100000 $0.0177 $0.0168 $0.0567 $0.016 $0.019 No Bid
Set up fee $59.00 $0.00 $75.00 per hour  [$70.00 $25.00 No Bid
5-12 M59 Combination Form for EV/ED 15,000
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Data Flex

Form Estimated Annual |Business Extreme Business AlphaGraphics Accurate Forms [Color Document

Bid Item |Number |Description Usage Products LLC |Services, Inc. #391 Jayden Graphics |& Supplies Solutions

8 1/2" X 14", white paper, black printing

on both sides with statement, "l am a

Republican and understand that | am

ineligible to vote or participate in another

political party's primary election or

convention during this voting year."

1000 $0.062 $0.1032 $0.1482 $0.36 $0.074 $0.0462

5000 $0.051 $0.0516 $0.0747 $0.094 $0.03 $0.0462

10000 $0.04 $0.0432 $0.064 $0.041 $0.025 $0.0443

20000 $0.027 $0.0276 $0.0601 $0.034 $0.023 $0.0443

50000 $0.025 $0.0228 $0.0576 $0.02 $0.02 $0.0435

100000 $0.022 $0.0216 $0.0567 $0.016 $0.019 $0.0435

Set up fee $59.00 $0.00 $75.00 per hour  [$70.00 $25.00 included in pricing
5-13 M60 Combination Form, EV/IED 7,000

8 1/2" X 14", blue paper, black printing

on both sides with statement, "l am a

Democrat and understand that | am

ineligible to vote or participate in another

political party's primary election or

convention during this voting year."

1000 $0.139 $0.1248 $0.1482 $0.368 $0.167 $0.0584

5000 $0.064 $0.0648 $0.0747 $0.073 $0.068 $0.0584

10000 $0.054 $0.0552 $0.064 $0.064 $0.05 $0.0559

20000 $0.0346 $0.0408 $0.0601 $0.037 $0.042 $0.0559

50000 $0.0299 $0.0312 $0.0576 $0.228 $0.035 $0.0535

100000 $0.025 $0.0276 $0.0567 $0.019 $0.03 $0.0535

Set up fee $59.00 $0.00 $75.00 per hour $25.00 included in pricing
5-14 M62 Notice of Prohibition of Certain Devices |1000

8 1/2" X 11", blue paper, black printing

on one (1) side in English and Spanish.

1000 $0.12 $120 [$0.0816 $81.60 $0.097 $0.149 $149 No Bid $0.049 $49.00

5000 $0.05 $0.048 $0.0519 $0.042 No Bid $0.049

10000 $0.037 $0.036 $0.045 $0.029 No Bid $0.047

20000 $0.025 $0.0288 $0.0426 $0.02 No Bid $0.047

50000 $0.022 $0.024 $0.041 $0.015 No Bid $0.046

100000 $0.019 $0.0216 $0.0404 $0.012 No Bid $0.046

Set up fee $59.00 $0.00 $18.75 $35.00 No Bid included in pricing
5-15 M64 List of First Time Voters 1,000

8 1/2" X 11", 20 Ib., white paper, printed

in English on one side.

1000 $0.099 $0.0708 $0.089 $0.146 No Bid $0.04 14




Data Flex

Form Estimated Annual |Business Extreme Business AlphaGraphics Accurate Forms [Color Document
Bid Item |Number |Description Usage Products LLC |Services, Inc. #391 Jayden Graphics |& Supplies Solutions
5000 $0.038 $0.036 $0.0446 $0.04 No Bid $0.04
10000 $0.028 $0.0276 $0.0378 $0.027 No Bid $0.035
20000 $0.016 $0.0204 $0.0354 $0.029 No Bid $0.035
50000 $0.015 $0.0156 $0.0338 $0.016 No Bid $0.037
100000 $0.0135 $0.0144 $0.0332 $0.015 No Bid $0.037
Set up fee $59.00 $0.00 $37.50 $35.00 No Bid included in pricing
Voter Registration Certificate Mass Mail Out, Section 6: 450,000
Mass Mailout, Voter Registration
6-01 Certificate
Blank stock, 4-1/2" x 6" tractor feed,
black print two (2) sides, color insert,
perforated design of certificate is
prescribed by Secretary of State
One (1) each $0.0286 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.0199 No Bid
Postage, Voter Registration Certificates
6-02 Mass Mail out
One (1) each $0.0244 No Bid No Bid No Bid $130,500.00 No Bid
Estimated Estimate only.
postage Have to see data
amount-no to verify &
data to verify calculate
discounts postage
available. discounts
Ballot Box, Section 7:
7-01 Label, Early Voting Ballot Seal 400
with black print on one (1) side, peel off
back with permanent adhesive.
One (1) each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Set Up Fee
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