
2015-144 Percent Discount Evaluation

Midway Bob Tomes Wurth MHC Oreilly
2015-144--02-01 Passenger Car & Light Duty Truck Parts F-150 Shocks(rear) No Price Sheet No Price Sheet Not Found No Bid $33.62

F-150 Brake Pads(front) No Price Sheet No Price Sheet Not Found No Bid $27.13
F-150 Rotors(front) No Price Sheet No Price Sheet Not Found No Bid $42.24

Taurus Shocks(rear) No Price Sheet No Price Sheet Not Found No Bid $70.20
Tarus Brake Pads(front) No Price Sheet No Price Sheet Not Found No Bid $33.62
Tarus Rotors(front) No Price Sheet No Price Sheet Not Found No Bid $58.99

2015-144--02-02 Medium & Heavy Duty Truck Parts F-350 Shocks(rear) No Price Sheet No Price Sheet Not Found No Bid $15.33
F-350 Brake Pads(front) No Price Sheet No Price Sheet Not Found No Bid $34.21
F-350 Rotors(front) No Price Sheet No Price Sheet Not Found No Bid $48.96

2015-144--02-03 Fluids & Chemicals PB Blaster Not Found No Price Sheet Not Found No Bid $3.29
Seafoam Not Found No Price Sheet Not Found No Bid $4.71

2015-144--02-04 Filters Wix 57502 $9.11 No Price Sheet No Bid No X-REF $4.42
Wix46935 $17.10 No Price Sheet No Bid No X-REF $8.25

2015-144--02-05 Belts & Hoses CV Belt $52.24 No Price Sheet Not Found No Bid $21.23
F-150 Belt $52.66 No Price Sheet Not Found No Bid $23.00

2015-144--02-06 Wipers & Blades Taurus $25.94 & $25.94 No Bid Not Found No Bid $9.43 & $ 11.79
Explorer $17.84 & $17.84 No Bid Not Found No Bid $11.79 & 12.97

2015-144--02-07 Batteries U1LH $71.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid $24.77
34/78PRM $217.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $70.79

2015-144--02-08 Tire Supplies Wheel Weights .25 Not Found No Bid $7.24 No Bid $5.77
Wheel Weights 1.00 Not Found No Bid $12.04 No Bid $14.08
Wheel Weights 2.50 Not Found No Bid $30.80 No Bid $32.27

2015-144--02-09 Starters And Alternators CV Starter $89.85 No Price Sheet No Bid Not Found $83.18
CV Alternator $314.98 No Price Sheet No Bid Not Found $165.19
F-150 Starter $118.95 No Price Sheet No Bid Not Found $100.29
F-150 Alternator $344.98 No Price Sheet No Bid Not Found $131.56

2015-144--02-10 AC Compressors & clutches CV Compressor $328..04 No Price Sheet No Bid Not Found $241.56
F-150 Compressor $446.71 No Price Sheet No Bid Not Found $222.42


