Fleet Parts List

IFB 2015-144 SUPPLIES: FLEET REPAIR PARTS

BID TABULATION

Midway Tomes Wurth MHC O'Reilly

Iltem# |ltem
2015-144-- |IPASSENGER CAR & LIGHT DUTY | Annual
01-01 TRUCK Use |Price Each| Total |Price Each| Total |Price Each Total Price Each| Total [Price Each| Total
2015-144--

01-02 Bulb Wagner-Part #1157 30 0.26 7.80 No Bid 0.37 11.10 0.23 6.90 0.18 5.28
2015-144--

01-03 Bulb Wagner-Part #3157 43 0.67 28.81 No Bid 1.28 55.04 0.65 27.95 0.48 20.51
2015-144--

01-04 Bulb Wagner-Part #97 2 0.37 0.74 No Bid 0.56 1.12 0.35 0.70 0.29 0.58
2015-144--

01-05 Headlamp Wagner-Part #9007 13 4.92 63.96 No Bid 6.12 79.56 3.68 47.84 4.48 58.24
2015-144--

01-06 Headlamp Wagner-Part #194 36 0.25 9.00 No Bid 0.30 10.80 0.23 8.28 0.22 8.03
2015-144-- Brake Rotor Perform. Friction-Part

01-09 #305.045.01 4 138.02 | 552.08 | No Bid No Bid 138.12 | 552.48 151.78 607.12
2015-144-- Disc Pad Set Perform. Friction-Part

01-10 #0931.20 7 61.10 427.70 | No Bid No Bid 52.48 367.36 65.22 456.54
2015-144-- Disc Pad Set Perform. Friction-Part

01-11 #0932.20 13 52.40 681.20 | No Bid No Bid 43.92 570.96 46.90 609.70

SECTION TOTAL 1,771.29 1,582.47 1,766.00

2015-144--1| MEDIUM & HEAVY DUTY TRUCK

01-14 OFF ROAD/OVER THE ROAD Price Each| Total |Price Each| Total |Price Each Total Price Each| Total [Price Each| Total
2015-144-- | Brake Governor Reman D-2 Bendix-Part

01-15 #275491X 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.69 68.45 14.09 70.45
2015-144-- Brake Shoe and Hardware Kit-Part

01-16 #CNB4515EQ21 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 30.88 772.00 64.80 1,620.00
2015-144--

01-17 Seal National-Part #380003A 13 43.68 567.84 | No Bid No Bid 35.93 467.09 34.16 444,08

SECTION TOTAL 1,307.54 2,134.53




IFB 2015-144 SUPPLIES: FLEET REPAIR PARTS

BID TABULATION

Midway Tomes Wurth MHC O'Reilly

2015-144-- Annual

01-18 FLUIDS & CHEMICALS Use |Price Each| Total |Price Each| Total |Price Each| Total Price Each| Total [Price Each| Total
2015-144--

01-19 Glass Cleaner Gunk-Part #GC1 131 1.97 258.07 | No Bid 3.87 506.97 No Bid 3.29 430.99
2015-144--

01-20 Protectant Armorall-Part #11080 65 3.96 257.40 | No Bid 8.29 538.85 No Bid 4.99 324.35
2015-144--

01-21 Degreaser/Tar Remover Charge Aerosol | 37 9.31 344.47 | NoBid 14.12 522.44 No Bid 5.89 217.93
2015-144--

01-22 Hand Cleaner Fast Orange-Part #25108 26 1.89 49.14 No Bid 7.99 207.74 1.55 40.30 2.51 65.26
2015-144--

01-23 Air Tool Oil Marvel-Part #080 3 1.86 5.58 No Bid 6.20 18.60 No Bid 3.99 11.97
2015-144--1 Windshield Washer Solvent Johnson-

01-24 Part #2940 225 2.04 459.00 | No Bid 17.81 4,007.25 1.60 360.00 2.59 582.75
2015-144--1 Paint Primer Indoor-Outdoor Krylon-

01-25 Part #1368 8 3.87 30.96 | NoBid 7.00 56.00 No Bid No Bid
2015-144-- | Paint White Indoor-Outdoor Krylon-Part

01-26 #1501 3 3.87 11.61 | NoBid 7.19 21.57 No Bid 5.99 17.97
2015-144-- | Paint Black Indoor-Outdoor Plasti-Kote-

01-27 Part #TI 15 3.87 58.05 | No Bid 7.19 107.85 No Bid No Bid
2015-144--

01-28 De-Icer Tec-Part #3282 88 1.34 117.92 | NoBid No Bid No Bid 2.78 244.64
2015-144--| Carb Spray Cleaner Berryman B12-Part

01-29 #0117 51 2.34 119.34 | No Bid 3.67 187.17 No Bid 4.99 254.49
2015-144--

01-30 Brake Cleaner Berryman-Part #1420 159 3.03 481.77 | No Bid 2.95 469.05 No Bid 5.49 872.91
2015-144--

01-31 Brake Fluid Pint Tec Part #2012 Dot 3 20 1.26 25.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.79 35.80
2015-144-- Power Steering Fluid Johnsen-Part

01-32 #4610 19 2.09 39.71 | NoBid No Bid No Bid 3.39 64.41
2015-144--1 Thread Locker Medium Strength-Part

01-33 #24240 3 17.21 51.63 | No Bid 25.80 77.40 22.29 66.87 20.69 62.07

SECTION TOTAL 2,309.85




IFB 2015-144 SUPPLIES: FLEET REPAIR PARTS

BID TABULATION

Midway Tomes Wurth MHC O'Reilly

2015-144-- Annual

01-34 Filters Use |Price Each| Total |Price Each| Total |Price Each Total Price Each| Total [Price Each| Total
2015-144--

01-36 Oil Filter Hastings-Part #LF284 6 15.10 90.60 No Bid No Bid 12.42 74.52 19.19 115.14
2015-144--

01-37 Oil Filter Hastings-LF110F 95 2.49 236.55 | No Bid No Bid 2.97 282.15 3.73 354.35
2015-144--

01-38 Oil Filter Hastings-Part #LF531 5 6.01 30.05 No Bid No Bid 5.18 25.90 7.58 37.90
2015-144--

01-40 Oil Filter Hastings-Part #LF395 1 3.75 3.75 No Bid No Bid 3.73 3.73 4.66 4.66
2015-144--

01-41 Oil Filter Hastings-Part #LF402F 3 2.49 1.47 No Bid No Bid 3.42 10.26 4.15 12.45
2015-144--

01-42 Qil Filter Hastings-Part #LF410F 8 2.49 19.92 No Bid No Bid 3.35 26.80 3.73 29.84
2015-144--

01-43 Oil Filter Hastings-Part #LF134F 3 2.49 7.47 No Bid No Bid 3.33 9.99 3.45 10.35
2015-144--

01-44 Oil Filter Hastings-Part #LF448 2 22.17 44.34 No Bid No Bid 17.95 35.90 28.45 56.90
2015-144--

01-47 Oil Filter Hastings-Part #LF157F 76 2.49 189.24 | No Bid No Bid 3.37 256.12 3.45 262.20
2015-144--

01-48 Oil Filter Hastings-Part LF299F 20 5.49 109.80 | No Bid No Bid 7.40 148.00 11.39 227.80
2015-144--

01-49 Oil Filter Hastings-Part #LF558F 41 9.79 401.39 | No Bid No Bid 9.27 380.07 14.92 611.72
2015-144--

01-50 Fuel Filter Hastings-Part #PTH-GF326 44 3.48 153.12 | NoBid No Bid 6.06 266.64 6.27 275.88
2015-144--

01-51 Fuel Filter Hastings-Part #FF1076 3 7.55 22.65 No Bid No Bid 5.88 17.64 8.93 26.79
2015-144--

01-52 Fuel Filter Hastings-Part #FF1145F 11 14.69 161.59 | No Bid No Bid 31.39 345.29 43.30 476.30
2015-144--

01-55 Fuel Filter Hastings-Part #PTH-GF354 4 4.49 17.96 No Bid No Bid 5.53 22.12 7.97 31.88
2015-144--

01-57 Fuel Filter Hastings-Part #FF1114 17 16.33 277.61 | No Bid No Bid 14.76 250.92 21.23 360.91
2015-144--

01-59 Fuel Filter Hastings-Part #FF1166 26 28.42 738.92 | No Bid No Bid 31.02 806.52 33.37 867.62
2015-144--

01-61 Air Filter Hastings-Part #AF2205 7 22.58 158.06 | No Bid No Bid 17.62 123.34 27.54 192.78




IFB 2015-144 SUPPLIES: FLEET REPAIR PARTS
BID TABULATION

Midway Tomes Wurth MHC O'Reilly
2015-144--
01-62 Air Filter Hastings-Part #AF2204 7 30.94 216.58 | No Bid No Bid 23.50 164.50 38.03 266.21
2015-144--
01-63 Air Filter Hastings-Part#AF594 3 36.86 110.58 | No Bid No Bid 28.42 85.26 45.29 135.87
2015-144--
01-64 Air Filter Hastings-Part #AF608 2 26.95 53.90 No Bid No Bid 22.95 45.90 33.34 66.68
2015-144--
01-66 Air Filter Hastings-Part #AF484F 11 6.98 76.78 No Bid No Bid 941 103.51 11.25 123.75
2015-144--
01-67 Air Filter Hastings-Part #AF1130F 14 8.43 118.02 | No Bid No Bid 15.79 221.06 19.03 266.42
2015-144--
01-68 Air Filter Hastings-Part #AF878FF 51 2.94 149.94 | No Bid No Bid 5.25 267.75 4.96 252.96
2015-144--
01-70 Air Filter Wix-Part #42420 9 4.76 42.84 No Bid No Bid 8.69 78.21 5.59 50.31
2015-144--
01-71 Air Filter Cabin Wix-Part #24068 13 4.40 57.20 | No Bid No Bid 9.36 121.68 5.74 74.62
2015-144--
01-72 Filter Trans Hastings-Part #PTH-TF128 24 8.10 194.40 | No Bid No Bid 17.32 415.68 11.64 279.36
SECTION TOTAL 3,690.73 4,589.46 5,471.65




IFB 2015-144 SUPPLIES: FLEET REPAIR PARTS

BID TABULATION

Midway Tomes Wurth MHC O'Reilly
2015-144-- Annual
01-79 WIPERS & BLADES Use |Price Each| Total [Price Each| Total |Price Each Total Price Each| Total [Price Each| Total
2015-144--
01-80 Wiper Blade Trico-Part #31-160 8 4.04 32.32 No Bid 4.75 38.00 No Bid 3.49 27.92
2015-144--
01-81 Wiper Blade Trico-Part #31-180 4 4.04 16.16 | No Bid 4.45 17.80 No Bid 3.49 13.96
2015-144--
01-82 Wiper Blade Trico-Part #31-220 136 4.04 549.44 | No Bid 5.75 782.00 No Bid 3.49 474.64
2015-144--
01-83 Wiper Blade Trico-Part #20-1 42 4.04 169.68 [ No Bid 4.70 197.40 No Bid 5.31 223.02
SECTION TOTAL 767.60 1,035.20 739.54
2015-144-- Annual
01-84 BATTERIES Use |Price Each| Total |Price Each| Total |Price Each| Total Price Each| Total [Price Each| Total
2015-144--
01-85 Battery BCI Group 65 Top Post 12 Volt | 67 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 89.28 5,981.76
2015-144--
01-86 |[Battery BCI Group 31 Stud Post 12 Volt| 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 92.15 4,607.50
2015-144--1 Battery BCI Group 4DLT Top Stud
01-88 Battery 12 Volt 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 126.19 252.38
2015-144--
01-89 State Recycling Fee Per Battery No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.00 0.00
SECTION TOTAL 252.38
2015-144-- Annual
01-90 TIRE SUPPLIES Use |Price Each| Total [Price Each| Total |Price Each Total Price Each| Total [Price Each| Total
2015-144--
01-91 Tire Air Gauge Mil Part #925 3 4.25 12.75 | NoBid 3.19 9.57 No Bid 7.49 22.47
SECTION TOTAL 12.75 9.57 22.47




BID TABULATION

IFB 2015-144 SUPPLIES: FLEET REPAIR PARTS

Midway Tomes Wurth MHC O'Reilly
Percent Percent Percent Percent Percent

Item # Item Discount/Pricing Discount/Pricing Discount/Pricing Discount/Pricing Discount/Pricing
2015-144--

02-01 [Passenger Car & Light Duty Truck Parts 30%-List Cost + 2% 50%-Government No Bid 41%-L.ist-Online
2015-144--

02-02 |Medium & Heavy Duty Truck Parts 10%-L.ist Cost + 2% 50%-Government No Bid 41%-L.ist-Online
2015-144--
02-03 Fluids & Chemicals 15%-List Cost + 2% 60%-Government No Bid 41%-L.ist-Online
2015-144--
02-04 Filters 38%-Jobber Cost + 2% No Bid 62%-L.ist 41%-L.ist-Online
2015-144--
02-05 Belts & Hoses 30%-L.ist Cost + 2% 40%-Government No Bid 41%-L.ist-Online
2015-144--
02-06 Wipers & Blades 20%-L.ist No Bid 50%-Governm No Bid 41%-List-Online
2015-144--
02-07 Batteries 20%-L.ist No Bid No Bid No Bid 41%-L.ist-Online
2015-144--
02-08 Tire Supplies 25%-L.ist No Bid 60%-Government No Bid 41%-List-Online
2015-144--
02-09 Rebuilt Starters & Alternators 25%-L.ist Cost + 2% No Bid 16%-L.ist 41%-L.ist-Online
2015-144-- |Air Conditioner Compressors &
02-10 Clutches 35%-List Cost + 2% No Bid 16%-L.ist 41%-L.ist-Online
2015-144-- |Ford Light Duty Truck & Passenger Car
02-11 OEM Parts No Bid Cost + 2% No Bid No Bid No Bid
2015-144-- TFord Medium & Heavy Duty Truck
02-15 OEM Parts No Bid Cost + 2% No Bid No Bid No Bid
2015-144-- |Kenworth Medium & Heavy Duty OEM
02-17 Parts No Bid No Bid No Bid 22%-List No Bid

Immediate Delivery




IFB 2015-144 SUPPLIES: FLEET REPAIR PARTS

BID TABULATION

Midway Tomes Wurth MHC O'Reilly
2015-T4Z--TWiIT Commit to Two Hour Delvery for
03-01 In-stock Items? No Yes NA Yes
2015-144--
03-02 Charge (If Any) For Two Hour Delivery $0 $0 NA $0

2015-144-01-07
2015-144-01-08
2015-144-01-12
2015-144-01-13
2015-144-01-35
2015-144-01-39
2015-144-01-45
2015-144-01-46
2015-144-01-53

Line items not awarded:

2015-144-01-54
2015-144-01-56
2015-144-01-58
2015-144-01-60
2015-144-01-65
2015-144-01-69
2015-144-01-73
2015-144-01-75
2015-144-01-76

2015-144-01-77
2015-144-01-78
2015-144-01-87
2015-144-01-92
2015-144-01-93
2015-144-01-94
2015-144-01-95
2015-144-01-96
2015-144-01-97

2015-144-02-12
2015-144-02-13
2015-144-02-14
2015-144-02-16
2015-144-02-18




