IFB 2015-268
SERVICES: MOWING AND STRING/TREE TRIMMING

Cullen Moir Gant
Environmental | Watershed [ Weisz Selection EcoCutter Contractors
Line Items Measurement

#1 --Forty-seven (47) soll

convervation structures Per acre No Bid $57.00 No Bid $23.00 $100.00
#2 -- Collin County Justice Center Per acre No Bid No Bid $39.00 $25.00 $75.00
#3 -- Sister Grove Park Per acre No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.00 $75.00
#4 -- Parkhill Prairie Per acre No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.00 $80.00
#5 -- Miscellaneous Lots and/or

Acreage Per square yard No Bid No Bid $0.035 $0.010 $20.00
#6 -- Verona Radio Tower Per acre No Bid No Bid $35.00 $23.00 $80.00
#7 -- Celina Radio Tower Per acre No Bid No Bid $30.00 $23.00 $80.00
#8 -- Tree Trimming Per cubic yard No Bid No Bid $55.00 $45.00 $80.00
#9 -- Miscellaneous Mowing of

County Maintained Roads Per lane mile No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.95 $500.00




