BID TABULATION
IFB NO. 2016-021 Services and Materials, Erosion Control and Hydro-Mulch

Southwest Erosion

Southwest Erosion

Tommy Rose dba Rose

Tommy Rose dba Rose

Buddy Martin Erosion

Buddy Martin Erosion

Control, Inc. Control, Inc. (Attributes) Contracting Contracting (Attributes) Control, LP Control, LP (Attributes)
Line# [Description QTY |UuOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Erosion Control Services - Silt fence, wire support
1 with metal “T” post every six (6) feet. Price per LF
installed. 5000 |linear foot $1.50 $7,500.00 $2.00 $10,000.00 $2.00 $10,000.00
Attribute 1: Material cost for item one, not
installed 250 linear foot $1.10 $3,025.00 $360.00 $1.00 $250.00
Erosion Control Services - Silt fence, wire support
2 with metal “T” post every six (6) feet. Price per LF
if installed by hand 5000 |linear foot $2.50 [$12,500.00 $2.00 $10,000.00 $2.00 $10,000.00
Attribute 1: Material cost for item one, not
installed 250 [linear foot $1.10 $3,025.00 $360.00 $1.00 $250.00
Erosion Control Services - Labor for repairs to
3 existing erosion control. Price per person, per
hour. 500 [hour $30.00 |$15,000.00 $12.00 $6,000.00 $25.00 $12,500.00
Attribute 1: Minimum labor charges (if any) per
person/per hour 500 |hour $30.00 $15,000.00 $0.00 No Response
Erosion Control Services - Rock Berm, 20 ga.
4 galvanized wire, 2” to 4” dia. rock. Price per LF
installed. Rock provided by vendor. 2000 |linear foot| $30.00 [$60,000.00 $45.00 $90,000.00 $50.00 $100,000.00
Attribute 1: Rock Berm installed with rock
provided by Collin County (State linear foot price
for rock berm installed with rock provided by
Collin County) 1500 |linear foot $18.00 $27,000.00 $25.00 | $37,500.00 $25.00 $37,500.00
Attribute 2: Materials for item three, not installed
(State cost for materials for item not installed)
1500 |linear foot $17.00 $25,500.00 $35.00 | $52,500.00 $50.00 $75,000.00
Erosion Control Services - Erosion Mat and
5 staples, Straw with double sided netting, include
seasonal seeding. Price per SY installed. square
1000 |yard $0.99 $990.00 $1.50 $1,500.00 $1.68 $1,680.00
Attribute 1: Materials for item five, not installed square
100 |yard $0.40 $40.00 $40.00 $4,000.00 $1.50 $150.00
Erosion Control Services - Erosion Mat and
staples, American Excelsior Curlex, or TxDOT
6 approved equal, with double side netting, include
seasonal seeding. Price per SY installed. square
1000 |yard $1.45 $1,450.00 $1.75 $1,750.00 $2.25 $2,250.00 $2.25 $2,250.00
Attribute 1: Materials for item four, not installed square
100 |yard $0.25 $25.00 $45.00 $4,500.00 $12.50 $125.00
Attribute 3: State brand Western American
Excelsior Excelsior None Stated
Erosion Control Services - Sediment Control Logs,
7 Straw, 9” diameter supported by post every four
(4) feet. Price per LF installed. 1000 |linear foot $2.60 [$2,600.00 $2.00 $2,000.00 $5.00 $5,000.00
Attribute 1: Materials for item seven, not
installed 100 |linear foot $1.30 $130.00 $25.00 $2,500.00 $3.00 $300.00
Erosion Control Services - Sediment Control Logs,
8 Straw, 12” diameter supported by post every four
(4) feet. Price per LF installed. 1000 |linear foot $2.90 [$2,900.00 $2.25 $2,250.00 $10.00 $10,000.00
Attribute 1: State price for materials not installed
100 |linear foot $1.80 $180.00 $18.00 $1,800.00 $5.00 $500.00
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Southwest Erosion

Southwest Erosion

Tommy Rose dba Rose

Tommy Rose dba Rose

Buddy Martin Erosion

Buddy Martin Erosion

Control, Inc. Control, Inc. (Attributes) Contracting Contracting (Attributes) Control, LP Control, LP (Attributes)
Erosion Control Services - Erosion Mat and
staples, 12 oz. Permanent Turf Reinforcement
9 Mats (TRM) with double sided netting, include
seasonal seeding. Price per SY installed. square
1000 |yard $5.20 $5,200.00 $4.50 $4,500.00 $10.00 $10,000.00
Attribute 1: State price for materials, not installed square
100 |yard $4.10 $410.00 $3.25 $315.00 $5.00 $500.00
Erosion Control Services - Sediment Control Logs,
American Excelsior or TxDOT approved equal, 9”
10 .
diameter supported by post every four (4) feet.
Price per LF installed. 1000 |linear foot $2.70 $2,700.00 $2.00 $2,000.00 $5.00 $5,000.00
Attribute 1: State price for materials, not installed
100 |linear foot $1.86 $186.00 $25.00 $2,500.00 $3.00 $300.00
Attribute 2: State brand bid Western
Excelsior Terra Guard None Stated
Erosion Control Services - Sediment Control Logs,
American Excelsior or TxDOT approved equal, 12”
11 .
diameter supported by post every four (4) feet.
Price per LF installed. 1000 |linear foot $3.20 $3,200.00 $2.25 $2,250.00 $10,00 $10,000.00 | $10.00 $10,000.00
Attribute 1: State price for materials not installed
100 |linear foot $2.30 $230.00 $18.00 $1,800.00 $50.00 $5,000.00
Attribute 2: State brand bid Western
Excelsior Terra Guard No response
Organic Erosion Control Services - Erosion Control
12 |Mulch Blankets (100% Mulch), Depth 2" square
unseeded, installed. 1 foot $0.34 $0.34 $1.00 $1.00 No Bid No Bid
Organic Erosion Control Services - Mulch Filter
13 |Berms and Check Dams (100% Mulch), 3 ft. high X square
5 ft. wide unseeded, installed. 1 foot $15.00 $15.00 $20.00 $20.00 No Bid No Bid
Hydromulch Services - 30 Ibs. cellulose paper
mulch, 2 Ibs. hulled Bermuda seed 95/85, 10 Ibs.
homogenized fertilizer 13-13-13.Tackafier (Tac).
Brand and quantity to be determined by vendor.
Tac will be required to hold mixture together.
14  |Pricing should be based on good, level soil.
Watering requirements should not be included in
your pricing as requirements may change with
each job. Must maintain grass until 80%
germination. square
1000 |foot $0.08 $80.00 $0.25 $250.00 No Bid No Bid
Attribute 1: Guarantee Information (Watering Mustwater until'soillis
requirements, if any, must be stated. Warranty damp 1' below surface
should be based on bidder applying water and for minimum of 40 days
water applied by Collin County) to achieve germination
and a stand of grass. Once 80%
Depending on germination
temperatures, the time is achieved,
required to maintain owner is
moisture may be responsible
extended. for watering No Response
Attribute 2: Minimum site visit charges, if any,
per visit $1,700.00 $0.00 No Response
15 |Fiber - 100% Pure Wood Mulch 1 bag No Bid No Bid $15.48 $15.48 No Bid No Bid
Attribute 1: Bag size No response 50 Ibs No response
16  |Fiber - Wood with Tac 1 bag No Bid No Bid $15.33 $15.33 No Bid No Bid
Attribute 1: Bag size No response 50 Ibs No Response
17  |Fiber - Hydro blanket 1 bag No Bid No Bid $15.00 $15.00 No Bid No Bid
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Southwest Erosion

Southwest Erosion

Tommy Rose dba Rose

Tommy Rose dba Rose

Buddy Martin Erosion

Buddy Martin Erosion

Control, Inc. Control, Inc. (Attributes) Contracting Contracting (Attributes) Control, LP Control, LP (Attributes)
Attribute 1: Bag size No response 50 Ibs No Response
18 |Fiber - Wood cellulose fiber bag No Bid No Bid $15.00 $15.00 No Bid No Bid
Attribute 1: Bag size No response 50 Ibs No Response
19 [Fiber - Guar tacking agent bag No Bid No Bid $55.00 $55.00 No Bid No Bid
Attribute 1: Bag size No response 50 Ibs No Response
20 |[Seed - Hulled Bermuda bag $364.00 $364.00 $325.00 $325.00 No Bid No Bid
Attribute 1: Bag size 50 Ibs No Response
21 |[Seed - Unhulled Bermuda bag $243.00 $243.00 $270.00 $270.00 No Bid No Bid
Attribute 1: Bag size No response 50 Ibs No Response
22 |[Seed - Winter wheat bag $21.00 $21.00 $11.00 $11.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Attribute 1: Bag size 50 lbs. 50 Ibs No Response
2 Topsoil, delivered
cubicyard| No Bid No Bid $45.00 $45.00 No Bid No Bid
Attribute 1: Minimum quantity per delivery No response 10 CY No Response
24 Topsoil, picked-up
cubicyard| No Bid No Bid $35.00 $35.00 No Bid No Bid
Attribute 1: Minimum quantity per pick up No response 10CY No Response
Sod, Rolled: Use rolled sod free from noxious
weeds, Johnson grass, other grasses, or any
25 ) .
matter deleterious to the growth and subsistence square
of the sod. yard $3.20 $3.20 $6.00 $6.00 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL OF ALL SERVICES (Line items #1-#14)
$114,135.34 $132,521.00 $176,430.00

Not awarding items 15-25
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