
Item # Description Wright Asphalt Cost Western Emulsions Cost

1 CRS-2TR - delivered $1.6074/ gal No Bid
Att. 1. Min. gals for delivery 5378 gals No Bid
Att. 2. Price for CC Pickup $1.40/gal No bid
Att. 3.Plant Location Brownwood, TX No Bid
Att. 4. Distance from Stockpile 202 No Bid

2 AE-P - delivered No bid $1.95/gal
Att. 1. Min. gals for delivery No bid 5200 gals
Att. 2. Price for CC Pickup No bid $1.78/gal
Att. 3.Plant Location No bid Temple, TX
Att. 4. Distance from Stockpile No bid 147 miles

3 CRS-2 - delivered $1.3574/gal $1.32/gal
Att. 1. Min. gals for delivery 5378 gals 5200 gals
Att. 2. Price for CC Pickup $1.15/gal $1.15/gal
Att. 3.Plant Location Brownwood, TX Temple, TX
Att. 4. Distance from Stockpile 202 miles 147 miles

4 CRS-2H - delivered $1.3574/gal $1.32/gal
Att. 1. Min. gals for delivery 5378 gals 5200 gals
Att. 2. Price for CC Pickup $1.15/gal $1.15/gal
Att. 3.Plant Location Brownwood, TX Temple TX
Att. 4. Distance from Stockpile 202 miles 147 miles

5 CRS-1P - delivered No Bid $1.59/gal
Att. 1. Min. gals for delivery No Bid 5100 gals
Att. 2. Price for CC Pickup No Bid $1.42/gal
Att. 3.Plant Location No Bid Temple, TX
Att. 4. Distance from Stockpile No Bid 147 miles

6 CRS-2P - delivered $1.71 $1.76/gal
Att. 1. Min. gals for delivery 5378 gals 5200 gals
Att. 2. Price for CC Pickup $1.42/gal $1.59/gal
Att. 3.Plant Location Brownwood, TX Temple, TX
Att. 4. Distance from Stockpile 202 miles 147 miles

7 CRS-2H+ - delivered No Bid $1.76/gal
Att. 1. Min. gals for delivery No Bid 5200 gals.
Att. 2. Price for CC Pickup No Bid $1.59/gal
Att. 3.Plant Location No Bid Temple, TX
Att. 4. Distance from Stockpile No Bid 147 miles
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8 SS-1H - delivered No Bid $1.47/gal
Att. 1. Min. gals for delivery No Bid 5200 gals.
Att. 2. Price for CC Pickup No Bid $1.30/gal
Att. 3.Plant Location No Bid Temple, TX
Att. 4. Distance from Stockpile No Bid 147 miles

9 CSS-1H delivered $1.4574/gal $1,58.gal
Alt. 1. Min gals for delivery 5378 gals 5200 gals
Alt. 2. Price for CC Pickup $1.25/gal $1.42/gal
Alt. 3. Plant Location Brownwood, TX Temple, TX
Alt. 4. Distance from Stockpile 202 miles 147 miles

10 CSS-1S delivered Dust Control No Bid $1.59/gal

11 CSS-1S - Plant Site No Bid No Bid

12
Cold Recycling/Asphalt Millings, Plant, 
Short Term No Bid No Bid

13
Cold Recycling/Asphalt Millings, Plant, 
Long Term No Bid No Bid

14
Cold Recycling/Asphalt Millings, 
Intermediate No Bid No Bid

15 Demurrage/Hr. $100.00/hr $65.00/hr after 2nd hour 



NOTES:

Additional:  loads 
cancelled in transit by 

customer billed at 
cost; returned loads if 

requested by customer 
billed an additional 
one-half outgoing 

freight rate; diluted 
loads cannot be 

returned; pump charge 
if requested by 

customer will be 
$100/per load - not 

provided for hot 
products; layover 

charge if requested by 
customer billed at 
$450 per truck per 

night

Additional:  $65.00 
pump/hose charge per 

load; return freight is 1/2 
of outgoing tariff; freight 
is based on full load even 

if full load is not 
ordered; layovers 

$450.00 per night - 


